TOWN OF WINTER PARK

ORDINANCE NO. 468
SERIES OF 2013

AN ORDINANCE UPDATING THE TOWN OF WINTER PARKS BUILDING CODES BY AMENDING TITLE 6,
CHAPTER 1, SECTIONS 1-2 AND TITLE 2, CHAPTER 4 OF THE WINTER PARK TOWN CODE

WHEREAS, to stay current with new buitding construction technology and national and state safety
standards, the 2009 International Family of Codes will be the new standard; and

WHEREAS, adopting the 2009 International Family of Codes will add to the health and safety of the
towrs citizens and guests; and

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF WINTER PARK,
COLORADO THAT:

l. TOWN CODE 6-1-1 : BULLDING CODES ADOPTED be amended by adopting the following codes
by reference

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, 2009 EDITION

INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, 2008 EDITION

INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, 2008 EDITION

INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, 2009 EDITICN

INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE, 2009 EDITION

INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE, 2006 EDITION
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE INCLUDING ALL APPENDICES, 2009 EDITION
2011 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, EDITION

All International Codes are published by the International Code Council, 500 New Jersey Avenue, NW,
6th Floor, Washington, DC 20001 (Headquarters).

The Nationa! Electrical Code is published by the National Fire Protection Association, 1 Batterymarch
Park, Quincy, MA 02268.

All codes adopted by reference herein and all amendments to said codes are available for inspection at
the office of the Town Clerk of Winter Park during normal business hours.

I.  TOWN CODE Sections 2-4 be repealed in its entirety

il. TOWN CODE Sections 6-1-2 thru 6-1-9 be repealed in their entirety and new sections to be
adopted as foliows



1. TOWN CODE 6-1-2: BUILDING CODE AMENDMENTS: The following sections of the
international Building Code, adopted by reference in TOWN CODE 6-1-1 hereof, is hereby
amended as follows

Preface to amendments

Werds stricken in this fashion indicate code tanguage that has been removed from the published
codes. Bold, capitalized WORDS indicate language added to the published codes,

Bold, Capitalized and lower case = Code Section or Table Titles

Normal, Capitalized and lower case = Existing Code language

Steikethrough = Language deleted from the Code.
BOLD, ALL CAPITALIZED = Language added tc Code

AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

TOWN CODE 6-1-2: Code Amendments: The following sections of the International Building Cede,
adopted by reference in Town Code Section 6-1-1 hereof, is hereby amended as follows:

Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shail be known as the Building Code of THE TOWN OF WINTER
PARK, herein after referred to as“This Code”

Section 101.4.3 is amended to read as follow:

101.4.3 Plumbing. The provisions of the International Plumbing Code shall apply to the
installation, afterations, repairs and replacement of plumbing systems, including equipment,
appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances, and where connected to a water system or

sewage system and all aspects of a medical gas system. Fheprovisionsofthe-international

by - a¥aa
s ’

eccupants-and-occupancy-ofexisting-premises-and-structures. THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section 102.6 is amended to read as follows:



102.6 Existing structures. The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of adoption
of This Code shall be permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in

This Code, the-intermationai-Property-Meaintenance-Code-or the International Fire Code, or as is

deemed necessary by the building official for the general safety and welfare of the occupants
and the pubiic.

Section R103.2 is amended to read as follows:

R103.2 Appeintment-BUILDING OFFICIAL. The building official-shali-be-appeinted-by the chief

appointingauthority-of- thejurisdiction. 1S HEREBY AUTHORIZED AND DIRECTED TO ENFORCE
ALL THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE; HOWEVER, A GUARANTY THAT ALL BUILDING AND

STRUCTUREs HAVE BEEN CONSTRUCTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH ALL THE PROVISIONS OF THIS
CODE IS NEITHER INTENDED NOR IMPLIED.

Section 103.3 is amended to read as follows:

103.3 Deputies. In accordance with the prescribed procedures of this jurisdiction and-with the

eeheurrence-of-the-appeinting-authority. the building official shall have the authority to appoint

a deputy building official, the related technical officers, inspectors, plan examiners and other
employees Such employees shati have powers as deiegated by the bwldmg ofﬁc.ra! fForthe

Section 104.1 is amended to read as follows:

104.1 General. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS HEREBY AUTHORIZED AND DIRECTED TO ENFORCE
ALL OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE; HOWEVER, A GUARANTEE THAT ALL BUILDINGS AND
STRUCTURES HAVE BEEN CONSTRUCTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH ALL OF THE PROVISIONS CF
THIS CODE IS NEITHER INTENDED NOR IMPLIED. The building official is hereby authorized and
directed to enforce the provisions of This Code. The building official shall have the authority to
render interpretations of This Code and to adopt policies and procedures in order to clarify the
application of its provisions. Such interpretations, policies and procedures shall be in
compliance with the intent and purpose of This Code. Such policies and procedures shall not
have the effect of waiving requirements specifically provided for in This Code.

Section 104.8 is amended to read as follows:

104.8 Liability. THE ADOPTION OF THIS CODE, AND ANY PREVIOUS BUILDING CODES
ADOPTED BY THE TOWN OF WINTER PARK, SHALL NOT BE DEEMED TO GIVE RISE TO A DUTY
OF CARE ON THE PART OF ANY PUBLIC ENTITY, PUBLIC EMPLOYEE OR AGENT, NOR SHALL THIS



CODE OR ANY PREVIOUS BUILDING CODES BE DEEMED TO CREATE ANY CIVIL REMEDY
AGAINST A PUBLIC ENTITY, PUBLIC EMPLOYEE OR AGENT. The building official, member of
board of appeals or employee charged with enforcement of the code, while acting for the
jurisdiction in good faith and without malice in the discharge of the duties required by This Code
or other pertinent law or ordinance, shall not thereby be rendered liable personally and is
hereby relieved from personal liability for any damages accruing to persons or property as a
result of any act or by reason of an act or omission in the discharge of official duties. Any suit
instituted against an officer or employee because of an act performed by that officer or
employee in the lawful discharge of duties under the provisions of This Code shall be defended
by legal representative of the jurisdiction until the final termination of the proceedings. The
building official or any subordinate shall not be liable for cost in any action, suit or proceeding
that is instituted in pursuance of the provisions of This Code.

Sections 105.1.1 and 105.1.2 are hereby repealed in their entirety.

oy a dan N Iy fa 0
e = HHE

owned-or-operated-by-theapplicantforthe permit— THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.,

desighated:- THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.
Section 105.2 is amended to read as follows:

105.2 Work exempt from permit. Exemptions from permit requirements of This Code shall not
be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the
provisions of This Code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction. Permits shall not be
required for the following:

Building:

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses
and similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet (11 m?).

. Fences not over 6 feet (1829 mm) high.

3. Oil derricks.

4. Retaining walls which are not over 4 feet {1219 mm) in height measured from the
bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or
impounding Class |, Il or HIA liquids.



Section

Section

Section

5. Water tanks supported directly on grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000 gallons
{18 925 L} and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2:1.

6. dews sra-drivewsvs-aet-more-than20-inche 62 mm)-above adiacentgrade;
notoverany-basementorstor-below PLATFORMS, WALKS AND DRIVEWAYS AT
GRADE and are not part of an accessible route.

7. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish work.

3. Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery.

9, Prefabricated swimming pools accessory 1o a Group R-3 occupancy, which are less than
24 inches {610 mm) deep, do not exceed 5,000 gallons (18925 L) and are installed
entirely above ground.

10, Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricuitural purposes, not including
service systems,

11. Swings and other playground equipment accessory to one- and two-family dwellings.

12. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall that do not project more than 54 inches

{1372 mm) from the exterior wall and do not require additional support of Groups R-3
and U occupancies.

13, Nonfixed and movabile fixtures, cases, racks, counters and partitions not over S feet, 9
inches (1753 mm) in height.

105.5 is amended to read as follows:

105.5 Expiration. EVERY PERMIT iSSUED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL UNDER THE PROVISION
OF THIS CODE SHALL EXPIRE 24 MONTHS AFTER THE DATE OF ISSUE. Every permit issued shall
become invalid unless the work on the site authorized by such permit is commenced within 180
days after its issuance, or if the work authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or
abandoned for a period of 180 days after the time the work is commenced. The building official
is authorized to grant, in writing, one ermeore extensions of time, for A periods OF not more
than 180 days each. The extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause
demonstrated.

107.1is amended by adding new subsections to read as follows:

107.2.1.1 PROOF OF WATER AND SEWER. THE APPLICANT SHALL PROVIDE DOCUMENTATION
FROM THE WATER AND SANITATION DISTRICT OF AN APPROVED WATER AND SEWER UTILITY
PLAN WHICH MAY INCLUDE PAYING THE REQUIRED WATER AND SEWER TAP FEES.

107.2.1.2 EMERGENCY SERVICES IMPACT FEE. A DEVELOPER REQUESTING APPROVAL OF A
DEVELOPMENT ACTIVITY REQUIRING ADDITIONAL EMERGENCY SERVICES SHALL PAY THE
IMPACT FEE TO THE EMERGENCY SERVICES PROVIDER PRIOR TO ANY ISSUANCE OF A
BUILDING PERMIT BY THE TOWN. {TOWN ORDINANCE NO. 353, SERIES OF 2005)

107.3 is amended by adding two new subsections to read as follows:



107.3.1.1 REQUIRED APPROVALS. THE APPLICATION AND DOCUMENTS FOR PERMIT SHALL BE
REVIEWED AND APPROVED BY THE DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING AND THE DEPARTMENT
OF PLANNING AND ZONING FOR COMPLIANCE WITH TOWN ORDINANCES.

107.3.1.2 SURVEY REQUIREMENTS. AN IMPROVEMENT LOCATION CERTIFICATE (ILC) SHALL BE
REQUIRED FOR ALL NEW FOUNDATIONS WITHIN THE TOWN OF WINTER PARK. IF A VARIANCE
HAS BEEN GRANTED FOR THE PROPERTY THAT ALLOWS FOR CONSTRUCTION OF A
FOUNDATION WITHIN THE ESTABLISHED SETBACKS OR IF A FOUNDATION IS LOCATED WITHIN
FIVE FEET (5’) OF THE PROPERTY LINE, AN IMPROVEMENT SURVEY PLAT (ISP) SHALL BE
REQUIRED. THE ILC/ISP SHALL BE SUBMITTED TO THE TOWN OF WINTER PARK FOR REVIEW
AND APPROVAL PRIOR TO A ROUGH FRAMING INSPECTION BY THE TOWN.

Section 107.3.3 is amended to read as follows:

107.3.3 Phased approval. The building official SHALL NOT ISSUE A PERMIT UNTIL THE
CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS FOR THE WHOLE BUILDING OR STRUCTURE HAVE BEEN
SUBMITTED AND APPROVED. i i i

a aalals

Section 107.3.4 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

107.3.4.3 ERRORS AND OMISSIONS INSURANCE. WHERE THE CONSTRUCTION VALUE IS MORE
THAN $500,000 THE REGISTERED ARCHITECTS AND ENGINEERS SHALL CARRY AND PROVIDE
DOCUMENTATION THAT A MINIMUM OF $500,000 OF ERRORS AND OMISSIONS INSURANCE IS
IN PLACE AND THAT THE OWNER OF THE STRUCTURE UPON WHICH THE
ARCHITECT/ENGINEER IS WORKING IS A NAMED BENEFICIARY OF SUCH POLICY. (TOWN
ORDINANCE NO. 321, SERIES OF 2002)

Section 108.3 is amended by deleting in its entirety.




Section 109.2 is amended to read as follows:

109.2 Schedule of permit fees. On buildings, structures, electrical, gas, mechanical, and
plumbing systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be pald as

reguired in accordance with th
TITLE 1 CHAPTER 11 OF THE TOWN CODE OF WINTER PARK, TABLE 1-11- 2A

CHAPTER 11, SECTIONS 1-11-2, (D) AND TABLE 1-11-2C IS AMENDED BY DELETING IN TS ENTIRETY.
Section 109.5 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

109.5.1 AFFORDABLE HOUSING REQUIREMENTS. THE TOWN SHALL COLLECT THE SUM OF
THREE DOLLARS ($3.00) FOR EVERY GROSS SQUARE FOOT OF NEW CONSTRUCTION. (TITLE 6,
CHAPTER 5, ORDINANCE 333 SERIES OF 2003)

EXCEPTION: PARKING GARAGES AND UNENCLOSED DECKS/PATIOS.
Section 109 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

109.7 REINSPECTIONS. A REINSPECTION FEE, AMOUNT PER TITLE 1 CHAPTER 11 TABLE 2B OF
THE TOWN CODE, MAY BE ASSESSED FOR EACH INSPECTION OR REINSPECTION WHEN SUCH
PORTION OF WORK FOR WHICH INSPECTION 1S CALLED S NOT COMPLETE OR WHEN
CORRECTIONS CALLED FOR ARE NOT MADE. REINSPECTION FEES MAY BE ASSESSED WHEN
THE INSPECTION RECORD CARD 1S NOT POSTED OR OTHERWISE AVANLABLE ON THE WORK
SITE, THE APPROVED PLANS ARE NOT READILY AVAILABLE TO THE INSPECTOR, FOR FAILING
TO PROVIDE ACCESS ON THE DATE FOR WHICH THE INSPECTION IS REQUESTED, OR
DEVIATING FROM THE APPROVED PLANS. IN INSTANCES WHERE REINSPECTION FEES HAVE
BEEN ASSESSED, NO ADDITIONAL INSPECTION OF THE WORK WILL BE PERFORMED UNTIL THE
REINSPECTION FEES HAVE BEEN RECEIVED BY THE BUILDING DEPARTMENT.

Section 110 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

110.1.1 FINAL INSPECTION. NO FINAL INSPECTION SHALL BE PERFORMED AND NO
CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY SHALL BE ISSUED UNLESS A SALES TAX AUDIT HAS EITHER BEEN
COMPLETED BY THE SALES TAX ADMINISTRATOR AND ALL SALES TAXES DUE HAVE BEEN PAID
OR ARRANGEMENTS HAVE BEEN MADE WITH THE SALES TAX ADMINISTRATOR FOR SUCH
AUDIT, OR THE TOWN MANAGER HAS SPECIFICALLY WAIVED SUCH AUDIT. (TOWN
ORDINANCE NQ. 225, SERIES OF 1994, SECTION 3-2-18 (B3))

Section 110.5 is amended to read as follows:




Section

Section

' ) AP W Vel o noinan O-ra rlo o) a) e

reguired-byThis-Gede. IT SHALL BE THE DUTY OF THE PERSON DOING THE WORK, THE
OWNER, CONTRACTOR, OR SUBCONTRACTOR TO KNOW THAT THE BUILDING OR STRUCTURE
HAS A VALID PERMIT AND TO NOTIFY THE BUILDING DEPARTMENT WHEN WORK IS READY
FOR INSPECTION.

) )

UPON CONVICTION, A FINE WILL BE ASSESSED TO THE PERSON DOING THE WORK, THE
OWNER, CONTRACTOR, OR SUBCONTRACTOR F WORK IS BEING DONE WITHOUT A PERMIT
AND THE INSPECTION 18 NOT REQUESTED PER SECTION 110.

IT SHALL BE THE DUTY OF THE PERSON DOING THE WORK, THE OWNER, CONTRACTOR, OR
SUBCONTRACTOR REQUESTING ANY INSPECTIONS REQUIRED BY THIS CODE TO PROVIDE
ACCESS AND MEANS FOR INSPECTION OF SUCH WORK.

ALL INSPECTIONS REQUESTED PRIOR TO 10:00 A.M. WILL BE PERFORMED THE SAME
WORKING DAY, SUCH REQUEST FOR INSPECTION MAY BE !N WRITING OR BY CALLING; THE 24
HOUR AUTOMATED TELEPHONE ANSWERING SYSTEM,

111.1 is amended to read as follows:

111.1 Use and Occupancy. No building or structure shall be used or occupied, and no change in
the existing occupancy classification of a building or structure or portion thereof shall be made,
until the building official has issued a certificate of occupancy therefor as provided herein.
Issuance of a certificate of occupancy shall not be construed as an approval of a viclation of the
provisions of This Code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction.

Exception:

1. Certificates of occupancy are not required for work exempt from permits under Section
105.2.

2. GROUP U OCCUPANCY

113 is repealed in its entirety and reenacted to read as follows:
133 COMNSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF APPEALS

112.1 BOARD ESTABLISHEDR. PURSUANT TO SECTION 113, CHAPTER &, 2009 INTERNATIOMAL
BULLHNG CODE AND SECTION 108 OF INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, THERE 15 HERERY CREATED
BY THE TINWVN COUNOIL AND EAST GRAND FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT NG 4 A
COMSTRUCTHION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF APFEALS, WHICH BOARD SHALL BE COMPOSED OF
FIVE (5} MEMBERS WHO SHALL DETERMINE THE SUITABILITY OF ALTERNATE MATERIALS AND
METHODS OF CONSTRUCTION, AND TO PROVIDE FOR REASONABLE INTERPRETATION OF THE
LO00 INTERNATIONAL BLRLDING CODE, 2009 INTERNATIONAL HEE COBE, 2009



INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, 2009 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE, AND UNIFORM
CODE FOR THE ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BLHLDINGS.

113.2 MEMBERSMHIP AND TERMS,

A,

THE CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF APPEALS SHALL CONSIST OF FIVE {5)
MEMBERS, THREE (3] OF WHICH ARE QUALIFIED BY EXPERIENCE AND TRAINING TO
PASS UPON MATTERS PERTAIMING TO BUILDING CONSTRUCTION, THE BUILDING
CRFICIAL OR FIRE CODE OFFICIAL WHEN PERTAINING TO FIRE CODE IBEUES SHALL BE
AN EX OFFICIO MEMBER AND SHALL ACT AS SECRETARY OF THE BOARD. THE BOARD
SHALL BE APPOINTED AND THEIR TERMS OF OFFICE SET BY THE TOWN COUNCH FOR
CONSTRUCTION BOARD AND THE FIRE DISTRICT BOARD FOR FIRE CODE BOARD,
WHICH TERMS SHALL BE OF SUCH LENGTH AND S0 ARRANGED THAT THE TERMS OF
AT LEAST OME MEMBER WILL EXPIRE EACH YEAR,

ANY MEMBER OF THE BOARD MAY BE REMOVED, AFTER PUBLIC HEARING, BY THE
BAYOR FOR INEFRICIENCY, NEGLECT OF DUTY, OF MALFEASANCE IN OFFICE. THE
BAYOR SHALL FILE A WRITTEN STATEMENT OF REASONS FOR SUCH REMOVAL,
VACANCIES OCCURRING OTHERWISE AND THROUGH THE EXPIRATION OF TERM SHALL
BE FILLED FOR THE REMAINDER OF THE UNEXPIRED TERM,

1133 ORGANIZATION AND PROCEDURES. THE CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF

APPEALS SHALL ELECT ITS CHAIRMAN FROM AMONG THE MEMBERS APPOINTED BY
THE TOWN COUNCH, AND APPROVED BY THE FIRE DISTRICT BOARD, AND CREATE
AND FHL SUCH OTHER OF 1Y OFFICES AS 1T MAY DETERMINE., THE TERM OF THE
CHAIRMAN SHALL BE ONE YEAR WITH ELIGIBILITY FOR REELECTION. THE BOARD WHL
HOLD MEETINGS WHEN CALLED BY THE CHAIRMAN OR BUILDING/FIRE CODE
OFFICIAL, THE CONSTREUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF APPEALS SHALL TRANSACT
BUSINESS ACCORDING TO THE RULES AND REGULATIONS ADOPTED HEREIN, AND
SHALL MAKE FINDINGS AND DETERMINATIONS ON EACH CASE CONSIDERED, SUCH
FINDINGS AND DETERMINATIONS SHALL BECOME A PUBLIC RECORD AND SHALL BE
REPT IN THE OFFICE OF THE TOWN CLERK OR THE FIRE DISTRICT ADMINISTRATOR;
RESPECTIVELY,

113.4 RULES AND REGULATIONS.

THE FOLLOWING RULES AND REGULATIONS ARE ADGPTED FOR PURPOSES OF
TRANSACTING THE BUSINESS OF THE CONBTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF
APPEALS:

THE CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF APPEALS SHALL MEET AT THE CALL OF
THE CHAIRMAN OR WHEN REQUESTED BY THE BUILDING OR FIRE CODE OFFICIAL,

A CHAIRBAN OF THE CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODRE BOARD OF APPEALS SHALL BE
ELECTED BY & MAJORITY OF THE ENTIRE REGULAR MEMBERSHIP AT THE FIRET



MEETING OF EACH CALENDAR YEAR, TO SERVE FOR A TERM OF ONE YEAR. A VICE
CHAIRMAN SHALL BE ELECTED IN THE SAME MANNER AT THE SAME TIME FOR A TERM
OF ONE YEAR.

THE CHAIRMAN OF THE CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF APPEALS SHALL
PRESIDE AT ALL MEETINGS, SHALL CONDUCT ALL HEARINGS, AND EXERCISE AND
PERFORM SUCH OTHER POWERS AND DUTIES AS MAY BE FROM TIME TO TIME
ASSIGNED TO HIM BY THE CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF APPEALS, OR
PRESCRIBED BY THE RULES AND REGULATIONS HEREIN. IN PRESIDING AT MEETINGS
AND HEARINGS, THE CHAIRIVIAN SHALL RULE ON PROCEDURE AND ON ORDER OF
PRESENTATION,

THE CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF APPEALS SHALL BE THE JUDGE OF THE
QUALIFICATIONS OF PERSONS APPEARING AS EXPERT WITNESSES, AND SHALL BE
EMPOWERED TO REFUSE TO RECEIVE THE TESTIMONY OF ANY PURPORTED EXPERT
NOT 50 QUALIFIED,

IN THE ABSENCE OR THE DISABILITY OF THE CHAIRMAN, THE VICE CHAIRMAN SHALL
PERFORM ALL THE DUTIES OF THE CHAIRMARN, AND WHEN SO ACTING, SHALL HAVE
ALL THE POWERS OF, AND BE SUBIECT TO ALL RESTRICTIONS UPON THE CHAIRMAN.
IN THE ABSENCE OF BOTH THE CHAIRMAN AND THE VICE CHAIRMAN, A CHAIRMAN
PRO TEMPORE SHALL BE ELECTED, AMONG THOSE REGULAR MEMBERS PRESENT, BY A
MAJORITY VOTE OF ALL THE MEMBERS PRESENT.

SHOULD ANY MEMBER HAVE KNOWLEDGE OF ANY FACT WHICH MAY CONSTITUTE A
CONFLICT OF INTEREST IN HIS CONSIDERATION OF ANY APPEAL, HE SHALL
FORTHWITH NOTIFY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL OR THE FIRE CODE OFFICIAL OF SAID
FACTS.

THE SECRETARY SHALL KEEP, OR CAUSE T BE KEPT, MINUTES OF THE PROCEEDINGS
OF THE CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF APPEALS, AND SHALL PREPARE AN
AGENDA FOR EACH MEETING, WHICH SHALL BE FURNISHED TO MEMBERS PRIOR TO
THE ACTUAL HOUR OF THE MEETING. THE SECRETARY SHALL, IN ADDITION, BE
CUSTODIAN OF THE RECORDS OF THE CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF
APPEALS AND SHALL, UPON THE FILING OF AN APPEAL, FURNISH EACH REGULAR
MEMBER WITH A COPY OF THE LEYTER OF ARPPEAL. (ORD. 140, SERIES OF 1986)
APPEALS FROM DECISIONS OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL OR APPLICABLE ENFORCEMENT
OFFICER SHALL BE IN WRITING, SHALL BE DIRECTED TO A SPECIFIC DECISION OF THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL OR APPLICABLE ENFORCEMENT OFFICER, AND CONSIDERATION OF
SAID APPEAL BY THE CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF APPEALS SHALL BE
LIMITED TO SAID SPECIFIC DECISION. (ORD. 140, SERIES 1986)

APPEALS WILL BE HEARD AT SPECIAL MEETINGS CALLED PURSUANT TO THE PRESIDING
CEFICER OR BY A MAJORITY OF THE MEMBERSHIP OF THE CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE
CODE BOARD OF APPEALS. REQUESTS FOR HEARINGS MUST BE SCHEDULED AT LEAST
TEN {10} DAYS PRIOR TO SUCH HEARING,

IF A PARTY OF AN APPEAL INTENDS TO SUBMIT EVIDENCE, OR A LEGAL ARGUMENT,
QUTSIDE OF THE EXPERTISE OF THE CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF
APPEALS, SAID PARTY SHALL SO INFORM THE SECRETARY OF THE CONSTRUCTION AND



FIRE CODE BOARD OF APPEALS IN WRITING AT THE TIME OF THE FILING OF THE
APPEAL, FARURE TO PROVIDE SUCH INFORMATION SHALL BE CAUSE FOR THE
PROMIBITION OF THE PRESENTATION OF SUCH EVIDENCE OR ARGUMENT,

L. THE DECISION OF THE CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF APPEALS ON AN
APPEAL SHALL BE FINAL,

M. A DECIBICN SHALL REGUIRE A MAJORITY VOTE OF THOSE MEMBERS OF THE
CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF APPEALS PRESENT, PROVIDED, HOWEVER,
THAT THERE MUST BE A QUORUM OF AT LEAST THREF (3] MEMBERS OF SAID
COMBTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF APPEALS PRIOR TO TRANSACTING ANY
BUSINESS,

A NOTICE OF APPEAL SHALL BE ACCOMPANIED BY A FEE OF 8250.00.

Section 202 is amended by adding the following definitions within the alphabetical order of the existing

definitions:

BEDROOM. IS A ROOM WHICH IS DESIGNED AS A SLEEPING ROOM, A LOFT, A MEZZANINE IN
GROUP R OCCUPANCIES OR A ROOM OR AREA THAT CAN BE USED AS A SLEEPING ROOM AND

CONTAINS A CLOSET.

BUILDING HEIGHT. THE VERTICAL DISTANCE ABOVE A REFERENCE DATUM MEASURED TO THE
HIGHEST POINT OF A FEAT ROOF OR DECK LINE OF A MANSARD ROOF OR THE MIDPOQINT OF
THE HIGHEST GABLE OF A PITCHED OR HIPPED ROOF. THE REFERENCE DATUM SHALL BE
SELECTED BY THE FOLLOWING, WHICHEVER YIELDS A GREATER HEIGHT OF A BUILDING:

THE POINT OF THE LOWEST PRECGNSTRUCTION ELEVATION ON ANY BUILDING FACE.
THE POINT OF THE LOWEST ELEVATION OF ANY BUILDING FACE.

THE ELEVATION OF THE LOWEST POINT OF ANY EXPOSED FOUNDATION OR WALL.

IF A SITE iS DISTURBED AFTER THE ADOPTICN OF THIS SECTION, THE OWNER OF THE
PROPERTY WILL HAVE THE BURDEN OF PROVIDING PRECONSTRUCTION ELEVATION.

PWNN

THE HEIGHT OF A STEPPED OR TERRACED BUILDING 1S THE MAXIMUM HEIGHT OF ANY
SEGMENT OF THE BUILDING USING BUILDING HEIGHT,

FIRE DEPARTMENT. THE CHIEF OFFICER OF EAST GRAND, GRANBY, GRAND LAKE, HOT
SULPHUR SPRINGS AND KREMMLING FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICTS, OR THE CHIEF OFFICER’S
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE.

KiTCHEN. 1S A ROOM OR AREA THAT IS BESIGNATED TO BE USED FOR THE PREPARATION OF
FOOD WHICH CONTAINS MORE THAN ONE STANDARD SIZE KITCHEN APPLIANCE OR FIXTURE.

UNUSEABLE CRAWLSPACES. IS THE AREA UNDER THE FIRST STORY FLOOR SYSTEM WHICH
HAS LESS THAN FIVE FEET (5') OF HEAD ROOM AND AN UNFINISHED FLOOR.



Section 311.2 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

311.2.1 GROUP 5-1, MINI STORAGE. BUILDINGS USED FCR MINi STORAGE SHALL BE
COMPARTMENTALIZED BY NOT LESS THAN ONE HOUR FIRE RESISTIVE CONSTRUCTION AT
EACH FLOOR/CEILING AND AT EACH ONE THOUSAND (1,000) SQUARE FEET OF FLOOR AREA.

Section 717.2.5 is amended to read as follows:

717.2.5 Ceiling and floor openings. Where required by Exception 6 of Section 708.2, Exception
1 of Section 713.4.1.2, or Section 713.4.2, fireblocking of the annular space around vents, pipes,
ducts, ehimneys and fireplaces at ceilings and floor levels shall be installed with a material
specifically tested in the form and manner intended for use to demonstrate its ability to remain
in place and resist the free passage of flame and the products of combustion.

Section 717.2.5.1 is amended to read as follows:

717.2.5.1 Factory built chimneys and fireplaces, Facterybuiltchimneysand fireplaces shail be
fireblocked in accordance with UL 103 and UL 127,

FACTORY-BUILT CHIMNEYS SHALL BE ENCLOSED WITHIN A CONTINUQUS ENCLOSURE
PROTECTED ON THE INTERIOR (CHIMNEY) SIDE BY NOT LESS THAN 5/8 INCH TYPE-X GYPSUM
WALLBOARD. JOINTS AND FASTENERS SHALL BE TAPED AND FINISHED,

EXCEPTION: THE PORTION OF THE CHIMNEY LOCATED IN THE SAME ROOM AS THE
APPLIANCE AND THE PORTION OF THE CHIMNEY ABOVE THE FINISHED ROOF IS NOT
REQUIRED TO BE ENCLOSED.

FACTORY-BUILT CHIMNEYS SHALL BE EFFECTIVELY FIREBLOCKED WITHIN SUCH ENCLOSURE AT
EACH FLOOR- CEILING LEVEL AND AT THE RGOF. THE VERTICAL DISTANCE BETWEEN
ADJACENT FIREBLOCKING SHALL NOT EXCEED 10 FEET,

Section 901.5 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as folows:

901.5.1 Special inspector required. ALL FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS REQUIRED BY THIS CODE
SHALL BE INSPECTED AND APPROVED BY A SPECIAL INSPECTOR. THE SPECIAL INSPECTOR
SHALL BE AN AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE OF THE FIRE DEPARTMENT OR ANOTHER
QUALIFIED INDIVIDUAL WITH PRIOR APPROVAL OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL. APPROVALS OF
SPECIAL INSPECTORS AND INSPECTICNS, APPROVALS AND REPORTS BY SPECIAL INSPECTORS
SHALL BE IN ACCORDPANCE WITH CHAPTER 17 OF THIS CODE.

Section 901.6 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:



901.6.4 KEY BOX. WHERE A SUPERVISORY STATION IS REQUIRED BY THIS SECTION AND
WHERE ACCESS TO OR WITHIN A STRUCTURE OR AREA {5 RESTRICTED BECAUSE OF SECURED
OPENINGS OR WHERE IMMEDIATE ACCESS 15 NECESSARY FOR LIFE-SAVING OR FIRE-FIGHTING
PURPOSES AS DETERMINED BY THE FIRE CHIEF, AN APPROVED RAPID ENTRY KEY 1.OCK BOX
SHALL BE INSTALLED.

901.6.4.1 DEVICES. KEY LOCK BOXES SHALL BE UNDERWRITERS LABORATORIES CERTIFIED
AND APPROVED BY THE FIRE CHIEF.

901.6.4.2 LOCATION. THE KEY LOCK BOX SHALL BE LOCATED AT OR NEAR THE MAIN
ENTRANCE TO THE BUILDING, MOUNTED AT A HEIGHT OF SIX FEET {6') ABOVE FINAL GRADE
AT A LOCATION APPROVED BY THE FIRE CHIEF.

901.6.4.3 KEY BOX CONTENTS. THE KEY BOX SHALL CONTAIN LABELED KEYS TO PROVIDE
ACCESS INTC THE BUILDING.

Section 902.1 is amended by adding the following definition within the alphabetical order of the existing
definitions.

[F]1 FIRE DEPARTMENT. THE CHIEF OFFICER OF EAST GRAND, GRANBY, GRAND FIRE
PROTECTION DISTRICT, GRAND LAKE, HOT SULPHUR SPRINGS AND KREMIMLING FIRE
PROTECTION DISTRICTS, OR THE CHIEF OFFICER’S AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE.

Section 1009 is amended to read as follows:

1009.4.5 Profile. The radius of curvature at the leading edge of the tread shall be not greater
than 9/16 inch (14.3 mm). Beveling of nosings shall not exceed 9/16 inch {14.3 mm). Risers
shall be selid-and vertical or sloped under the tread above from the underside of the nosing
above at an angle not more than 30 degrees (0.52 rad) from the vertical. The leading edge
(nosings) of treads shall project not more than 1 1/4 inches (32 mm) beyond the tread below
and all projections of the leading edges shall be of uniform size, including the leading edge of
the floor at the top of a fiight.

Exceptions:
1 Solid risers are not required for stairways that are not required to comply with Section
1007.3, providedthatthe opening betweentroads-deesnetpermit the passageofa
| thoadi £4 inches {102 )
2 Solid risers are not required for occupancies in Group -3 orin Group F, Hand S

occupancies other than areas accessible to the public. There are no restrictions on the

size of the opening in the riser.
3 Solid risers and not required for spirol stairways constructed in accordance with Section

1009.9.



Section

Section

Section

4 Solid risers are not required for afternating tread devices constructed in accordance
with Section 1009.10.

1208.2 is amended to read as follows:

1208.2 Minimum ceiting heights. Occupiable spaces, habitable spaces, and corridors AND
UNFINISHED BASEMENTS shail have a ceiling height of not less than 7 feet, 6 inches (2286 mm).
Bathrooms, toilet rooms, kitchens, storage rooms and laundry rooms shall be permitted to have
a ceiling height of not less than 7 feet (2134 mm).

Exceptions:

1 In one- and two-family dwelfings, beams or girders spaced not less 4 feet {1219 mm} on
center and projecting not more than 6 inches (152 mm) below the required ceiling
height.

2 If any room in a building has a sloped ceiling, the prescribed ceiling height for the room

is required in one-half the area thereof. Any portion of the room measuring less than 5
feet (1524 mm) from the finished floor to the finished ceiling shall not be included in
any computation of the minimum area thereof.

3 Mezzanines constructed in accordance with Section 505.1.

1503 is amended by adding three new subsections as follows:

1503.7 SNOW-SHED BARRIERS. ROOFS SHALL BE DESIGNED TO PREVENT ACCUMULATION OF
SNOW FROM SHEDDING ONTO EXTERIOR BALCONIES, DECKS, PEDESTRIAN AND VEHICULAR
EXITS FROM BUILDINGS, STAIRWAYS, SIDEWALKS, STREETS, ALLEYS, AREAS DIRECTLY ABOVE
OR IN FRONT OF GAS UTILITY OR ELECTRIC UTILITY METERS, OR ADJACENT PROPERTIES.

EXCEPTION: MECHANICAL BARRIERS INSTALLED TO PREVENT SNOW SHEDDING FROM THE
ROOF WHICH ARE SECURED TO THE ROOF FRAMING MEMBERS OR TO SOLID BLOCKING
SECURED TO FRAMING MEMBERS IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE MANUFACTURER'’S
INSTALLATION INSTRUCTIONS.

1503.8 FALL PROTECTION. PERMANENT FALL PROTECTION ANCHORS SHALL BE INSTALLED ON
ALL NEW CONSTRUCTION. ROOF ANCHORS OR SIMILAR DEVICES SHALL BE INSTALLED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE MANUFACTURERS’ INSTALLATION INSTRUCTIONS.

1503.9 VALLEY OUTLETS. EACH ROOF VALLEY SHALL HAVE ACCESS TO AN ELECTRICAL
RECEPTACLE INSTALLED ACCORDING TO THE ELECTRICAL CODE.

1507.1 is amended by adding two new subsections to read as follows:

1507.1.1 Ice barrier. AN ICE BARRIER THAT CONSISTS OF AN APPROVED SELF-ADHERING
POLYMER MODIFIED BITUMEN SHEET SHALL BE USED IN LIEU OF NCRMAL UNDERLAYMENT



ON ALL SLOPED ROOFS. THIS ICE DAM PROTECTION UNDERLAYMENT SHALL BE INSTALLED
FROM THE EAVES TO A POINT 6 FEET INSIDE THE EXTERIOR WALL LINE OF THE BUILDING AND
24 INCHES FROM THE CENTER LINE OF ALL VALLEYS, FULLY ADHERED TO THE SUBSTRATE ON
ALL HABITABLE STRUCTURES.

Exception: DETACHED ACCESSORY STRUCTURES THAT CONTAIN NO CONDITIONED FLOOR
AREA.

1507.1.2 Snow-shed barriers. ROOFS SHALL BE DESIGNED TO PREVENT ACCUMULATIONS OF
SNOW FROM SHEDDING ABOVE OR IN FRONT OF GAS UTILITY OR ELECTRIC UTILITY METERS.

Section 1507.2.8.2 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section 1507.4 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

1507.4.1.1 Mechanical barriers for metal roof shingles and metal roof paneis. ROOFS WITH
METAL ROOF SHINGLES OR METAL ROOF PANELS SHALL BE DESIGNED SO AS TO PREVENT
ACCUMULATIONS OF SNOW FROM SHEDDING ONTO PEDESTRIAN AND VEHICULAR EXITS
FROM BUILDINGS AND ON TO SIDEWALKS, STREETS AND ALLEY WAYS,

MECHANICAL BARRIERS INSTALLED TO PREVENT SNOW SHEDDING FROM THE ROOF SHALL BE
SECURED TO ROOF FRAMING MEMBERS GR TO SOLID BLOCKING SECURED TO FRAMING
MEMBERS IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE MANUFACTURER'S INSTALLATION INSTRUCTIONS.

INDIVIDUAL DEVICES INSTALLED IN A GROUP OF DEVICES TO CREATE A BARRIER TO PREVENT
SNOW SHEDDING SHALL BE INSTALLED IN AT LEAST TWO ROWS WITH THE FIRST ROW NO
MORE THAN 24 INCHES FROM THE EDGE OF THE ROOF OR EAVE. THE ROWS SHALL BE
PARALLEL WITH THE EXTERIOR WALL LINE AND THE DEVICES IN EACH ROW SHALL BE
STAGGERED FOR A SPACING OF NO MORE THAN 24 INCHES ON CENTER MEASURED PARALLEL
WITH THE EXTERIOR WALL LINE.

CONTINUOUS SNOW BARRIERS SHALL BE SECURED TO ROOF FRAMING AT NO MORE THAN 48
INCHES ON CENTER. CONTINUOUS BARRIERS SHALL BE INSTALLED PARALLEL WITH THE



Section

EXTERIOR WALL LINE AND NO MORE THAN 24 INCHES FROM THE EDGE OF THE ROOF OR
EAVE.

1507.5 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

1507.5.1.1 Mechanical barriers for metal roof shingles and metal roof panels. ROOFS WITH
METAL ROOF SHINGLES OR METAL ROOF PANELS SHALL BE DESIGNED SO AS TO PREVENT
ACCUMULATICNS OF SNOW FROM SHEDDING ONTO PEDESTRIAN AND VEHICULAR EXITS
FROM BUILDINGS AND ON TO SIDEWALKS, STREETS AND ALLEY WAYS,

MECHANICAL BARRIERS INSTALLED TO PREVENT SNOW SHEDDING FROM THE ROOF SHALL BE
SECURED TO ROOF FRAMING MEMBERS OR TO SOLID BLOCKING SECURED TO FRAMING
MEMBERS IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE MANUFACTURER’S INSTALLATION INSTRUCTIONS.

INDIVIDUAL DEVICES INSTALLED IN A GROUP OF DEVICES TO CREATE A BARRIER TO PREVENT
SNOW SHEDDING SHALL BE INSTALLED IN AT LEAST TWO ROWS WITH THE FIRST ROW NO
MORE THAN 24 INCHES FRCM THE EDGE OF THE ROOF OR EAVE. THE ROWS SHALL BE
PARALLEL WITH THE EXTERIOR WALL LINE AND THE DEVICES IN EACH ROW SHALL BE
STAGGERED FOR A SPACING OF NO MORE THAN 24 INCHES ON CENTER MEASURED PARALLEL
WITH THE EXTERIOR WALL LINE.

CONTINUOUS SNOW BARRIERS SHALL BE SECURED TO ROOF FRAMING AT NO MORE THAN 48
INCHES ON CENTER. CONTINUOUS BARRIERS SHALL BE INSTALLED PARALLEL WITH THE
EXTERIOR WALL LINE AND NO MORE THAN 24 INCHES FROM THE EDGE OF THE ROOF OR
EAVE.

Section 1507.5.4 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

area: THIS

SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section 1507.6.4 is amended by deleting in its entirety.




SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section 1507.7.4 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section 1507.8.4 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section 1507.9.4 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

SUBSECTION DELETED.
Section 1605.2.2 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

160522 kloodloads—\Where floodoadsF,-are-to-be-considered-inthe designthe load
combinationsofSection2-3-3-of ASCEZshallbeused, THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.



Section 1605.3.1.2 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

3605312 Floodoads.\Where floodloads+ are-to-beconsidered-inthe-design-thaload
combinations-of Section-2-4-2-of-ASCE 7 shaltbeused. THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section 1608.1 is amended to read as follows:

1608.1 General. Design snow loads shall be determined in accordance with-Section 7 ofASCEZ;
Table 1608.1, but the design roof load shall not be less than that determined by section 1607,

TABLE 1608.1 DESIGN SNOW LOAD FOR ROOFS

$,000 FEET ABOVE SEA LEVEL IS 98 POUNDS PER SQUARE FOOT
9,250 FEET ABOVE SEA LEVEL IS 105 POUNDS PER SQUARE FOOT
9,500 FEET ABOVE SEA LEVEL IS 113 POUNDS PER SQUARE FOOT
9,750 FEET ABOVE SEA LEVEL IS 120 POUNDS PER SQUARE FOOT
10,000 FEET ABOVE SEA LEVEL IS 128 POUNDS PER SQUARE FOOT
10,250 FEET ABOVE SEA LEVEL IS 136 POUNDS PER SQUARE FOOT
10,500 FEET ABOVE SEA LEVEL IS 145 POUNDS PER SQUARE FOOT
10,750 FEET ABOVE SEA LEVEL IS 154 POUNDS PER SQUARE FOOT

Section 1608.2 is amended to read as foilows:

1608.2 Ground-snewleads. ROOF SNOW LOAD. AS DETERMINED BY GRAND COUNTY SNOW
LOAD/SNOW ZONE MAP OR GRAND COUNTY SUBDIVISION INDEX. Fhe-ground-snow-loadsto

specific case studies shaH be made in areas deagnated“(:S’m Figure 1608.2. G-FG-H-Hd—SHG’N—IGGd—S
ROOF SNOW LOADS i @ R n A ad-in-Fia 0

Section 1612 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

SECHON-1612 FH.00D-LOADS, THIS SECTION DELETED.

Section 1703.1 is amended to read as follows:



1703.1 Approved agency. An approved agency shall provide ail information as necessary for the
building officiaf to determine that the agency meets the applicable requirements. THE FIRE
DEPARTMENT OR THE STATE OF COLORADO DIVISICN OF FIRE SAFETY OR THEIR AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE SHALL BE AN APPROVED AGENCY FOR SPECIAL INSPECTION OF FIRE
PROTECTION SYSTEMS REQUIRED BY THIS CODE AND THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE.

Section 1704 is amended hy adding two new subsections to read as follows:

1704.17 Fire protection systems. FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS SHALL HAVE THE DESIGN PLANS
APPROVED BY A SPECIAL INSPECTION AGENCY AND THE SYSTEMS INSPECTED AND TESTED BY
A SPECIAL INSPECTOR FOR COMPLIANCE WITH THE REQUIREMENTS OF THIS CODE AND THE
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE.

1704.17.1 Qualifications. SPECIAL INSPECTORS FOR FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS SHALL HAVE
EXPERTISE IN FIRE-PROTECTION. SPECIAL INSPECTORS FOR FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS
SHALL BE A CERTIFIED FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS INSPECTOR BY THE STATE OF COLORADO
DIVISION OF FIRE SAFETY,

Exception: SPECIAL INSPECTION BY THE FiRE DEPARTMENT OR THE STATE OF COLORADO
DIVISION OF FIRE SAFETY OR THEIR AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE OF FIRE PROTECTION
SYSTEMS.

Section 1804.4 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

ot aTa Wata I alaala 130 I o P i P I

foot{305-mm}atany-peoint. THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section 1805.1.2.1 is amended by deleting in its entirety.



Section 1807.1 is amended fo read as foliows:

1807.1 Foundation walls. Foundation walls shall be designed and constructed in accordance
with Sections 1807.1.1 through 1807.1.6. Foundation wails shall be supported by feundations
FOOTINGS designed in accordance with Section 1808.

Section 1808 is amended to read as follows:
SECTION 1808 FOOTINGS AND FOUNDATIONS

Section 1808.1 is amended to read as follows:

1808.1 General. FOOTINGS AND foundations shall be designed and constructed in accordance
with Sections 1808.2 through 1808.9. Shallow FOOTINGS AND foundations shall also satisfy the
requirements of Section 1809. Deep FOOTINGS AND foundations shall also satisfy the
requirements of Section 1810. ALL EXTERIOR WALLS SHALL BE SUPPORTED ON CONTINUCUS
SOLID OR FULLY GROUTED MASONRY OR CONCRETE FOOTINGS. CONCRETE FOOTINGS SHALL
INCLUDE A MINIMUM OF TWO #4 REINFORCEMENT BARS TO BE TiED CONTINUOUSLY AND
SPACED A MINIMUM OF TWO INCHES FROM THE GROUND AND EQUALLY WiITHIN THE
FOOTING.

EXCEPTION: UNLESS DESIGNED AND STAMPED BY AN ENGINEER.

Section 1808.2 is amended to read as follows:

1808.2 Design for capacity and settlement. FOOTINGS AND foundations shali be so designed
that the allowable bearing capacity of the soil is not exceeded, and the differential settiement is
minimized. FOOTINGS AND foundations in areas with expansive soils shall be designed in
accordance with the provisions of Section 1808.6

Section 1808.3 is amended to read as follows:
1808.3 Design loads. FOOTINGS AND foundations shall be designed for the most unfavorabie

effects due to the combinations of loads specified in Section 1605.2 or 1605.3. The dead load is
permitted teo include the weight of foundations and overlying fill. Reducediveloads—as



Section 1809 is amended to read as follows:
SECTION 1809 SHALLOW FOOTINGS AND FOUNDATIONS
Section 1809.1 is amended by adding three new subsections to read as follows:

1809.1 General. Shallow FOOTINGS AND foundations shall be designed and constructed in
accordance with Sections 1809.2 through 1809.13.

1809.1.1 FOOTINGS. ALL EXTERIOR WALLS SHALL BE SUPPORTED ON CONTINUOUS SOLID OR
FULLY GROUTED MASONRY OR CONCRETE FOOTINGS. CONCRETE FOOTINGS SHALL INCLUDE
A MINIMUM OF TWO #4 REINFORCEMENT BARS TO BE TIED CONTINUOUSLY AND SPACED A
MINIMUM OF TWO INCHES FROM THE GROUND AND EQUALLY WITHIN THE FOOTING. THERE
SHALL BE #4 VERTICAL REBAR 4 FEET ON CENTER, MINIMUM. VERTICAL REBAR SHALL EXTEND
FROM THE FOOTING TO THE TOP COURSE OF THE HORIZONTAL FOUNDATION WALL REBAR.

EXCEPTION: UNLESS DESIGNED AND STAMPED BY AN ENGINEER,

1809.1.1.2 FOUNDATIONS. THE MINIMUM FOUNDATION DESIGN IS AN 8 INCH THICK
CONCRETE WALL. WALLS UP TO AND INCLUDING 4 FEET IN HEIGHT REQUIRE TWO (2) #4
CONTINUOUS REBAR IN THE TOP OF THE WALL. WALLS OVER 4 FEET UP TO AND INCLUDING 8
FEET IN HEIGHT REQUIRE TWO (2) #4 CONTINUOUS REBAR TOP AND BOTTOM. WALLS OVER 8
FEET IN HEIGHT ARE REQUIRED TO BE DESIGNED AND STAMPED BY AN ENGINEER. ALL
FOUNDATION WALLS REQUIRE #4 VERTICAL REBAR 4 FEET ON CENTER, MINIMUM.

EXCEPTION: UNLESS DESIGNED AND STAMPED BY AN ENGINEER.

1809.1.1.3 PIERS. ALL CONCRETE PIERS SHALL iINCLUDE A MINIMUM OF TWO {2) #4 VERTICAL
REINFORCEMENT BARS TO BE SPACED EQUALLY WITHIN THE PIER. EXCEPT FOR STEEL
DOWELS EMBEDDED 5 FEET OR LESS IN THE PIER, REINFORCEMENT SHALL BE ASSEMBLED AND
TIED TOGETHER AND SHALL BE PLACED IN THE PIER HOLE AS A UNIT BEFORE THE REINFORCED
PORTION OF THE PIER 1S FILLED WITH CONCRETE.

EXCEPTIONS:
1 UNLESS DESIGNED AND STAMPED BY AN ENGINEER.
2 REINFORCEMENT IS PERMITTED TO BE WET SET AND THE 2 22 iNCH CONCRETE COVER

REQUIREMENT BE REDUCED TO 2 INCHES FOR GROUP R-3 AND GROUP U
OCCUPANCIES NOT EXCEEDING TWO STORIES OF LIGHT-FRAME CONSTRUCTION,
PROVIDED THE CONSTRUCTION METHOD CAN BE DEMONSTRATED TO THE
SATISFACTION OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.



Section 1809.3 is amended to read as follows:

1809.3 Stepped footings. The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface of
footings shall be permitted to have a slope not exceeding one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal
(10-percent slope). Footings shall be stepped where it is hecessary to change the elevation of
the top surface of the footing or where the surface of the ground slopes more than one unit
vertical in 10 units horizontal {10-percent slope). ALL EXTERIOR WALLS SHALL BE SUPPORTED
ON CONTINUOUS SGLID OR FULLY GROUTED MASONRY OR CONCRETE FOOTINGS. CONCRETE
FOOTINGS SHALL INCLUDE A MINIMUM OF TWO #4 REINFORCEMENT BARS TO BE TIED
CONTINUOUSLY AND SPACED A MINIMUM OF TWO INCHES FROM THE GROUND AND
EQUALLY WITH!N THE FOOTING. THERE SHALL BE #4 VERTICAL REBAR 4 FEET ON CENTER,
MINHVIUM. VERTICAL REBAR SHALL EXTEND FROM THE FOOTING TC THE TOP COURSE OF THE
HORIZONTAL FOUNDATION WALL REBAR,

Section 1809.4 is amended to read as follows:

1809.4 Depth and width AND EDGE THICKNESS of SPREAD footings. The minimum depth of

SPREAD footings below the-undisturbed-ground-siface FINISHED GRADE shall be 22-inches

{385-mmy} 30 INCHES, MEASURED TO THE BOTTOM OF FOOTING. Where applicable, the
requirements of Section 1809.5 shall also be satisfied. The minimum width of SPREAD footings
shall be 12-inches{305-mm} 16 INCHES. THE MINIMUM EDGE THICKNESS OF SPREAD
FOOTINGS SHALL BE 8 INCHES.

Section 1809.5 is amended to read as follows:

1809.5 Frost protection. Except where otherwise protected from frost, foundations and other
permanent supports of buildings and structures shall be protected from frost by one or more of

the following methods:

1. Extending below the frost line of the locality; 30 INCHES.
2. Constructing in accordance with ASCE 32; or
3. Erecting on sotlid rock.

Exception: Free-standing buildings meeting alt BOTH of the following conditions shall not be
required to be protected:

Argance n O o LE
o - 7 oo cJ =

2.1.  Area of 6004{56-m"} 120 square feet or less for light-frame construction or 400{37-m?%
120 square feet or less for other than light-frame construction; and
3. 2. Eave height of 10 feet (3048 mm) or less.



Shallow foundations shall not bear on frozen soil unlesssuch-frozen-condition-is-ofa-permanent
character:

Section 1809.7 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

Table 1809/ is-deleted-in-its-entivety. THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section 2111.1.1 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

2111.1.1 LIMITATION ON THE NUMBER: THE NUMBER GF APPROVED SOLID FUEL BURNING
APPLIANCES OR DEVICES WHICH MAY BE INSTALLED SHALL NOT EXCEED THE FOLLOWING
LIMITS:

1. DETACHED SINGLE-FAMILY DWELLING: ONE APPROVED SOLID FUEL BURNING
APPLIANCE OR DEVICE PER DWELLING.

2. BUILDING WITH TWO DWELLING UNITS: ONE APPROVED SOLID FUEL BURNING
APPLIANCE OR DEVICE PER DWELLING UNIT PROVIDED THE DWELLING UNIT IS
GREATER THAN ONE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED (1,500) SQUARE FEET IN TOTAL
LIVING AREA,

3, APARTMENTS, CONDOMINIUMS, COMIMERCIAL, AND INDUSTRIAL BUILDINGS:
APARTMENTS, CONDOMINIUMS, COMMERCIAL, AND INDUSTRIAL BUILDINGS SHALL
BE ALLOWED TO INSTALL ONE APPROVED SOLID FUEL BURNING APPLIANCE OR
DEVICE IN A LOBBY OR OTHER COMMON AREA OF THE APARTMENT, CONDOMINIUM,
OR HOTEL. ONLY AN APPROVED NONSOLID FUEL BURNING APPLIANCE MAY BE
INSTALLED WITHIN ANY APARTMENT, CONDOMINIUM OR HOTEL/MOTEL ROOM.

Section 2301.2 is amended to read as follows:

2301.2 General design requirements. The design of structural elements or systems,
constructed partially or wholly of wood or wood-based products, shail be in accordance on one
of the following methods. THE USE OF LOAD DURATION FACTORS FOR SNOW LOAD SHALL
NOT BE PERMITTED IN ANY OF THESE DESIGN METHODS.

Section 2303.1.10 is amended by adding two exceptions to read as follows:

2303.1.10 Structural log members, Stress grading of structural log members of nonrectangular
shape, as typically used in log buildings, shall be in accordance with ASTM D 3957, Such
structural log members shall be identified by the grade mark of an approved lumber grading or



inspection agency. In lieu of a grade mark on the material, a certificate of inspection as to
species and grade issued by a lumber grading or inspection agency meeting the requirements of
this section shall be permitted.

Exceptions:

1. IN SINGLE FAMILY DWELLINGS OF LOG CONSTRUCTION, WALL LOGS NEED NOT BE
GRADED.

2. IN SINGLE FAMILY DWELLINGS OF LOG CONSTRUCTION, ALL STRUCTURAL LOGS MAY

BE DESIGNED BY A LICENSED COLORADO ARCHITECT OR ENGINEER AND INSPECTED BY
THAT ARCHITECT OR ENGINEER AFTER THE COMPLETION OF THE FRAMING WITH THE
ARCHITECT OR ENGINEER CERTIFYING TO THE BUILDING DEPARTMENT THAT THE LOGS
ARE OF THE SIZE, QUALITY AND SPECIES OF THE DESIGN AND THAT THEY WERE
INSTALLED TO THAT DESIGN. WALL LOGS NEED NOT BE PART OF THE STRUCTURAL
DESIGN.

Section 2303.4.1 is amended 1o read as follows:

2303.4.1 Design. Wood trusses shall be designed in accordance with the provisions of This Code
and accepted engineering practice. Members are permitted to be joined by nails, glue, bolts,
timber connectors, metal connector plates or other gpproved framing devices. THE USE OF
LOAD DURATION FACTORS FOR SNOW LOAD OR SLOPE OF ROOF SHALL NOT BE PERMITTED IN
ANY OF THESE DESIGN METHODS.

Section 2304.2 is amended to read as follows:

2304.2 Size of structural members. Computations to determine the required sizes of members
shall be based on the net dimensions {actual sizes) and not nominal sizes. THE USE OF LOAD
DURATION FACTORS FOR SNOW LOAD OR SLOPE OF RCOF SHALL NOT BE PERMITTED IN ANY
OF THESE COMPUTATIONS.

Section 2304.4 is amended to read as follows;

2304.4 Floor and roof framing. The framing of wood-joisted floors and wood framed roofs shall
be in accordance with the provisions specified in Section 2308 unless a specific design is
furnished. THE USE OF LOAD DURATION FACTORS FOR SNOW LOAD OR SLOPE OF ROOFS
SHALL NOT BE PERMITTED.

Section 2304.7.2 is amended to read as follows:

2304.7.2 Structural roof sheathing. Structural roof sheathing shall be designed in accordance
with the general provisions of This Code and the special provisions in this section.



Section

Section

Section

Section

Roof sheathing conforming to the provisions of Tabte 2304.7({1), 2304.7(2), 2304.7(3) or
2304.7(5} shall be deemed to meet the requirements of this section. Wood structural panel roof
sheathing shall be bonded by exterior glue.

EXCEPTION: A MINIMUM OF 5/8 INCH PLYWOOD, PARTICLE BOARD, OR WAFERWOOD SHALL
BE USED ON ROQF RAFTERS OR ROOF TRUSSES SPACED 24 INCHES ON CENTER IN ANY SNOW
LOAD AREA.

2308.9.5.1 is amended to read as follows:

2308.9.5.1 Headers. Headers shall be provided over each opening in exterior- bearing walls.
THE USE OF LOAD DURATION FACTORS FOR SNOW LOAD OR SLOPE OF ROOF SHALL NOT BE

PERMITTED. Fhespansinfable2308-0-5-are-permitted-to-be-used-for one-and-two-fam

MINiIMUM as-permitted-by-Table2388-9-5 and nailed together in accordance with Table

2304.9.1 or of solid lumber of equivalent size.
2308.10.3 is amended to read as follows:

2308.10.3 Rafter spans. Allowabie spans for rafters shall be in accordance with Table
2308.10.3(1), 2308.10.3{2), 2308.10.3(3}, 2308.10.3(4), 2308.10.3(5) or 2308.10.3(6). For other
grades and species, refer to the AF&PA Span Tables for Joists and Rafters. THE USE OF LOAD
DURATION FACTORS FOR SNOW LOAD OR SLOPE OF ROOF SHALIL NOT BE PERMITTED.

2308.10.8 is amended to read as follows:

2308.10.8 Roof sheathing. Roof sheathing shail be in accordance with Tables 2304.7(3) and
2304.7(5) for wood structural panels, and Tables 2304.7(1) and 2304.7(2} for lumber and shall
comply with Section 2304.7.2.

EXCEPTION: A MINIMUM OF 5/8 INCH PLYWOQOOD, PARTICLE BOARD, OR WAFERWOOD SHALL
BE USED ON ROOF RAFTERS OR ROOF TRUSSES SPACED 24 INCHES ON CENTER IN ANY SNOW
LOAD AREA.

2901.1 is amended to read as follows:

[P] 2901.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter and the International Plumbing Code shall
govern the erection, installation, alternation, repairs, relocation, replacement, addition to, use
or maintenance of plumbing equipment and systems. Plumbing systems and equipment shall be



constructed, installed and maintained in accordance with the International Plumbing Code.

nterngtiongl-RrivateSewaao-iiseosa

> o cowTEa cicnea ot o e by orformto-the

Section 2901 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

[P] 2501.1.1 SANITATION AT CONSTRUCTION SITES. TOILET FACILITIES SHALL BE PROVIDED
FOR CONSTRUCTICN WORKERS AND SUCH FACILITIES SHALL BE CONVENIENTLY LOCATED AND
MAINTAINED IN A SANITARY CONDITION. THE FACILITIES SHALL BE AVAILABLE FOR USE
FROM THE START OF THE PROJECT UNTIL THE CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY IS ISSUED.

Section 3001.1 is amended to read as follows:

3001.1 Scope. This chapter governs the design, construction, instaliation, afteration,
MAINTENANCE, and repair of NEW AND EXISTING INSTALLATIONS OF elevators,
DUMBWAITERS, ESCALATORS, AND MOVING WALKS, and-conveyingsystems-and-their
components REQUIRING PERMITS THEREFOR PROVIDING PROCEDURES FOR THE INSPECTION
AND MAINTENANCE OF SUCH CONVEYANCES.

Chapter 30, concerning elevators, moving walks, escalators or dumbwaiters, is amended by adding four
new sections and subsections to read as follows:

SECTION 3009 PERMITS & CERTIFICATES OF INSPECTION

3009.1 PERMITS REQUIRED. IT SHALL BE UNLAWFUL TO INSTALL ANY NEW ELEVATOR,
MOVING WALK, ESCALATOR OR DUMBWAITERS OR TO MAKE MAJOR ALTERATIONS TO ANY
EXISTING ELEVATOR, DUMBWAITER, ESCALATOR OR MOVING WALK, AS DEFINED IN PART Xl
OF ASME A17.1, WITHOUT FIRST OBTAINING A PERMIT FOR SUCH INSTALLATION FROM THE
BUILDING OFFICIAL. PERMITS SHALL NOT BE REQUIRED FOR MAINTENANCE OR MINOR
ALTERATIONS.

3009.2 CERTIFICATES OF INSPECTION REQUIRED. IT SHALL BE UNLAWFUL TO OPERATE ANY
ELEVATOR, DUMBWAITER, ESCALATOR CR MOVING WALK WITHOUT A CURRENT CERTIFICATE
OF INSPECTION ISSUED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL. SUCH CERTIFICATE SHALL BE ISSUED
UPON PAYMENT OF PRESCRIBED FEES AND THE PRESENTATION OF A VALID INSPECTION
REPORT INDICATING THAT THE CONVEYANCE IS SAFE AND THAT THE INSPECTIONS AND TESTS
HAVE BEEN PERFORMED IN ACCORDANCE WITH PART X OF THE ASME A17.1. CERTIFICATES
SHALL NOT BE ISSUED WHEN THE CONVEYANCE IS POSTED AS UNSAFE PURSUANT TO SECTION
3010.

EXCEPTION: CERTIFICATES OF INSPECTION SHALL NOT BE REQUIRED FOR CONVEYANCES
WITHIN A PWELLING UNIT.



3009.3 APPLICATION FOR PERMITS. APPLICATION FOR A PERMIT TO INSTALL SHALL BE MADE
ON FORMS PROVIDED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL, AND THE PERMIT SHALL BE ISSUED TO AN
OWNER UPON PAYMENT OF THE PERMIT FEES SPECIFIED iN THIS SECTION.

3009.4 APPLICATIONS FOR CERTIFICATES OF INSPECTION. APPLICATION FOR A CERTIFICATE
OF INSPECTION SHALL BE MADE BY THE OWNER OF AN ELEVATOR, DUMBWAITER, ESCALATOR
OR MOVING WALK. APPLICATIONS SHALL BE ACCOMPANIED BY AN INSPECTION REPORT AS
DESCRIBED IN SECTION 3009. FEES FOR CERTIFICATES OF INSPECTION SHALL BE AS SPECIFIED
IN THIS SECTION.

SECTION 3010 DESIGN

3010.1 DETALED REQUIREMENTS. FOR DETAIL DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION AND INSTALLATION
REQUIREMENTS, SEE CHAPTER 16 AND THE APPROPRIATE REQUIREMENTS OF ASME A17.1.

SECTION 3011 REQUIREMENTS FOR OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE

3011.1 GENERAL. THE OWNER SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR SAFE OPERATION AND
MAINTENANCE OF EACH ELEVATOR, DUMBWAITER, ESCALATOR AND MOVING WALK
INSTALLATION AND SHALL CAUSE PERIODIC INSPECTIONS TO BE MADE ON SUCH
CONVEYANCES AS REQUIRED IN THIS SECTION.

3011.2 PERIQODIC INSPECTIONS AND TEST. ROUTINE AND PERIODIC INSPECTIONS AND TESTS
SHALL BE MADE AS REQUIRED BY PART X OF ASME A17.1,

3011.3 ALTERATIONS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE. ALTERNATIONS, REPAIRS, AND
MAINTENANCE SHALL BE MADE AS REQUIRED BY PART X!l OF ASME Al17.1.

3011.4 INSPECTION COSTS., ALL COST OF SUCH INSPECTIONS AND TEST SHALL BE PAID BY THE
OWNER.

3011.5 INSPECTION REPORTS. AFTER EACH REQUIRED INSPECTION, A FULL AND CORRECT
REPORT OF SUCH INSPECTION SHALL BE FiLED WITH THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.

SECTION 3012 UNSAFE CONDITIONS

3012.1 UNSAFE CONDITIONS. WHEN AN INSPECTION REVEALS AN UNSAFE CONDITION OF AN
ELEVATOR, MOVING WALK, ESCALATOR OR DUMBWAITER, THE INSPECTOR SHALL
IMMEDIATELY FILE WITH THE OWNER AND THE BUILDING OFFICIAL A FULL AND TRUE REPORT
OF SUCH INSPECTION AND SUCH UNSAFE CONDITION. IF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL FINDS THAT
AN UNSAFE CONDITION ENDANGERS HUMAN LIFE, THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL CAUSE TO
BE PLACED ON SUCH ELEVATOR, ESCALATOR OR MOVING WALK, IN A CONSPICUOUS PLACE, A
NOTICE STATING CONVEYANCE IS UNSAFE. THE OWNER SHALL SEE TO IT THAT SUCH NOTICE



OF UNSAFE CONDITION IS LEGIBLY MAINTAINED WHERE PLACED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL.
THE BUILDING OFFICIAL SHALL ALSO ISSUE AN ORDER IN WRITING TO THE OWNER REQUIRING
THE REPAIRS OR ALTERATIONS TO BE MADE TO SUCH CONVEYANCE THAT ARE NECESSARY TO
RENDER IT SAFE AND MAY ORDER THE OPERATION THEREOF DISCONTINUED UNTIL THE
REPAIRS OR ALTERATIONS ARE MIADE OR THE UNSAFE CONDITIONS ARE REMOVED. A
POSTED NOTICE OF UNSAFE CONDITIONS SHALL BE REMOVED ONLY BY THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL WHEN SATISFIED THAT THE UNSAFE CONDITIONS HAVE BEEN CORRECTED.

Section 3109.3 is amended by adding an exception to read as follows:

3109.3 Public swimming pools. Public swimming pools shali be completely enclosed by a fence
at least 4 feet (1290 mm) in height or a screen enclosure. Openings in the fence shall not permit
the passage of a four-inch-diameter (102 mm) sphere. The fence or screen enclosure shail he
equipped with self-closing and self-latching gates.

EXCEPTION: A SWIMMING POOL WITH A POWER SAFETY COVER OR A SPA WITH A SAFETY
COVER COMPLYING WITH ASTM F 1346.

Section 3309 is amended to read as follows:

[F] 3309.1 Where required. All structures under construction, aglteration or demolition shall be
provided with not less than one gpproved portable fire extinguishers inacecerdance-with-Section

806-and-sized-fornetdessthan-ordinarshazardasfollows: AS REQUIRED BY THE FIRE

DEPARTMENT.
1. At each stairway on all floor levels where combustible materials have accumulated.
In every storage and construction shed.
3. Additional portable fire extinguishers shall be provided where special hazards exist, such

as the storage and use of flammable and combustible liquids.

Section 3311.1 is amended to read as follows:

[F] 3311.1 Where required. In buildings required to have standpipes by Section 905.3.1, AS

REQUIRED BY THE FIRE DEPARTMENT. notlessthan-onestandpipe-shallbe provided-foruse

Section 3311.2 is amended to read as follows:



[F] 3311.2 Buildings being demolished. Where a building is being demolished and a standpipe
exists within such a building, such standpipe shall be maintained in an operable condition so as
to be available for use by the fire department. Such standpipe shall be demolished with the
building but shall not be demolished more than one floor below the floor being demolished OR
AS APPROVED BY THE FIRE DEPARTMENT.

Section 3311.4 is amended to read as follows:

3311.4 Water supply. Water supply for fire protection, either temporary or permanent shall be
made available as soon as combustible material accumulates OR AS REQUHRED BY THE FIRE

DEPARTMENT.

Section 3401.3 is amended to read as follows:

3401.3 Compliance. Alterations, repairs, additions and changes of occupancy to existing
structures shall comply with the provisions for alterations, repairs, buildings and additions and
changes of occupancy in the international-Fire-Cede, International Fuel Gas Code, International

Mechanical Code, International Plumbing Code, internationgl-Property-Maintenance Codes
internationai-Private-SewageDispesal-Code, International Residential Code and NFPA 70.

Section 3401.5 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

DELETED.

Section 3403.2 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

new construction: THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section 3404.2 is amended by deleting in its entirety.




Dacian ad a ' atafa =
= £hd & s o ct s

approved-by-the-Departmentofinterior. THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section 3412.2 is amended to read as follows:

3412.2 Applicability. Structures existing prior to [BATETFOBEINSERTED BY FHEJURISBICTION]
DECEMBER 21, 1978 [N i d hat thisda ncidewith j 3
building-codeswithinthejurisdiction], in which there is work involving additions, alterations or
changes of occupancy shall be made to comply with the requirements of this section or the
provisions of Sections 3403 through 3409. The provisions in Sections 3412.2.1 through 3412.2.5
shall apply to existing occupancies that will continue to be, or are proposed to be, in Groups A,
B, E, F, M, R, S and U. These provisions shall not apply to buildings with occupancies in Group H

orl

Section 3412.2.4.1 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

fornew constructionfor flood-design. THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.



Section

Section

Section

3412.3.2 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

Code. THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.

3412.4 is amended to read as follows:

3412.4 Investigation and evaluation. For proposed work covered by this section, the building
owner shall cause the existing building to be investigated and evaluated in accordance with the
provisions of this section BY A DESIGN PROFESSIONAL LICENSED TO PRACTICE IN THE STATE OF

COLORADO.
EXCEPTION: GROUP R, DIVISION 3 AND GROUP U OCCUPANCIES.

3412.6 is amended to read as follows:

3412.6 Evaluation process. THE BUILDING OWNER SHALL CAUSE THE EXISTING BUILDING TO
BE EVALUATED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE PROVISIONS OF THiS SECTION BY A DESIGN
PROFESSIONAL{S) LICENSED TO PRACTICE {N THE STATE OF COLORADO. The evaluation
process specified herein shall be followed in its entirety to evaluate existing buildings. Table
3412.7 shall be utilized for tabulating the results of the evaluation. References to other sections
of This Code indicate that compliance with those sections is required in order to gain credit in
the evaluation herein outfined. In applying this section to a building with mixed occupancies,
where the separation between the mixed occupancies does not qualify for any category
indicated in Section 3412.6.16, the score for each occupancy shall be determined and the lower
score determined for each section of the evaluation process shall appiy to the entire building.

Where the separation between the mixed occupancies qualifies for any category indicated in
Section 3412.6.16, the score for each occupancy shall apply to each portion of the building

based on the cccupancy of the space.

EXCEPTION: GROUP R, DIVISION 3 AND GROUP U OCCUPANCIES.

AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

TOWN CODE 6-1-3: Code Amendments: The following sections of the International Residential Code,
adopted by reference in Town Code Section 6-1-1 hereof, is hereby amended as follows:



R101.1 Title. These provisions shall be known as the Residential Code for One- and Two-family
Dwellings of The Town of Winter Park, and shall be cited as such and will be referred to herein

as "This Code?”
Section R102.7 is amended to read as follows:

R102.7 Existing structures. The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of
adoption of This Code shall be permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically

covered in This Code, the lnternational-RropertyMaintenance-Code-or the International Fire

Code, or as is deemed necessary by the building official for the general safety and welfare of the
occupants and the public.

Section R103.2 is amended to read as follows:
R103.2 Appointraent-BUILDING OFFICIAL. SEE 6-1-2, 103.2.
Section R103.3 is amended to read as follows:
R103.3 Deputies. SEE 6-1-2, 103.3
Section R104.8 is amended to read as follows:
R104.8 Liahility. SEE 6-1-2, 104.8.
Section R105.2 is amended to read as follows:

R105.2 Work exempt from permit. Permits shall not be required for the following. Exemption
from the permit requirements of This Code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any
work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of This Code or any other laws or

ordinances of this jurisdiction.
Building:

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and
similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 200 120 square feet {18-58-m7).
Fences not over 6 feet {1829 mm) high.
Retaining walls which are not over 4 feet (1219 mmy} in height measured from the
bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge.

4, Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000 galions
(18 927 L} and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2 to 1.

5. Sidewalks-and-driveways. PLATFORMS, WALKS AND DRIVEWAYS AT GRADE AND

WHICH ARE NOT PART OF AN ACCESSIBLE ROUTE.

Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish work.

Prefabricated swimming pools that are less than 24 inches {610 mm) deep.

Swings and other playground equipment.

Window awnings supported by an exterior walt which do not project more than 54

inches {1372 mm) from the exterior wall and do not require additional support.

© N oo



11. AGRICULTURAL BUILDINGS AS DEFINED HEREIN.

Section R105.5 is amended to read as follows:

R105.5 Expiration. EVERY PERMIT ISSUED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL UNDER THE PROVISION
OF THIS CODE SHALL EXPIRE 24 MONTHS AFTER THE DATE OF ISSUE. Every permit issued shall
become invalid unless the work on the site authorized by such permit is commenced within 180
days after its issuance, or if the work authorized by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a
period of 180 days after the time the work is commenced. The building official is authorized to
grant, in writing, one ermere extensions of time, for A periods OF not more than 180 days each.
The extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.

Section R106.1 is amended by adding new sections to read:

R106.1.4 PROOF OF WATER AND SEWER. THE APPLICANT SHALL PROVIDE DOCUMENTATION
FROM THE WATER AND SANITATION DISTRICT OF AN APPROVED WATER AND SEWER UTILITY
PLAN WHICH MAY INCLUDE PAYING THE REQUIRED WATER AND SEWER TAP FEES.

R106.1.5 EMERGENCY SERVICES IMPACT FEE. A DEVELOPER REQUESTING APPROVAL OF A
DEVELOPMENT ACTIVITY REQUIRING ADDITIONAL EMERGENCY SERVICES SHALL PAY THE
IMPACT FEE TO THE EMERGENCY SERVICES PROVIDED PRIOR TO ANY ISSUANCE OF A
BUILDING PERMIT BY THE TOWN. (TOWN ORDINANCE NO. 316, SERIES OF 2001}

R106.1.6 SINGLE FAMILY AND BUPLEX DEVELOPMENT iMPROVEMENTS AND FINANCIAL
GUARANTEES. EACH BUILDING PERMIT APPLICATION FOR A NEW SINGLE FAMILY DWELLING
SHALL BE ACCOMPANIED BY A SIGNED DEPOSIT AGREEMENT AND A TOTAL DEPOSIT OF
$2,000.00. (TOWN ORDINANCE NO. 335, SERIES OF 2003)

R106.1.7 PUBLIC AND PRIVATE IMPROVEMENTS AND FINANCIAL GUARANTEES. EACH
BUILDING PERMIT APPLICATION SUBMITTED FOR DEVELOPMENTS REQUIRING PUBLIC AND
PRIVATE IMPROVEMENTS SHALL BE ACCOMPANIED BY A TOWN COUNCIL APPROVED
SUBDIVISION OR DEVELOPMENT IMPROVEMENTS AGREEMENT ("AGREEMENT") AND A
LETTER OF CREDIT OR CASH DEPOSIT IN THE AMOUNT SPECIFIED IN THE AGREEMENT.

Section R106.3 is amended by adding two new subsections to read as follows:

R106.3.1.1 REQUIRED APPROVALS. THE APPLICATION AND DOCUMENTS FOR PERMIT SHALL
BE REVIEWED AND APPROVED BY THE DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING AND THE
DEPARTMENT OF PLANNING AND ZONING FOR COMPLIANCE WITH TOWN ORDINANCES.

R106.3.1.2 SURVEY REQUIREMENTS. AN IMPROVEMENT LOCATION CERTIFICATE (ILC) SHALL
BE REQUIRED FOR ALL NEW FOUNDATIONS WITHIN THE TOWN OF WINTER PARK. IF A
VARIANCE HAS BEEN GRANTED FOR THE PROPERTY THAT ALLOWS FOR CONSTRUCTION OF A
FOUNDATION WATHIN THE ESTABLISHED SETBACKS OR IF A FOUNDATION IS LOCATED WITHIN



FIVE FEET (5’) OF THE PROPERTY LINE, AN IMPROVEMENT SURVEY PLAT {ISP) SHALL BE
REQUIRED. THE ILC/ISP SHALL BE SUBMITTED TO THE TOWN OF WINTER PARK FOR REVIEW
AND APPROVAL PRIOR TO A ROUGH FRAMING INSPECTION BY THE TOWN.

Section R106.3.3 is amended to read as follows:

R106.3.3 Phased approval. The building official SHALL NOT ISSUE A PERMIT UNTH, THE
CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS FOR THE WHOLE BUILDING OR STRUCTURE HAVE BEEN

SUBMITTED AND APPROVED. isautherized-te-isste-a-permitforthe-constructionof

Section R108.2 is amended to read as follows:

R108.2 Schedule of permit fees. On buildings, structures, sleetrieal; gas, mechanical and
plumbing systems or alterations requiring a perm:t a fee for each perm;t shall be paad as

required, in accordance with-th dHe-a A v
TITLE 1, CHAPTER 11 OF THE TOWN CODE OF WINTER PARK. (ORD 420, SERIES OF 2009)

Section R108.5 is amended to read as follows:

R108.5 Refunds. The building official is authorized to establish a refund policy. THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL MAY AUTHORIZE REFUNDING OF NOT MORE THAN 80 PERCENT OF THE PERMIT FEE
PAID WHEN NOC WORK HAS BEEN DONE UNDER A PERMIT ISSUED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THIS
CODE. THE DEPOSIT PAID FOR A PERMIT APPLICATION IS NON-REFUNDABLE. THE BUILDING
OFFICIAL SHALL NOT AUTHORIZE REFUNDING OF ANY FEE PAID EXCEPT ON WRITTEN
APPLICATION FILED BY THE ORIGINAL PERMITTEE NOT LATER THAN 180 DAYS AFTER THE DATE

OF FEE PAYMENT.
Section R108.6 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

R108.6 Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences work requiring
a permit on a building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system before
obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to a fee established by the applicable governing
authority that shall be in addition to the required permit fees. THE INVESTIGATION FEE SHALL
BE AS SET FORTH IN TITLE 1 CHAPTER 11 OF THE TOWN CODE OF WINTER PARK.

Section 109.1.3 is amended by deleting in its entirety.




a¥al o a¥a ot arao Aacire my
5

basement-reguired-in-Section-R322. THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section R109 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

R109.5 REINSPECTIONS. A REINSPECTION FEE, AMOUNT PER TITLE 1 CHAPTER 11 TABLE 2B OF
THE TOWN CODE, MAY BE ASSESSED FOR EACH INSPECTION OR REINSPECTION WHEN SUCH
PORTION OF WORK FOR WHICH INSPECTION IS CALLED IS NOT COMPLETE OR WHEN
CORRECTIONS CALLED FOR ARE NOT MADE. REINSPECTION FEES MAY BE ASSESSED WHEN
THE INSPECTION RECORD CARD 15 NOT POSTED OR OTHERWISE AVAILABLE ON THE WORK
SITE, THE APPROVED PLANS ARE NOT READILY AVAILABLE TO THE INSPECTOR, FOR FAILING
TO PROVIDE ACCESS ON THE DATE FOR WHICH THE INSPECTION IS REQUESTED, OR
DEVIATING FROM THE APPROVED PLANS. IN INSTANCES WHERE REINSPECTION FEES HAVE
BEEN ASSESSED, NO ADDITIONAL INSPECTION OF THE WORK WILL BE PERFORMED UNTIL THE
REINSPECTION FEES HAVE BEEN RECEIVED BY THE BUILDING DEPARTMENT.

Section R110.1 is amended by adding an additional exception to read as follows:

R110.1 Use and Occupancy. No building or structure shall be used or occupied, and no change
in the existing occupancy classification of a building or structure or portion thereof shall be
made until the building official has issued a certificate of occupancy therefor as provided herein.
Issuance of a certificate of occupancy shall not be construed as an approval of a violation of the
provisions of This Code or of other ordinances of the jurisdiction. Certificates presuming to give
authority to violate or cancel the provisions of This Code or other ordinances of the jurisdiction

shall not be valid.

Exceptions

1. Certificates of occupancy are not required for work exempt from permits under Section
R105.2.

2. Accessory buildings of structures.

3. Group U Occupancy

Section R110 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

R110.1.7 FENAL INSPECTION. NO FINAL INSPECTION SHALL BE MADE BY THE TOWN BUILDING
INSPECTOR, AND NO CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY SHALL BE ISSUED UNLESS AN AUDIT HAS
EITHER BEEN COMPLETED BY THE MANAGER AND ALL SALES TAXES DUE HAVE BEEN PAID OR
ARRANGEMENTS THEREFOR MADE WITH THE TOWN MANAGER, OR THE TOWN MANAGER
HAS SPECIFICALLY WAIVED SUCH AUDIT. (TOWN ORDINANCE NO. 225, SERIES 1994, SECTION

3-2-18 {B3))
Section R112.1 is amended to read as follows:

R112.1 General. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or determinations
made by the building official OR FIRE CODE OFFICIAL relative to the application and



interpretation of This Code, there shall be and is hereby created a-board-ofappeals. THE
CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF APPEALS ESTABLISHED PURSUANT TO 6-1-2, 113
OF THE TOWN CODE OF WINTER PARK. The building official OR FIRE CODE OFFICIAL shall be an
ex officio member of said board but shall have no vote on any matter before the board. The
board of appeals shall be appointed by the governing body and shall hold office at its pleasure.
The board shali adopt rules of procedure for conducting its business, and shall render all
decisions and findings in writing to the appellant with a duplicate copy to the building officiaf OR

FIRE CODE OFFICIAL.

A NOTICE OF APPEAL SHALL BE ACCOMPANIED 8Y A FEE OF $250.00.

Section R112.2.1 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section R112.2.2 is amended by deleting in its entirety.




o aYal O30l a¥a

= THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section R202 is amended by adding the following definitions within the alphabetical order of the existing
definitions:

ACCESSORY DWELLING UN{T. AN ATTACHED OR DETACHED DWELLING UNIT SUBORDINATE
TO THE PRIMARY UNIT WHICH MAY INCLUDE A CARETAKER UNIT OR AN AFFORDABLE
HOUSING UNIT. AN ACCESSORY DWELLING UNIT SHALL NOT BE SUBDIVIDED AND/OR
SUBSEQUENTLY SOLD AS FEE SIMPLE OWNERSHIP. IT SHALL REMAIN AS PART OF THE
PROPERTY WHERE THE PRIMARY UNIT IS LOCATED.

AGRICULTURAL BUILDING. A STRUCTURE LOCATED ON REAL PROPERTY CLASSIFIED AS
AGRICULTURE BY THE GRAND COUNTY ASSESSOR THAT IS DESIGNED, CONSTRUCTED AND
USED TO HOUSE FARM IMPLEMENTS, HAY, GRAIN, POULTRY, LIVESTOCK OR OTHER
HORTICULTURAL PRODUCTS. THIS STRUCTURE SHALL NOT BE A PLACE OF HUMAN
HABITATION OR A PLACE OF EMPLOYMENT WHERE AGRICULTURAI PRODUCTS ARE
PROCESSED, TREATED OR PACKAGED, NOR SHALL IT BE A PLACE USED BY THE PUBLIC.

BEDROOM. A ROOM WHICH 1S DESIGNED AS A SLEEPING ROOM, A LOFT, A MEZZANINE IN
GROUP R OCCUPANCIES OR A ROOM OR AREA THAT CAN BE USED AS A SLEEPING ROOM AND
CONTAINS A CLOSET.

FACTORY BUILT BUILDING. A BUILDING WHICH IS ASSEMBLED IN A FACILITY THAT HAS BEEN
APPROVED BY THE STATE OF COLORADO, BUILT TO THE BUILDING, PLUMBING AND
MECHANICAL CODES AS ADOPTED BY THE COLORADC DIVISION OF HOUSING, WITH THE
WORK PERFORMED AT THE FACILITY INSPECTED BY AND BEARING THE COLORADO DIVISION
OF HOUSING IDENTIFICATION LABEL.

FIRE DEPARTMENT. THE CHIEF OFFICER OF EAST GRAND, GRANBY, GRAND FRE PROTECTION
DISTRICT, GRAND LAKE, HOT SULPHUR SPRINGS, AND KREMMLING FIRE PROTECTION
DISTRICTS, OR THE CHIEF OFFICER’S AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE.

H-4 ¥l om-agrgade-aanato-the-pve ga halaht o WV YT

HEIGHT, BUILDING. Fhe~ 3 : VEraE g
roofsurface: BUILDING HEIGHT. THE VERTICAL DISTANCE ABOVE A REFERENCE DATUM
MEASURED TO THE HIGHEST POINT OF A FLAT ROOF OR DECK LINE OF A MANSARD ROOF OR
THE MIDPOINT OF THE HIGHEST GABLE OF A PITCHED OR HIPPED ROOF, THE REFERENCE
DATUM SHALL BE SELECTED BY THE FOLLOWING, WHICHEVER YIELDS A GREATER HEIGHT OF A

BUILDING:



THE POINT OF THE LOWEST PRECONSTRUCTION ELEVATION ON ANY BUILDING FACE.
THE POINT OF THE LOWEST ELEVATION OF ANY BUILDING FACE.

THE ELEVATION OF THE LOWEST POINT OF ANY EXPOSED FOUNDATION OR WALL.

IF A SITE IS DISTURBED AFTER THE ADOPTION OF THIS SECTION, THE OWNER OF THE
PROPERTY WILL HAVE THE BURDEN OF PROVIDING PRECONSTRUCTION ELEVATION.

AW N R

THE HEIGHT OF A STEPPED OR TERRACED BUILDING IS THE MAXIMUM HEIGHT OF ANY
SEGMENT OF THE BUILDING USING BUILDING HEIGHT.

KITCHEN. Kitchen shall mean an area used, or designated to be used, for the preparation of
food. AROOM OR AREA THAT IS DESIGNATED TO BE USED FOR THE PREPARATION OF FOOD
WHICH CONTAINS MORE THAN ONE STANDARD SIZE KITCHEN APPLIANCE OR FIXTURE.

MANUFACTURED HOME. is repealed in its entirety and reenacted to read as follows:

MANUFACTURED HOME , A SINGLE FAMILY DWELLING WHICH IS PARTIALLY OR ENTIRELY
ASSEMBLED IN A FACTORY, 15 NOT LESS THAN TWENTY-FOUR FEET IN WIDTH AND THIRTY-SIX
FEET N LENGTH, IS INSTALLED ON AN ENGINEERED, PERMANENT FOUNDATION, HAS A BRICK,
WOOD OR COSMETICALLY EQUIVALENT EXTERIOR AND A PITCHED ROOF, IS CERTIFIED
PURSUANT TO THE “NATIONAL MANUFACTURED HOUSING CONSTRUCTION AND SAFETY
STANDARDS ACT OF 1974”7, 42 U.S.C. 5401 ET ESQ., AS AMENDED, AND BEARING THE H.U.D.
IDENTIFICATION LABEL. INSTALLED AND SET UP AS REQUIRED N THE SET UP MANUAL
SUPPLIED WITH THE MANUFACTURED HOME.

Table R301.2 {1} is amended to read as follows:
Table R301.2 (1)
Roof Snow Load

9,000 FEET ABOVE SEA LEVEL IS 98 POUNDS PER SQUARE FOOT
9,250 FEET ABOVE SEA LEVEL IS 105 POUNDS PER SQUARE FOOT
9,500 FEET ABOVE SEA LEVEL IS 113 POUNDS PER SQUARE FOOT
9,750 FEET ABOVE SEA LEVEL IS 120 POUNDS PER SQUARE FOOT
10,000 FEET ABOVE SEA LEVEL IS 128 POUNDS PER SQUARE FOOT
10,250 FEET ABOVE SEA LEVEL iS 136 POUNDS PER SQUARE FOOT
10,5C0 FEET ABOVE SEA LEVEL IS 145 POUNDS PER SQUARE FOOT
10,750 FEET ABOVE SEA LEVEL IS 154 POUNDS PER SQUARE FOOT

WIND IS NINETY (90) MILES PER HOUR

SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY IS “B”

WEATHERING PROBABILITY FOR CONCRETE IS SEVERE
FROST LINE DEPTH IS THIRTY INCHES (30")

TERMITE INFESTATION PROBABILITY NONE TO SLIGHT
DECAY PROBABLLITY IS NONE TO SLIGHT



WINTER DESIGN TEMPERATURE IS -16 DEGREES FAHRENHEIT
FLOOD HAZARDS, SEE FLOOD INSURANCE REFERENCE MAP

Table R301.5 is amended to read as follows:
Table R301.5

Balconies (exterior) and decks® 40 60
Sleeping rooms 3040

FOOT NOTE E. UNCOVERED DECKS AND BALCONIES SHALL BE DESIGNED TO A UNIFORMLY
DISTRIBUTED LIVE LOAD OF 60 LBS. PER SQUARE FOOT OR THE DESIGN SNOW LOAD
WHICHEVER {5 GREATER.

Section R302.3 is amended to read as follows:

R202.3 Two-family dweillings, Dwelling units in two-family dwellings shall be separated from
each other by wall and/or floor assemblies having not less than a d-hour 2-HOUR fire-resistance
rating when tested in accordance with ASTM E 119 or UL 263, Fire-resistance-rated floor-ceiling
and wall assemblies shall extend to and be tight against the exterior woll, and wall assembilies
shall extend from the foundation to the underside of the roof sheathing.

Exceptions:

. Mefice-resistancerating of b-hovrshal-be-permitted-in-buildings-cauipped-throughout
with-ga-autamaticsprinklersystem-ln-seeordansewith-MNERAL3,

4. 1. Wall assemblies need not extend through attic spaces when the ceilling is protected by

not less than 5/8-inch {15.9 mm) Type X gypsum beard and an ottic draft stop
canstructed as specified in Section R302.12.1 is provided above and aiong the wail
assembly separating the dwellings. The structural framing supporting the celling shall
also be protected by not less than ¥-inch {12.7 mm)} gypsum board or equivalent,

Section R305.1 is amended to read as follows:

R305.1 Minimum height. Habitable space, hallways, bathrooms, toilet rooms, laundry rooms
and pertiens-of UNFINISHED basements eentaining-these-spaces shall have a ceiling height of
not less than 7 feet (2134). THE REQUHRED HEIGHT SHALL BE MEASURED FROM THE FINISHED
FLOOR TO THE LOWEST PROJECTION FROM THE CEILING.

Exceptions:

1 For rooms with sioped ceilings, at least 50 percent of the required floor area of the
room must have a ceiling height of at least 7 feet (2134 mm) and no portion of the
required floor area may have a ceiling height of less than 5 feet {1524 mm).

2 Bathrooms shall have a minimum ceiling height of 6 feet 8 inches (2032 mm) at the
center of the front clearance area for fixtures as shown in Figure R307.1. The ceiling
height above fixtures shall be such that the fixture is capable of being used for its
intended purpose. A shower or tub equipped with a showerhead shall have a minimum



ceiling height of 6 feet 8 inches (2032 mm) above a minimum area 30 inches (762 mm)
by 30 inches (762 mm]) at the showerhead.

Section R305.1.1 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

{1931-mr)-ofthefinishedfleor: THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.
Section R306 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

R306.5 Sanitation at canstruction sites. TOILET FACILITIES SHALL BE PROVIDED FOR
CONSTRUCTION WORKERS AND SUCH FACILITIES SHALL BE CONVENIENTLY LOCATED AND
MAINTAINED IN A SANITARY CONDITION. THE FACILITIES SHALL BE AVAILABLE FROM THE
TIME THE FIRST WORK i5 STARTED UNTIL THE LETTER OF OGCCUPANCY OR CERTIFICATE OF
OCCUPANCY IS ISSUED.

Section R309.3 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

Code. THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section R310.1 is amended to read as follows:

R310.1 Emergency escape and rescue required. Basements, habitable attics and every sleeping
room, LOFT, MEZZANINE IN GROUP R OCCUPANCIES, OR A ROOM OR AREA THAT CAN BE
USED AS A SLEEPING ROOM AND CONTAINS A CLOSET shall have at least one operable
emergency escape and rescue opening. Where basements contain one or more sleeping rooms,
emergency egress and rescue openings shall be required in each sleeping room. Where
emergency escape and rescue openings are provided they shall have a sill height of not more
than 44 inches (1118 mm) above the floor. Where a door opening having a threshold below the
adjacent ground elevation serves as an emergency escape and rescue opening and is provided
with a bulkhead enclosure, the bulkhead enclosure shall comply with Section R310.3. The net
ctear opening dimensions required by this section shall be obtained by the normal operation of
the emergency escape and rescue opening from the inside. Emergency escape and rescue
openings with a finished sili height below the adjacent ground elevation shall be provided with a



window well in accordance with Section R310.2. Emergency escape and rescue openings shall
open directly into a public way, or to a yard or court that opens to a public way.

Section R311.7.4.3 is amended to read as follows:

R311.7.4.3 Profile. The radius of curvature at the noising shalil be no greater than 9/16 inch (14
mm}. A nosing not less than % inch (19 mm) but not more than 1 % inches (32 mm) shall be
provided on stairways with solid risers. The greatest nosing projection shall not exceed the
smallest nosing projection by more than 3/8 inch (2.5 mm) between two stories, including the
nosing at the level of floors and landings. Beveling of nosing shall not exceed % inch (12.7 mm).
Risers shall be vertical or sloped under the tread above from the underside of the nosing above
at an angle not more than 30 degrees (0.51 rad) from the vertical. Open risers are permitted,

Exceptions:
1. A nosing is not required where the tread depth is a minimum of 11 inches (279 mm).
2. The opening between adjacent treads is not limited on stairs with a total rise of 30

inches (762 mm) or less.

Section R313.2 is amended by deleting in its entirety:

REddd-Hae-and-bwe-family-dwellings-automatis-fre-systems|
sutematicresidential-fre-sprinldersystem-shall-bednstalied- M%MWMW@W»

EBseptiencAr-autematicresidential-fire-sprinkler system shali net bereguired foradditions-or
memgw@ww sFe-Rotatreac-providea-with-arsutoraticresidentiah-fire
sprinklersystern. THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section R313.2.1 is amended by deleting in its entirety:

Svdrd-Besign-andinstaliation—Automaticresidential fire-sprinklersystemsshali-be-designed
and-instaliedin-aecordance with-Secton-21004-0r NERALZE, THIS SUBSECTION DELETED,

Section R322 is amended by deleting in its entirety.
SectionR322 FLOOD-RESISTANT-CONSTRUCHON- THIS SECTION DELETED.
Section R403.1 is amended to read as follows:

R403.1 General. Al exterior walls shall be supported on continuous solid or fully grouted
masonry or concrete footings, crushed stone footings, wood foundations, or other approved
structural systems which shall be of sufficient design to accommodate all loads according to
Section R301 and to transmit the resulting loads to the scil within the limitations as determined
from the character of the soil. Footings shall be supported on undisturbed natural soils or
engineered fill. Concrete footing shall be designed and constructed in accordance with the
provisions of Section R403 or in accordance with ACt 332. EXCEPT WHERE ERECTED ON SOLID



ROCK OR OTHERWISE PROTECTED FROM FROST, FOUNDATION WALLS, PIERS AND OTHER
PERMANENT SUPPORTS OF BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES LARGER THAN 120 SQUARE FEET iN
AREA OR 10 FEET IN HEIGHT SHALL EXTEND TO AT LEAST 30 INCHES BELOW FINISHED GRADE,
AND SPREAD FOOTINGS OF 8 INCHES THICK X 16 iNCHES WIDE MINIMUM SIZE SHALL BE
PROVIDED TO PROPERLY DISTRIBUTE THE LOAD WITHIN THE ALLOWABLE LOAD-BEARING

VALUE OF THE SOIiL.

ALTERNATIVELY, SUCH STRUCTURES SHALL BE SUPPORTED ON PILES WHERE SOLID EARTH OR
ROCK IS NOT AVAILABLE. FOOTINGS SHALL NOT BEAR ON FROZEN SOILS. CONCRETE
FOOTINGS SHALL INCLUDE A MINIMUM OF TWO #4 REINFORCEMENT BARS TO BE TIED
CONTINUOQUSLY AND SPACED A MINIMUM OF TWO INCHES FROM THE GROUND AND
EQUALLY WITHIN THE FOOTING. FOOTINGS SHALL BE SO DESIGNED THAT THE ALLOWABLE
BEARING CAPACITY OF THE SOIL IS NOT EXCEEDED, AND THAT DIFFERENTIAL SETTLEMENT IS
MINIMIZED. THE MINIMUM WIDTH OF FOOTINGS SHALL BE 16 INCHES.

EXCEPTION: UNLESS DESIGNED AND STAMPED BY AN ENGINEER.

Section R403.1.1 is amended to read as follows:

R403.1.1 Minimum size.

V- o ad-a0 Ha-doad-be aVai

FabreR403-1-and-Haey ! HiH—HA Mg width WA pe-hased A-bed o
vatue-of-theseilHnaceordance-with-Fable-R401L.4-1. Spread footings shall be at feast & 8 inches
(#52-mm) in thickness. T. Footing projections, P, shall be at least 2 inches {51 mm)and shall not
exceed the thickness of the footing. Thesizeof-footingssupporting piersand-columns-shall-be

a AN

£ R Etabadanco A - a
v o cHJ

AfHOHE 4!

Footings for wood foundations shall be in accordance with the details set forth in Section
R403.2, and Figures R403.1(2) and R403.1{3).

Section R408.7 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

SUBSECTION DELETED.

Section R502.11 is amended to read as follows:

R502.11.1 Design. Wood trusses shall be designed in accordance with approved engineering
practice. The design and manufacture of metal plate connected wood trusses shall comply with
ANSI/TPI 1. The design drawings shall be prepared by a registered professional where required
by the statutes of the jurisdiction in which the project is to be constructed in accordance with



Section R106.1. THE USE OF LOAD DURATION FACTORS FOR SNOW LOAD OR SLOPE OF ROOF
SHALL BE PROHIBITED.

Section R602 is amended by adding two new exceptions to read as follows:

R602.2 Grade. Studs shall be a minimum No. 3, standard or stud grade lumber.

Exception:

1 Bearing studs not supporting floors and nonbearing studs may be utility grade lumber,
provided the studs are spaced in accordance with Table R602.3{5).

2 IN SINGLE FAMILY DWELLINGS OF LOG CONSTRUCTION, WALL LOGS NEED NOT BE
GRADED.

3 IN SINGLE FAMILY DWELLINGS OF LOG CONSTRUCTION, ALL STRUCTURAL LOGS MAY

BE DESIGNED BY A LICENSED COLORADO ARCHITECT OR ENGINEER AND INSPECTED BY
THAT ARCHITECT OR ENGINEER AFTER THE COMPLETION OF THE FRAMING WITH THE
ARCHITECT OR ENGINEER CERTIFYING TO THE BUILDING DEPARTMENT THAT THE LOGS
ARE OF THE SIZE, QUALITY AND SPECIES OF THE DESIGN AND THAT THEY WERE
INSTALLED TO THAT DESIGN. WALL LOGS NEED NOT BE PART OF THE STRUCTURAL
DESIGN.

Section R602.3 is amended to read as follows:

R602.3 Design and construction. Exterior walls of wood-frame construction shall be designed
and constructed in accordance with the provisions of this chapter and Figures R602.3{1) and
R602.3(2) or in accordance with AF&PAs NDS. THE USE OF LOAD DURATION FACTORS FOR
SNOW LOAD SHALL BE PROHIBITED. Components of exterior walls shall be fastened in
accordance with Tables R602.3(1) through R602.3(4). Structural wall sheathing shall be fastened
directly to structural framing members. Exterior wall coverings shall be capable of resisting the
wind pressures listed in Table R301.2(2) adjusted for height and exposure using table R301.2(3).
Wood structural panel sheathing used for exterior walls shall conform to the requirements of

Table R602.3(3).
Studs shall be continuous from support at the sole plate to a support at the top plate to resist
loads perpendicular to the wall. The support shall be a foundation of floor, ceiling or roof

diaphragm or shall be designed in accordance with accepted engineering practice.

Exception: Jack studs, trimmer studs and cripple studs at openings in wall that comply with
Table R502.5(1) and R502.5(2).

Section R612.2 is deleted in its entirety

Re122- Window-Sifs: THIS SUBSECTION DELETED.



Section R802.2 is amended to read as follows:

R802.2 Design and construction. The framing details required in Section R802 apply to roofs
having a minimum slope of three units vertical in 12 units horizontal (25-percent slope) or
greater. Roof-ceilings shall be designed and constructed in accordance with the provisions of
this chapter and Figures R606.11 (1), R606.11 {2} and R606.11 {3} or in accordance with
AFPA/NDS. THE USE OF LOAD DURATION FACTORS FOR SNOW LOAD SHALL BE PROHIBITED.
Components of roof-ceilings shail be fastened in accordance with Table R602.3 (1).

Section R802.10 is amended to read as follows:

R802.10.2 Design. Wood trusses shall be designed in accordance with accepted engineering
practice. The design and manufacture of metal-plate-connected wood trusses shall comply with
ANSI/TPI 1. The truss design drawings shall be prepared by a registered professional where
required by the statutes of the jurisdiction in which the project is to be constructed in
accordance with Section R106.1. THE USE OF LOAD DURATION FACTORS FOR SNOW LOAD OR
SLOPE OF ROOF SHALL BE PROHIBITED.

Section R803.2 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

R803.2.1.3 Wood structural panel sheathing thickness. A MINIMUM OF 5/8 INCH PLYWOOD,
PARTICLE BOARD OR WAFERWOOD SHALL BE USED ON ROOF RAFTERS OR ROOF TRUSSES
SPACED 24 INCHES ON CENTER iN ANY SNOW LOAD AREA.

WOOD STRUCTURAL PANEL ROOF SHEATHING SHALL BE BONDED BY EXTERIOR GLUE.

Section R903 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

R903.6 FALL PROTECTION. PERMIANENT FALL PROTECTION ANCHORS SHALL BE INSTALLED ON
ALL NEW CONSTRUCTION. ROOF ANCHORS OR SIMILAR DEVICES SHALL BE iINSTALLED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE MANUFACTURERS' INSTALLATION INSTRUCTIONS.

Section RS05 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

905.1.1 Ice barrier. AN ICE BARRIER THAT CONSISTS OF AN APPROVED SELF-ADHERING
POLYMER MOBIFIED BITUMEN SHEET SHALL BE USED IN LIEJ OF NORMAL UNDERLAYMENT
ON ALL SLOPED ROOFS. THIS ICE BAM PROTECTION UNDERLAYMENT SHALL BE INSTALLED
FRCM THE EAVES TO A POINT 6 FEET INSIDE THE EXTERIOR WALL LINE OF THE BUILDING AND
24 INCHES FROM THE CENTER LINE OF ALL VALLEYS, FULLY ADHERED TO THE SUBSTRATE ON
ALL HABITABLE STRUCTURES.

Exception: DETACHED ACCESSORY STRUCTURES THAT CONTAIN NO CONDITIGNED FLOOR
AREA.



R905.1.2 Snow-shed barriers. ROOFS SHALL BE DESIGNED TO PREVENT ACCUMULATIONS OF
SNOW FROM SHEDDING ABOVE OR IN FRONT OF GAS UTILITY OR ELECTRIC UTILITY METERS.

Sections R905.2.7.1, R905.4.3.1, R905.5.3.1, R905.6.3.1, R505.7.3.1, R905.8.3.1 are deleted in their

entirety.

Section R905.2.8.3 is amended by adding an exception to read as follows:

R905.2.8.3 Sidewall flashing. Flashing against a vertical sidewall shall be by the step-flashing
method. The flashing shall be a minimum of 4 inches (102 mm) high and 4 inches (102 mm)
wide. At the end of the vertical sidewali the step flashing shall be turned out in a manner that
directs water away from the wall and onto the roof and/or gutter,

EXCEPTIONS

1. SOLID FLASHING APPRCOVED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL
Section R905.4 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

R905.4.7 MECHANICAL BARRIERS. MECHANICAL BARRIERS INSTALLED TO PREVENT SNOW
SHEDDING FROM THE ROOF SHALL BE SECURED TO ROOF FRAMING MEMBERS OR TO SOLID
BLOCKING SECURED TO FRAMING MEMBERS IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE MANUFACTURER’S
INSTALLATION INSTRUCTIONS.

INDIVIDUAL DEVICES INSTALLED IN A GROUP OF DEVICES TO CREATE A BARRIER TO PREVENT
SNOW SHEDDING SHALL BE INSTALLED IN AT LEAST TWO ROWS WITH THE FIRST ROW NO
MORE THAN 24 INCHES FROM THE EDGE OF THE ROOF OR EAVE. THE ROWS SHALL BE
PARALLEL WITH THE EXTERIOR WALL LINE AND THE DEVICES IN EACH ROW SHALL BE
STAGGERED FOR A SPACING OF NO MORE THAN 24 INCHES ON CENTER MEASURED PARALLEL
WIiTH THE EXTERIOR WALL LINE.

CONTINUOUS SNOW BARRIERS SHALL BE SECURED TO ROOF FRAMING AT NO MORE THAN 48
INCHES ON CENTER. CONTINUOUS BARRIERS SHALL BE INSTALLED PARALLEL WITH THE



EXTERIOR WALL LINE AND NO MORE THAN 24 INCHES FROM THE EDGE OF THE ROOF OR
EAVE.

Section R905.10 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

R905.10.5.1 Mechanical barriers for metal roof shingles and metal roof panels. ROOFS WITH
METAL ROOF SHINGLES OR METAL ROOF PANELS SHALL BE DESIGNED SO AS TO PREVENT
ACCUMULATIONS OF SNOW FROM SHEDDING ONTO PEDESTRIAN AND VEHICULAR EXITS
FROM BUILDINGS AND ON TO SIDEWALKS, STREETS AND ALLEY WAYS.

MECHANICAL BARRIERS INSTALLED TO PREVENT SNOW SHEDDING FROM THE ROOF SHALL BE
SECURED TO ROOF FRAMING MEMBERS OR TO SOLID BLOCKING SECURED TO FRAMING
MEMBERS IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE MANUFACTURER’S INSTALLATION INSTRUCTIONS.

INDIVIDUAL DEVICES INSTALLED IN A GROUP OF DEVICES TO CREATE A BARRIER TO PREVENT
SNOW SHEDDING SHALL BE INSTALLED IN AT LEAST TWO ROWS WITH THE FIRST ROW NO
MORE THAN 24 INCHES FROM THE EDGE OF THE ROOF OR EAVE. THE ROWS SHALL BE
PARALLEL WITH THE EXTERIOR WALL LINE AND THE DEVICES IN EACH ROW SHALL BE
STAGGERED FOR A SPACING OF NO MORE THAN 24 INCHES ON CENTER MEASURED PARALLEL
WITH THE EXTERIOR WALL LINE.

CONTINUQUS SNOW BARRIERS SHALL BE SECURED TO ROOF FRAMING AT NO MORE THAN 48
INCHES ON CENTER. CONTINUOUS BARRIERS SHALL BE INSTALLED PARALLEL WITH THE
EXTERIOR WALL LINE AND NO MORE THAN 24 INCHES FROM THE EDGE OF THE ROOF OR
EAVE.

Section R907.3 is amended to read as follows:

R907.3 Recovering versus replacement. New roof coverings shall not be installed without first
removing all existing layers of roof coverings where any of the following conditions exist:

1. Where the existing roof or roof covering is water-soaked or has deteriorated to the
point that the existing roof or roof covering is not adequate as a base for additional
roofing.

2. Where the existing roof covering is wood shake, slate, clay, cement or asbestos-cement
tile.

3. Where the existing roof has twe-or MORE THAN ONE applications of any type of roof
covering.

4, For asphalt shingles, when the building is located in an area subject to moderate or

severe hail damage according to Figure R903.5.

Section R1001 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:



R1001.1.1 LIMITATION ON THE NUMBER: THE NUMBER OF APPROVED SOLID FUEL BURNING
APPLIANCES OR DEVICES WHICH MAY BE INSTALLED SHALL NOT EXCEED THE FOLLOWING
LIMITS:

1, DETACHED SINGLE-FAMILY DWELLING: ONE APPROVED SOLID FUEL BURNING
APPLIANCE OR DEVICE PER DWELLING.

2. BUILDING WITH TWO DWELLING UNITS: ONE APPROVED SOLID FUEL BURNING
APPLIANCE OR DEVICE PER DWELLING UNIT PROVIDED THE DWELLING UNIT 1S
GREATER THAN ONE THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED (1,500} SQUARE FEET IN TOTAL
LIVING AREA.

3. APARTMENTS, CONDOMINIUMS, COMMERCIAL, AND INDUSTRIAL BUILDINGS:
APARTMENTS, CONDOMINIUMS, COMMERCIAL, AND INDUSTRIAL BUILDINGS SHALL
BE ALLOWED TO INSTALL ONE APPROVED SOLID FUEL BURNING APPLIANCE OR
DEVICE IN A LOBBY OR OTHER COMMON AREA OF THE APARTMENT, CONDOMINIUM,
OR HOTEL. ONLY AN APPROVED NONSOLID FUEL BURNING APPLIANCE MAY BE
INSTALLED WITHIN ANY APARTMENT, CONDOMINIUM OR HOTEL/MOTEL ROOM.

Section R1004.4 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

G D )

& ke [Hed = > =

Ay

forsuchuse-in-accordance-with- UL 127 INSTALLATION OF UNVENTED GAS LOG HEATERS IS
PROHIBITED.

Section R1005 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

R1005.7 Factory built chimney enclosures. FACTORY-BUILT CHIMNEYS SHALL BE ENCLOSED
WITHIN A CONTINUOUS ENCLOSURE PROTECTED ON THE INTERIOR (CHIMNEY) SIDE BY NOT
LESS THAN 5/8 INCH TYPE-X GYPSUM WALLBOARD. JOINTS AND FASTENERS SHALL BE TAPED
AND FINISHED.

EXCEPTION: THE PORTION OF THE CHIMNEY LOCATED IN THE SAME ROOM AS THE
APPLIANCE AND THE PORTION OF THE CHIMNEY ABOVE THE FINISHED ROOF IS NOT
REQUIRED TO BE ENCLOSED.

FACTORY-BUILT CHIMINEYS SHALL BE EFFECTIVELY FIREBLOCKED WITHIN SUCH ENCLOSURE AT
EACH FLOOR-CEILING LEVEL AND AT THE ROOF. THE VERTICAL DISTANCE BETWEEN ADJACENT
FIREBLOCKING SHALL NOT EXCEED 10 FEET.

Section N1101.2 is amended to read as follows:



N1101.2 Compliance. Compliance shall be demonstrated by either meeting the requirements of
the 2006 International Energy Conservation Code or meeting the requirements of this chapter.
Climate zones from Figure N1101.2 or Table N1101.2 shall be used in determining the applicable

requirements from this chapter.
Section M1414 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

M1414.1.1 Fireplace stoves. DETACHED ONE-AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS MAY HAVE NO
MORE THAN ONE SOLID FUEL BURNING DEVICE PER PROPERTY. CONDOMINIJMS AND
APARTMENT HOUSES MAY HAVE ONE SOLID FUEL BURNING DEVICE LOCATED IN A LOBBY OR
OTHER MAIN COMMON AREA. FACTORY-BUILT FIREPLACES AND STOVES SHALL MEET E.P.A.
PHASE Il OR COLORADO PHASE Ili AIR QUALITY REQUIREMENTS.

Section M1415 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

M1415.1.1 Fireplace stoves, DETACHED ONE-AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS MAY HAVE NO
MORE THAN ONE SOLID FUEL BURNING DEVICE PER PROPERTY. CONDOMINIUMS AND
APARTMENT HOUSES MAY HAVE ONE SOLID FUEL BURNING DEVICE LOCATED IN A LOBBY OR
OTHER MAIN COMMON AREA. FACTORY-BUILT FIREPLACES AND STOVES SHALL MEET E.P.A,
PHASE # OR COLORADO PHASE 11l AIR QUALITY REQUIREMENTS.

Section G2404.7 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

Section G2406.2 in amended to read as follows:

G2406.2 (303.3) Prohibited locations. Applionces shail not be located in sleeping rooms,
bathrooms, toilet rooms, storage closets or surgical rooms, or in a space that opens only into
such rooms or spaces, except where the installation complies with one of the following:

1. The appliance is a direct-vent applignce installed in accordance with the conditions of
the listing and the manufacturer's instructions.
2. Vented room heaters, wall furnaces, vented decorative gppliances, vented gas

fireplaces, vented gas fireplace heaters and decorative gppfiances for installation in
vented solid fuel-burning fireplaces are installed in rooms that meet the required
volume criteria of Section G2407.5



5. The appliance is installed in a room or space that opens only into a bedroom or
bathroom, and such room or space is used for no other purpose and is provided with a
solid weatherstripped door equipped with an approved self-closing device. All
combustion air shall be taken directly from the outdoors in accordance with Section

G2407.6,
Section G2417.4.1 is amended to read as follows:

G2417.4.1 (406.4.1) Test pressure, The test pressure to be used shall not be less than one and
one-half times the proposed maximum working pressure, but not less than 3 10 psig (20kPa
gauge), irrespective of design pressure. Where the test pressure exceeds 125 psi (862 kPa
gauge), the test pressure shall not exceed a value that produces a hoop stress in the piping
greater than 50 percent of the specified minimum yield strength of the pipe.

Section G2425.8 is amended to read as follows:

G2425.8 (501.8) Appliance not required to be vented. The following appliances shail not be
required to be vented:;

Ranges

Built-in domestic cooking units listed and marked for optional venting.

Hot plates and laundry stoves.

Type 1 clothes dryers (Type 1 clothes dryers shalt be exhausted in accordance
with the requirements of Section G24339)

Refrigerators

6. Counter appliances

B

n




Section G2433 (603} is amended by deleting in its entirety.

G2433.1 (603.1) General. Loglighters-shall-be-tested-in-accordancewith- CSA 8 andshallbe
installedinaccordance with the manufacturedsinstallationtnstructions: INSTALLATION OF LOG
LIGHTERS IS PROHIBITED.

Section G2445 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

G2445.1 (621.1) General. PROHIBITED INSTALLATION. INSTALLATION OF UNVENTED ROOM
HEATERS IS PROHIBITED. Yavented-room-beaters-challbetosted-in-accordance with-ANSI

Section P2501.1 is amended to read as follows:

P2501.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall establish the general administrative
requirements applicabte to plumbing systems and inspection requirements of This Code. THE



INTENT OF THIS CODE IS TO MEET OR EXCEED THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE STATE OF
COLORADO PLUMBING COBDE. WHEN TECHNICAL REQUIREMENTS, SPECIFICATIONS, OR
STANDARDS IN THE COLORADO PLUMBING CODE CONFLICT WITH THIS CODE, THE MORE

RESTRICTIVE SHALL APPLY.

Section P2603.6.1 is amended to read as follows:

connection. Burfdmg sewers shall be a minimum of{-NJJMBE—R—} 48 mches {1219 2 mm) helow
grade.

Section P2904 is amended by deleting in its entirety.

P2804-Bwelling-Unit-Fire-Sprinkler-Systems. THIS SECTION DELETED

Section P3103.1 is amended to read as follows:

P3103.1 Roof extension. Open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be terminated at

{east-6-inches-{152-MM} 12 INCHES above the roof eréinches {152 mmiabove the anticipated
shew-acctmationwhicheveris-greater; except that where a roof is to be used for any purpose

other than weather protection, the vent extension shall be run at least 7 feet (2134 mm) above
the rocf. AND WITHIN TWENTY-FOUR INCHES (24") OF THE PEAK OF THE ROOF,

AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE

TOWN CODE 6-1-4: Code Amendments: The following sections of the International Plumbing Code,
adopted by reference in Town Code Section 6-1-1 hereqf, is hereby amended as follows:

Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the International Plumbing Code of THE TOWN
OF WINTER PARK, hereinafter referred to as This Code.

Section 101.3 is amended to read as follows:

101.3 Intent. The purpose of This Code is to provide minimum standards to safeguard life or
limb, health, property and public welfare by regulating and controliing the design, construction,
instaifation, quality of materials, location, operation and maintenance or use of plumbing
equipment and systems. THE INTENT OF THIS CODE IS TO MEET OR EXCEED THE
REQUIREMENTS OF THE STATE OF COLORADO PLUMBING CODE. WHEN TECHNICAL



REQUIREMENTS, SPECIFICATIONS OR STANDARDS IN THE COLORADO PLUMBING CODE
CONFLICT WITH THIS CODE, THE MORE RESTRICTIVE SHALL APPLY.

Section 103.2 is amended to read as follows:
103.2 Appeintment BUILDING OFFICIAL. SEE 6-1-2, 103.2
Section 103.3 is amended to read as follows:
103.3 Deputies. SEE 6-1-2, 103.3,
Section 103.4 is amended to read as follows:
103.4 Liability. SEE 6-1-2, 104.8.
Section 106.5.3 is amended to read as follows:
106.5.3 Expiration. SEE 6-1-2, 105.5.

Section 106.6.2 is amended to read as follows:

106.6.2 Fee schedule. The fees for plumbing work shall be as-indicated-inthe following
schedule IN ACCORDANCE WITH TITLE 1 CHAPTER 11 OF THE TOWN CODE.

Section 106.6.3 is amended to read as follows:

106.6.3 Fee refunds. The cede BUILDING official shall authorize the refunding of fees as

follows:
1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.
2. Not more than [SRECIEY-RERCENTAGE] 80 percent of the permit fee paid when no work

has been done under a permit issued in accordance with This Code.

3. Not more than{SPECIFY PERCENTAGE] 80 percent of the plan review fee paid when an
application for a permit for which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or

canceled before any plan review effort has been expended.

The eode BUILDING official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid, except upon
written application filed by the original permittee not later than 180 days after the date of fee

payment.
Section 106.6 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

106.5.4 REINSPECTIONS. A REINSPECTION FEE, AMOUNT PER TITLE 1 CHAPTER 11 TABLE 2B
OF THE TOWN CODE, MAY BE ASSESSED FOR EACH INSPECTION OR REINSPECTION WHEN
SUCH PORTION OF WORK FOR WHICH INSPECTION IS CALLED iS NOT COMPLETE OR WHEN
CORRECTIONS CALLED FOR ARE NOT MADE. REINSPECTION FEES MAY BE ASSESSED WHEN
THE INSPECTION RECORD CARD {5 NOT POSTED OR OTHERWISE AVAHLABLE ON THE WORK



SITE, THE APPROVED PLANS ARE NOT READILY AVAILABLE TO THE INSPECTOR, FOR FAILING
TO PROVIDE ACCESS ON THE DATE FOR WHICH THE INSPECTION IS REQUESTED, OR
DEVIATING FROM THE APPROVED PLANS. IN INSTANCES WHERE REINSPECTION FEES HAVE
BEEN ASSESSED, NO ADDITIONAL INSPECTION OF THE WORK WILL BE PERFORMED UNTIL THE
REINSPECTION FEES HAVE BEEN RECEIVED BY THE BUILDING DEPARTMENT.

Section 108.4 is amended to read as follows:
108.4 Violation penalties. Any person who shall viclate a provision of This Code or shall fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, aiter or repair plumbing
work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the eade BUILDING
official, or of a permit or certification issued under the provisions of This Code, shall be guilty of
a VIOLATION, punishable by a fine of not more than 1,800 dollars or by imprisonment not
exceeding ONE YEAR, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violaticn continues

after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense. IN ACCORDANCE WITH
TITLE 1 CHAPTER 4 OF THE TOWN CODE OF WINTER PARK.

Section 108.5 is amended to read as follows:
108.5 Stop work orders. SEE TOWN CODE 6-1-5, SECTION 108.5.
Section 109 is amended to read as follows:

109 Means of Appeal. SEE TOWN CODE 6-1-2, SECTION 113,

Section 305.6.1 is amended to read as follows:

305.6.1 Sewer depth. Building

Building sewers sha
Section 701.2 is amended to read as follows:

701.2 Sewer required. Every building in which plumbing fixtures are installed and all premises
having drainage piping shall be connected to a public sewer, where-available-er-an-gpproved

EXCEPTION: WHEN APPROVED BY TOWN COUNCIL.
Section 904.1 is amended to read as follows:

904.1 Roof extension. All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be terminated at
least INUBBER] 12 inches (304,.8 mm) above the roof, except that where a roof is to used for
any purpose gther than weather protection, the vent extensions shall be run at least 7 feet
{2134 mm') above the roof.



AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE

TOWN CODE 6-1-5: Code Amendments: The following sections of the International Mechanical Code,
adopted by reference in Town Code Section 6-1-1 hereof, is hereby amended as follows:

Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Mechanical Code of THE TOWN OF WINTER
PARK, herein after referred to as“This Code”

Section 103.2 is amended to read as follows:

103.2 Appeirtment BUILDING OFFICIAL. Thebuilding-official-shall-be-appointed-by-thechief
appeintingauthority-of thejurisdietion. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS HEREBY AUTHORIZED AND

DIRECTED TO ENFORCE ALL THE PROVISIONS OF TH!S CODE; HOWEVER, A GUARANTY THAT
ALL BUILDING AND STRUCTURES HAVE BEEN CONSTRUCTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH ALL THE
PROVISIONS OF THiS CODE IS NEITHER INTENDED NOR IMPLIED.

103.3 Deputies. In accordance with the prescribed procedures of this jurisdiction and-with-the
coneurrence-of the appeinrtingautherity, the code BUILDING official shall have the authority to
appoint a deputy eede BUILDING official, other related technical officers, inspectors and other
employees. Such employees shall have the powers as delegated by the cede BUILDING official.

Section 103.4 is amended to read as follows:

103.4 Liability. THE ADOPTION OF THIS CODE, AND ANY PREVIOUS BUILDING CODES
ADOPTED BY THE TOWN OF WINTER PARK, SHALL NOT BE DEEMED TO GIVE RISE TO A DUTY
OF CARE ON THE PART OF ANY PUBLIC ENTITY, PUBLIC EMPLOYEE OR AGENT, NOR SHALL THIS
CODE OR ANY PREVIOUS BUILDING CODES BE DEEMED TO CREATE ANY CIVIL REMEDY
AGAINST A PUBLIC ENTITY, PUBLIC EMPLOYEE OR AGENT. The esde BUILDING official, member
of board of appeals or employee charged with the enforcement of This Code, while acting for
the jurisdiction in good faith and without malice in the discharge of the duties required by This
Code or other pertinent law or ordinance, shall not thereby be rendered liable personally and is
hereby relieved from personal liability for any damages accruing to persons or property as a
result of any act or by reason of an act or omission in the discharge of official duties.

Any suit instituted against an officer or employee because of an act performed by that officer or
employee in the lawful discharge of duties under the provisions of This Code shall be defended
by legal representative of the jurisdiction until the final termination of the proceedings. The
cede BUILDING official or any subordinate shall not be liable for cost in any action, suit or
proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the provisions of This Code.



Section

Section

Section

Section

106.4.3 is amended to read as follows:

106.4.3 Expiration. EVERY PERMIT ISSUED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL UNDER THE PROVISION
OF THIS CODE SHALL EXPIRE 24 MONTHS AFTER THE DATE OF ISSUE. Every permit issued by
the code BUILDING official under the provisions of This Code shall expire by limitation and
bhecome null and void if the work authorized by such permit is not commenced within 180 days
from the date of such permit, or if the work authorized on the site by such permit is suspended
or abandoned at any time after the work is commenced for a period of 180 days. Before such
work recommences, a new permit shall first be obtained and the fee, therefore, shall be one-
haif the amount required for a new permit for such work, provided no changes have been made
or will be make in the original construction documents for such work, and provided further that
such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one year. THE EXTENSION SHALL BE
REQUESTED IN WRITING AND JUSTIFIABLE CAUSE DEMONSTRATED.

106.5.2 is amended to read as foliows:

106.5.2 Fee schedule. The fees for mechanical work shall be as-indicated-in-thefollowing
schedule IN ACCORDANCE WITH TITLE 1 CHAPTER 11 OF THE TOWN CODE OF WINTER PARK.

106.5.3 is amended to read as follows:

106.5.3 Fee refunds. The eede BUILDING official shall authorize the refunding of fees as

foliows:

The full amount of any fee paid hereunder which was erroneousiy paid or collected.
Not more than [SRECIEY PERCENTAGE] 80 percent of the permit fee paid when no work
has been done under a permit issued in accordance with This Code,

3. Not more than [SRECIFY PERCENTAGE] 80 percent of the plan review fee when an
application for a permit for which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or
canceled before any plan review effort has been expended.

The eade BUILDING official shail not authorize the refunding of any fee paid, except upon
written application filed by the original permittee not later than 180 days after the date of fee

payment,

106.5 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

106.5.4 REINSPECTIONS. A REINSPECTION FEE, AMOUNT PER TITLE 1, CHAPTER 11 TABLE 2B
OF THE TOWN CODE, MAY BE ASSESSED FOR EACH INSPECTION OR REINSPECTION WHEN
SUCH PORTION OF WORK FOR WHICH INSPECTION IS CALLED {5 NOT COMPLETE OR WHEN
CORRECTIONS CALLED FOR ARE NOT MADE. REINSPECTION FEES MAY BE ASSESSED WHEN
THE INSPECTION RECORD CARD IS NOT POSTED OR OTHERWISE AVAILABLE ON THE WORK
SITE, THE APPROVED PLANS ARE NOT READILY AVAHLABLE TO THE INSPECTOR, FOR FAILING



TO PROVIDE ACCESS ON THE DATE FOR WHICH THE INSPECTION IS REQUESTED, OR
DEVIATING FROM THE APPROVED PLANS. IN INSTANCES WHERE REINSPECTION FEES HAVE
BEEN ASSESSED, NO ADDITIONAL INSPECTION OF THE WORK WILL BE PERFORMED UNTIL THE
REINSPECTION FEES HAVE BEEN RECEIVED BY THE BUILDING DEPARTMENT.

Section 108.4 is amended to read as follows:

108.4 Viclation penalties. Any person who shall violate a provision of This Code or shali fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair
mechanical work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code
BUILDING official, or of a permit or certification issued under the provisions of This Code, shall
be guilty of a VIOLATION, punishable by a fine of not more than 1,000 dollars or by
imprisonment not exceeding ONE YEAR, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a
violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense. IN
ACCORDANCE WITH TITLE 1 CHAPTER 4 OF THE TOWN CODE OF WINTER PARK.

Section 108.5 is amended to read as follows:

108.5 Stop work orders. Upon notice from the eede BUILDING official that mechanical work is
being done contrary to the provisions of This Code or in a dangerous or unsafe manner, such
work shall immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of
the property, or to the owner's agent, or to the person doing the work. The notice shall state the
conditions under which work is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the code
BUILDING official shall not be required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work. Any

Section 109 is amended toc read as follows:

109.1 Application for appeal. A person shall have the right to appeal a decision of the esde
BUILDING official OR FIRE CODE OFFiCIAL to the CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF
APPEALS ESTABLISHED PURSUANT TO 6-1-2, 113 OF THE TOWN CODE OF WINTER PARK. board
ofappeals: An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the true intent of This Code
or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of This
Code do not fully apply, or an equally good or better form of construction is proposed. The
application shall be filed on a form obtained from the eede BUILDING official OR FIRE CODE
OFFICIAL within 20 days after the notice was served. NOTICE OF APPEAL SHALL BE
ACCOMPANIED BY A FEE OF $250.00.

Section 903.3 is repealed in its entirety and reenacted to read as follows.



903.3 Unvented gas log heaters. Anunventedgaslog heatershallnotbe installed inafactery

Framn ot £ AV p2rd eyt Lryealeasd Fey

ky r) = o »
= i = = rEJ {1

use-inaccordance-with-bUk-127. UNVENTED GAS LOG HEATERS ARE PROHIBITED. (ORD. 396,
SERIES OF 2007)

AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE

TOWN CODE 6-1-6: Code Amendments: The following sections of the International Fuel Gas Code,
adopted by reference in Town Code Section 6-1-1 hereof, is hereby amended as follows:

Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fuel Gas Code of THE TOWN OF WINTER
PARK, herein referred to as“This Code’”

Section 103.2 is amended to read as follows:

103.2 Appeintment BUILDING OFFICIAL. Fhecodeofficialshallbeappeointed-bythechief

appeintingautherityef thejurisdiction. THE BUILDING OFFICIAL IS HEREBY AUTHORIZED AND
DIRECTED TO ENFORCE AlLL THE PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE; HOWEVER, A GUARANTY THAT

ALL BUILDING AND STRUCTURES HAVE BEEN CONSTRUCTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH ALL THE
PROVISIONS OF THIS CODE IS NEITHER INTENDED NOR IMPLIED.

Section 103.3 is amended to read as follows:

103.3 Deputies. In accordance with the prescribed procedures of this jurisdiction and-with-the
concurrence-of the appeinting-autherity, the eade BUILDING official shali have the authority to
appoint a deputy esde BUILDING official, other refated technical officers, inspectors and other
employees. Such employees shall have the powers as delegated by the eede BUILDING official.

Section 103.4 is amended to read as follows:

103.4 Liability. THE ADOPTION OF THIS CODE, AND ANY PREVIOUS BUILDING CODES
ADOPTED BY THE TOWN OF WINTER PARK, SHALL NOT BE DEEMED TO GIVE RISE TO A DUTY
OF CARE ON THE PART OF ANY PUBLIC ENTITY, PUBLIC EMPLOYEE OR AGENT, NOR SHALL THIS
CODE OR ANY PREVIOUS BUILDING CODES BE DEEMED TO CREATE ANY CIVIL REMEDY
AGAINST A PUBLIC ENTITY, PUBLIC EMPLOYEE OR AGENT. The eade BUILDING official, member
of board of appeals or employee charged with the enforcement of This Code, while acting for
the jurisdiction in good faith and without malice in the discharge of the duties required by This
Code or other pertinent law or ordinance, shall not thereby be rendered liable personaily, and is
hereby relieved from personal liability for any damages accruing to persons or property as a
result of an act or by reason of an act or omission in the discharge of official duties.



Section

Section

Section

Section

Any suit instituted against an officer or employee because of an act performed by that officer or
employee in the lawful discharge of duties under the provisions of This Code shall be defended
by legal representative of the jurisdiction until the final termination of the proceedings. The
eode BUILDING official or any subordinate shalf not be liable for cost in any action, suit or
proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the provisions of This Code.

106.4.3 is amended to read as follows:

106.4.3 Expiration. EVERY PERMIT ISSUED BY THE BUILDING OFFICIAL UNDER THE PROVISION
OF THIS CODE SHALL EXPIRE 24 MONTHS AFTER THE DATE OF ISSUE. Every permit issued by
the ede BUILDING official under the provisions of This Code shall expire by limitation and
become null and void if the work authorized by such permit is not commenced within 180 days
from the date of such permit, or is suspended or abandoned at any time after the work is
commenced for a period of 180 days. Before such work recommences, a new permit shall be
first obtained and the fee, therefor, shall be one-haif the amount required for a new permit for
such work, provided no changes have been made or wiil be make in the original construction
documents for such work, and further that such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded
one year. THE EXTENSION SHALL BE REQUESTED IN WRITING AND JUSTIFIABLE CAUSE

DEMONSTRATED.

106.6.2 is amended to read as follows:

106.6.2 Fee schedule, The fees for work shall be asindicatedinthe followingschedule IN
ACCORDANCE WITH TITLE 1 CHAPTER 11 OF THE TOWN CODE OF WINTER PARK.

106.6.3 is amended to read as follows:

106.6.3 Fee refunds. The code BUILDING official shall authorize the refunding of fees as
follows:

1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected.

2. Not more than [SPECIFY-PERCENTAGE] 80 percent of the permit fee paid when no work
has been done under a permit issued in accordance with This Code.,

3. Not more than{SRECHY-RERCENTAGE] 80 percent of the plan review fee paid when an
application for a permit for which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or

canceled before any plan review effort has been expended.

The eede BUILDING official shail not authorize the refunding of any fee paid, except upon
written application filed by the original permittee not later than 180 days after the date of fee

payment.

107.2 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

107.2.1.1 REINSPECTIONS. A REINSPECTION FEE, AS SPECIFIED IN TITLE 1, CHAPTER 11 OF THE
TOWN CODE, MAY BE ASSESSED FOR EACH INSPECTION OR REINSPECTION WHEN SUCH



PORTION OF WORK FOR WHICH INSPECTIONS IS CALLED IS NOT COMPLETE OR WHEN
CORRECTIONS CALLED FOR ARE NOT MADE. REINSPECTION FEES MAY BE ASSESSED WHEN
THE INSPECTION RECORD CARD IS NOT POSTED OR OTHERWISE AVAILABLE ON THE WORK
SITE, THE APPROVED PLANS ARE NOT READILY AVAILABLE TO THE INSPECTOR, FOR FAILING
TO PROVIDE ACCESS ON THE DATE FOR WHICH THE INSPECTION IS REQUESTED, CR FOR
DEVIATING FROM PLANS REQUIRING THE APPROVAL OF THE BUILPING OFFICIAL. IN
INSTANCES WHERE REINSPECTION FEES HAVE BEEN ASSESSED, NO ADDITIONAL INSPECTION
OF WORK WILL BE PERFORMED UNTIL THE REINSPECTION FEES HAVE BEEN COLLECTED BY THE
BUILDING DEPARTMENT.

Section 108.4 is amended to read as follows:

108.4 Violation penalties. Any person who shall violate a provision of This Code or shall fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or eract, install, alter or repair work in violation of
the approved construction documents or directive of the cede BUILDING official, or of a permit
or certification issued under the provisions of This Code, shall be guilty of a VIOLATION,
punishable by a fine of not more than 1,000 dollars or by imprisonment not exceeding ONE
YEAR, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice
has been served shall be deemed a separate offense. IN ACCORDANCE WITH TITLE 1 CHAPTER

4 OF THE TOWN CODE OF WINTER PARK.

Section 108.5 is amended to read as follows:

108.5 Stop work orders. Upon notice from the eede BUILDING official that work is being done
contrary to the provisions of This Code or in a dangerous or unsafe manner, such work shall
immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the
property, the owner's agent, or the person doing the work. The notice shall state the conditions
under which work is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the cade BUILDING
official shall not be required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work. Amypersen-whe

Section 109 is repealed in its entirety and reenacted to read as follows:

SECTION 109 BOARD OF APPEALS

109.1 Application for appeal. A person shall have the right to appeal a decision of the code
BUILDING official to the CONSTRUCTION AND FIRE CODE BOARD OF APPEALS ESTABLISHED
PURSUANT TO 6-1-2, 113 OF THE TOWN CODE OF WINTER PARK. beard-efappeals. An
application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the true intent of This Code or the rules
legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of This Code do
not fully apply, or an equally good or better form of construction is proposed. The application
shall be filed on a form obtained from the cede BUILDING official within 20 days after the notice
was served. NOTICE OF APPEAL SHALL BE ACCOMPANIED BY A FEE OF $250.00.



Section 303.3 is amended to read as follows:

303.3 Prohibited locations. Appliances shali not be located in sleeping rooms, bathrooms, toilet
rooms, storage closets or surgical rooms, or in a space that opens only into such rooms or
spaces, except where the installation complies with one of the following:

1. The appliance is a direct-vent appliance installed in accordance with the conditions of the listing
and the manufacturer's instructions.
2. Vented room heaters, wall furnaces, vented decorative appliances, vented gas fireplaces, vented

gas fireplace heaters and deccrative appliances for installation in vented solid fuel-burning

2 - () AMl . The hadranm Iy oo ha e ad-volm 5 A

5. The appliance is installed in a room or space that opens only into a bedroom or bathroom, and
such room or space is used for no other purpose and is provided with a solid weatheestripped
door equipped with an approved self-closing device. All combustion air shall be taken directly
from the outdoors in accordance with Section 304.5.

Section 406.4.1 is amended to read as follows:

406.4.1 Test Pressure. The test pressure to be used shall not be no less 1% times the proposed

maximum working pressure, but not less than 3-{20-kPa-gauge} 10 PSIG, irrespective of design
pressure. Where the test pressure exceeds 125 psig {862 kPa gauge), the test pressure shall not
exceed a value that produces a hoop stress in the piping greater than 50 percent of the specified

minimum yield strength of the pipe.
Section 501.8 is amended to read as follows:

501.8 Appliances not required to be vented. The following appliances shall not be required to

be vented:

1. Ranges

2. Built-in domestic cooking units /isted and marked for optional venting.

3. Hot plates and {faundry stoves.

4. Type 1 clothes dryers (Type 1 clothes dryers shall be exhausted in accordance with the

requirements of Section 614.)

5. A single booster type automatic instantaneous water heater, where designed and used
solely for the sanitizing rinse requirements of a dishwashing machine, provided that the
heater is instailed in a commercial kitchen having a mechanical exhaust system. Where
installed in this manner, the draft hood, is required, shall be in place and unaltered and
the draft hood outfet shall be not less than 36 inches {914 mm) vertically and 6 inches
(152 mm) horizontally from any surface other than the heater.

6. Refrigerators

7. Counter appliances

8—————Room-heatessfistedfor-unvented-use:



9 8. Direct-fired make-up air heaters
48 9. Other equipment fisted for unvented use and not provided with flue collars.
41 10. Specialized equipment of limited input such as laboratory burners and gas lights.

Section 603.1 is amended to read as follows:

603.1 General. Log lighters shallbe-tested-inaccordance with-CSA-8and-beinstalledin
aceerdance-with-the-manufacturedsinstallationinstructions ARE PROHIBITED.

Section 621.1 is repealed in its entirety and reenacted to read as follows:

621.1 General PROHIBITED INSTALLATION. INSTALLATION OF UNVENTED ROOM HEATERS IS
PROHIBITED. Unventedroom-heaters shall-be-testad in-accordance with Al

AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CODE

TOWN CODE 6-1-7: Code Amendments: The following sections of the International Energy Code,
adopted by reference in Town Code Section 6-1-1 hereof, is hereby amended as follows:
Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. This Code shall be known as the International Energy Conservation Code of THE
TOWN OF WINTER PARK, and shall be cited as such. It is referred to herein as "This Code?

Section 109.3 is amended to read as follows:
109.3 Violation penalties. Persons who shall viclate a provision of This Code or shall fail to

comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, instail, alter or repair or do
work in viclation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official OR



BUILDING QFFICIAL, or of a permit or certification used under the provisions of This Code, shall
be guilty of a VIOLATION, punishable by a fine of not more than 1,000 dollars or by
imprisonment not exceeding ONE YEAR, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a
violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense. IN
ACCORDANCE WITH TITLE 1 CHAPTER 4 OF THE TOWN CODE OF WINTER PARK.

Section 506.1 is amended to read as follows:

506.1 General. The proposed design complies with this section provided that;

1. Sections 502 .4, 502.5, 503.2, 504 505.2, 505.3, 505.4, 505.6 505.7 are each satisfied, and

2. Annual energy costs of the proposed design as determined in accordance with Section
506.3 do not exceed those of the standard design as determined in accordance with
Section 506 .4.

B. EXEMPTIONS: THE FOLLOWING BUILDINGS ARE EXEMPT FROM PROVISIONS OF THE
ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE ADOPTED HEREIN:

1. ANY BUILDING THAT IS OTHERWISE EXEMPT FROM THE PROVISIONS OF THE BUILDING
CODE ADOPTED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL IN WHICH THE TOWN 1S LOCATED AND
BUILDINGS THAT DO NOT CONTAIN A CONDITIONED SPACE.

2, ANY BUILDING THAT DOES NOT USE EITHER ELECTRICITY OR FOSSIL FUELS FOR
COMFORT HEATING. A BUILDING WILL BE PRESUMED TO BE HEATED BY ELECTRICITY
EVEN IN THE ABSENCE OF EQUIPMENT USEDP FOR ELECTRIC COMFORT HEATING IF THE
BUILDING IS PROVIDED WITH ELECTRICAL SERVICE IN EXCESS OF ONE HUNDRED (100)
AMPS, UNLESS THE CODE ENFORCEMENT OFFICIAL OF THE TOWN DETERMINES THAT
THE ELECTRICAL SERVICE 1S NECESSARY FOR A PURPOSE OTHER THAN FOR PROVIDING
ELECTRIC COMFORT FOR HEATING.

3. HISTORIC BUILDINGS THAT ARE LISTED ON THE NATIONAL REGISTER OF HISTORIC
PLACES OR COLORADO STATE REGISTER OF HISTORIC PROPERTIES AND BUILDINGS
THAT HAVE BEEN DESIGNATED AS HISTORICALLY SIGNIFICANT OR THAT HAVE BEEN
DEEMED ELIGIBLE FOR DESIGNATION BY A LOCAL GOVERNING BODY THAT IS
AUTHORIZED TO MAKE SUCH DESIGNATIONS.

4, ANY BUILDING THAT 1S EXEMPT PURSUANT TO THE ENERGY CODE.

AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

TOWN CODE 6-1-8: Code Amendments: The following sections of the International Fire Code, adopted
by reference in Town Code Section 6-1-1 hereof, is hereby amended as follows:

Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:



101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of THE TOWN OF WINTER PARK,
hereinafter referred to as“This Code”

Section 101.2.1 is amended to read as follows:

101.2.1 Appendices. ; 3pE 3 3
PROVISIONS IN THE APPENDICES ARE SPECIFICALLY ADOPTED.

Section 103.2 is amended to read as follows:
103.2 Appointment. BUILDING AND OR FIRE CODE OFFICIAL. SEE 6-1-2, 103.2.
Section 103.3 is amended to read as follows:
103.3 Deputies. SEE 6-1-2, 103.3.
Section 103.4 is amended to read as follows:
103.4 Liability. SEE 6-1-2, 104.8.
Section 105.3.1 is amended to read as follows:
105.3.1 Expiration, SEE 6-1-2, 105.5.
Section 106.2 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows:

106.2.1.1 REINSPECTIONS. A REINSPECTION FEE, AS SPECIFIED IN TITLE 1, CHAPTER 11 OF THE
TOWN CODE, MAY BE ASSESSED FOR EACH INSPECTION OR REINSPECTION WHEN SUCH
PORTION OF WORK FOR WHICH INSPECTIONS IS CALLED IS NOT COMPLETE OR WHEN
CORRECTIONS CALLED FOR ARE NOT MADE. REINSPECTION FEES MAY BE ASSESSED WHEN
THE INSPECTION RECORD CARD IS NOT POSTED OR OTHERWISE AVAILABLE ON THE WORK
SITE, THE APPROVED PLANS ARE NOT READILY AVAILABLE TO THE INSPECTOR, FOR FAILING
TO PROVIDE ACCESS ON THE DATE FOR WHICH THE INSPECTION 1S REQUESTED, OR FOR
DEVIATING FROM PLANS REQUIRING THE APPROVAL OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL AND OR FIRE
CODE OFFICIAL. N INSTANCES WHERE REINSPECTION FEES HAVE BEEN ASSESSED, NO
ADDITIONAL INSPECTION OF WORK WILL BE PERFORMED UNTIL THE REINSPECTION FEES
HAVE BEEN COLLECTED BY THE BUILDING DEPARTMENT OR FIRE DEPARTMENT. (FIRE
DEPARTMENT - EAST GRAND FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT NO. 4, PLAN REVIEW & INSPECTION
FEE SCHEDULE)

Section 108 is repealed in its entirety and reenacted to read as follows:

108.1 BOARD OF APPEALS ESTABLISHED. A PERSON SHALL HAVE THE RIGHT TO APPEAL A
DECISION OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL AND FIRE CODE OFFICIAL TO THE CONSTRUCTICN AND
FIRE CODE BOARD OF APPEALS ESTABLISHED PURSUANT TO 6-1-2, 113 GF THE TOWN CODE

OF WINTER PARK.

NOTICE OF APPEAL SHALL BE ACCOMPANIED BY A FEE OF $250.00.



Section 114 added as new section to read as follows:

114 WATER FLUSHING. THE FIRE CHIEF OR FIRE CODE OFFICIAL, SHALL BE AUTHORIZED TO
WITNESS, ACCEPT, OR APPROVE FLUSHING AND FLOW TESTING OF A WATER SYSTEM
SUPPLYING WATER FOR ALL FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS.

That the limits referred to in certain sections of the 2009 International Fire Code are hereby established

as follows:

Section 3204.3.1.1.3 Location. Centainerseferyogenicfuidsshatlnotbelocatedwithin-diked

areas-cohtaining-eother-hazardous-materials: ANY AMOUNT OF STORAGE OF FLAMMAGBLE
CRYOGENIC FLUIDS IS PROHIBITED.

Section 3404.2.9.6.1 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited. StorageofClass

CLASS 1 AND CLASS 11 LIQUIDS IN ABOVE GROUND TANKS OUTS!DE OF BUILDINGS IS
RESTRICTED TO 250 GALLONS OR LESS.

EXCEPTION: WHEN A PERMIT HAS BEEN ISSUED BY THE FIRE CHIEF.

Section 3406.2.4.4 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohlblted Ste;age—ef—etass—l—aﬂel

- w-a5-tetHe A - STORAGE GF
CLASS | AND CLASS Il LIQUIDS IN ABOVE GROUND TANKS IS RESTRICTED TO 250 GALLONS OR
LESS.

EXCEPTION: WHEN A PERMIT HAS BEEN ISSUED BY THE FIRE CHIEF.

Section 3506.2. Limitations. Sterag&ef—ﬂamma—bleeryegeﬂ%ﬁhﬂdwkstanenaweemmeﬁ

#rtemai—reﬂa-l—ﬁre—eeée—en—page—xﬂ# ANY AMOUNT OF STORAGE OF FLAMMABLE CRYOGENIC

FLUIDS IS PROHIBITED.

Section 3804.2 Maximum capacnty within estahlished limits. Wﬁhi-ﬂ-t—hé—h-ﬁﬂ&&&t&bh—&#md—by

a 2 a - ) o) atada e 0 afals a
= - > < il = = HoH

9f—2—999—gal-len5—{—757—9|.—)— STORAGE OF LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM GAS IS RESTRICTED TO 2,000
GALLONS OR LESS.

Section A101.2 is amended to read as follows:



A101.2 MEMBERSHIP. The membership of the APPEALS board shall consist of five voting
members, THREE OF WHICH having the qualifications established by this section. Members
shall be nominated by the BUILDING OFFICIAL, fire code official or the chief administrative
officer of the RESPECTIVE jurisdiction, subject to confirmation by a majority vote of the
governing body. Membersshall-serve-without-remuneration-orcompensation—and

) )
O =~ = cHzti b rid = M-t - t

REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL WITH ELECTRICAL ENGINEERING EXPERIENCE OR AN
ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR WITH AT LEAST TEN YEARS EXPERIENCE, FIVE OF WHICH SHALL
HAVE BEEN IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE OF WORK.

safety- REGISTERED DESIGN PROFESSIONAL WITH MECHANICAL AND PLUMBING EXPERIENCE
OR A MECHANICAL CONTRACTOR WITH AT LEAST TEN YEARS EXPERIENCE, FIVE OF WHICH
SHALL HAVE BEEN IN RESPONSIBLE CHARGE OF WORK,

D102.1 is amended to read as follows:

D102.1 Access and loading. Facilities, buildings or portions of buildings hereafter constructed
shall be accessible to fire department apparatus by way of an approved fire apparatus access
road with asphalt, concrete, or other approved driving surface capable of supporting the
imposed load of fire apparatus weighing at least 84,000 75,600 pounds (34-050-kg),



INTRODUCED, APPROVED ON FIRST READING, AND ORDERED PUBLISHED IN SUMMARY this 21%
day of May, 2013. A public hearing shall be held at the regular meeting of the Town Council of

the Town of Winter Park, Colorado, on the 4™ day of lune, 2013 or as soon thereafter as
possible, at the Winter Park Town Hail.

TOWN OF WINTER PARK
mes F. Myers, Ma\,/
ATTEST:

i,

_ *““\“\tﬁf "W W ,]Z“g""o
2 STTTNE
S L7 S .

Katie Buss, Town Clerk i

0 A%
%, d~9ﬁp@§§?

e, et
' o S
”, i‘ O P&Q\‘\\

ey
'3
"r:;;mm“‘m‘

READ, ADOPTED AND ORDERED PUBLISHED IN SUMMARY on second and final reading by a vote
of £f to on the 4th day of June, 2013.

TOWN OF WINTER PARK

ATTEST:




