CHAPTER 18 Building Regulations
CHAPTER 18 Building Regulations
ARTICLE I - International Building Code 
ARTICLE II - Building Moving and Demolition 
ARTICLE III - Blasting and Use of Explosives 
ARTICLE IV - Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings 
ARTICLE V - Building Maintenance and Preservation of Rated and Contributing Structures 
ARTICLE VI - Flood Damage Prevention 
ARTICLE VII - Standards and Specifications for Design and Construction 
ARTICLE I International Building Code [1] 
Sec. 18-1-10. Title.
Sec. 18-1-20. Codes adopted.
Sec. 18-1-30. Jurisdiction defined.
Sec. 18-1-40. Penalty.
Sec. 18-1-50. Additions and modifications.


[bookmark: BK_9EBA678AFF09388A41A7206C04B9486E]Sec. 18-1-10. Title.
The provisions of the ordinance codified herein shall be known and cited collectively as the "City of Central Building Code" or "International Codes." 
(Ord. No. 15-03, § 1, 2015)
[bookmark: BK_678786A64630978C53B11323550371AF]Sec. 18-1-20. Codes adopted.
(a)	The City adopts by reference the following codes:
(1)	International Building Code, 2015 Edition, with certain appendices as hereafter set out (published by the International Code Council, Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795). 
(2)	International Fire Code, 2015 Edition (published by the International Code Council, Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795); 
(3)	International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings, 2015 Edition, with certain appendices as hereafter set out (published by the International Code Council, Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795); 
(4)	International Mechanical Code, 2015 Edition, with certain appendices as hereafter set out (published by the International Code Council, Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795); 
(5)	International Plumbing Code, 2015 Edition, with certain appendices as hereafter set out (published by the International Code Council, Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795); 
(6)	International Energy Conservation Code, 2015 Edition, with certain appendices as hereafter set out (published by the International Code Council, Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795); 
(7)	International Existing Building Code, 2015 Edition, with certain appendices as hereafter set out (published by the International Code Council, Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795); 
(8)	International Fuel Gas Code, 2015 Edition, with certain appendices as hereafter set out (published by the International Code Council, Inc., 4051 West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills, IL 60478-5795); 
(b)	The subject matter of the aforementioned codes concern regulations to provide minimum standards to safeguard life or limb, property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, construction, quality of materials, use and occupancy, location and maintenance of all buildings, structures, plumbing systems and mechanical systems in the City. Unless otherwise noted, the adoption includes all supplements to the codes. 
(Ord. No. 15-03, § 1, 2015)
[bookmark: BK_22D6B7AC0E4CF3912A21862226AB7272]Sec. 18-1-30. Jurisdiction defined.
(a)	Whenever the word jurisdiction is used in the International Building Code, it shall be held to mean that area included within the corporate limits of the City or any area hereafter annexed to the City. 
(b)	Unless otherwise established by resolution of the City Council, the Board of Appeals provided for in the International Building Code to hear appeals relating to the International Codes shall be the City Council. 
(Ord. No. 15-03, § 1, 2015)
[bookmark: BK_F7C59D6F4B89303D34BC9E052BD9734E]Sec. 18-1-40. Penalty.
It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect, construct, enlarge, alter, demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any building or structure or cause to permit the same to be done in violation of any of the International Codes adopted in this Chapter. In addition to other sanctions set forth in the adopted International Codes, a person or entity who violates the provisions of any such International Code shall be subject to the penalties as set forth in Section 1-4-20 of this Code. 
(Ord. No. 15-03, § 1, 2015)
[bookmark: BK_01B017E97BB87E462AFD229649A5772E]Sec. 18-1-50. Additions and modifications.
(1) 	Amendments to the International Building Code 
(a)	Section 101.1 of the International Building Code is amended to read as follows:
101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Building Code of the City of Central, hereinafter referred to as 'this code'. 
NOTE: For the purposes of the City of Central Building Code, the administrative provisions of the International Building Code, International Residential Code, International Mechanical Code, International Plumbing Code, International Fuel Gas Code, International Energy Conservation Code, International Existing Building Code, and National Electrical Code are provided under the amended administrative provisions of Chapter 1 of the International Building Code. 
(b)	Section 101.2.1 of the International Building Code is amended to add the following appendices: 
101.2.1 Appendices. Provisions in the appendices shall not apply unless specifically adopted. The following appendices published by the International Code Council (ICC) are specifically adopted and made part of the City of Central Building Code: 
1.	Appendix Chapter I, Patio Covers
2.	Appendix Chapter J, Grading
(c)	Section 101.4.4 of the International Building Code regarding the International Property Maintenance Code is deleted in its entirety. 
(d)	Section 101.4 of the International Building Code is amended by the addition of a new subsection 101.4.8 to read as follows: 
101.4.8 Electrical. The provisions of the most current edition of the National Electrical Code as enforced by the Colorado State Electrical Board shall apply to the installation of electrical systems, including alterations, repairs, replacements, equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances thereto. 
(e)	Section 105.1.1 of the International Building Code regarding annual permits is deleted in its entirety. 
(f)	Section 105.1.2 of the International Building Code regarding annual permit records is deleted in its entirety. 
(g)	Section 109.2 of the International Building Code is amended to read as follows:
109.2 Schedule of permit fees. On buildings, structures, gas, mechanical and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as required, in accordance with the Schedule of Fees as established by resolution of the City Council. 
(h)	Section 109.2 of the International Building Code is amended by the addition of the following Subsections to read as follows: 
109.2.1 Plan Review Fees. When submittal documents are required by Section 107.1, a nonrefundable plan review fee deposit shall be paid at the time of submitting the submittal documents for plan review. Said plan review fee shall be 65 percent (65%) of the building permit fee in accordance with the Schedule of Fees as established by resolution of the City Council. 
The plan review fees specified in this section are separate fees from the permit fees specified in Section 109.2 and are in addition to the permit fees. When submittal documents are incomplete or changed so as to require additional plan review or when the project involves deferred submittal items as defined in Section 107.3.4.2, an additional plan review fee shall be charged in accordance with the Schedule of Fees as established by resolution of the City Council. 
(i)	Section 109.4 of the International Building Code is amended by adding the following Subsections to read as follows: 
109.4.1 Investigation. Whenever any work for which a permit is required by this code has been commenced without first obtaining said permit, a special investigation shall be made by the City Manager, or his or her designee, into why a permit was not obtained before a permit may be issued for such work. 
109.4.2 Fee. An investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall be collected whether or not a permit is then or subsequently issued. The investigation fee shall be equal to the amount of the permit fee required by this code. The minimum investigation fee shall be the same as the permit fee in accordance with the Schedule of Fees as established by resolution of the City Council. The payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt any person from compliance with all other provisions of this code nor from any penalty prescribed by law. 
(j)	Section 109.6 of the International Building Code is amended to read as follows:
109.6 Fee Refunds. The building official may authorize refunding of any fee paid hereunder which was erroneously paid or collected if an audit of the project has been performed and the audit shows that the fees were paid incorrectly. If an owner or owner's representative feels that a fee is erroneously paid or collected, an audit may be required by the building official. The audit shall be performed by an auditor selected by the City. The project owner or owner's representative shall pay the cost of the audit. 
The building official may authorize refunding of not more than 80 percent of the permit fee paid when no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance with this code. 
The building official may authorize refunding of not more than 80 percent of the plan review fee paid when an application for a permit for which a plan review fee has been paid is withdrawn or canceled before any plan reviewing is done. 
The building official shall not authorize refunding of any fee paid except on written application filed by the original permittee not later than 180 days after the date of fee payment. 
(k)	Section 901.5 of the International Building Code is amended by addition of a new subsection to read as follows: 
901.5.1 Special inspection required. Fire protection systems shall have the systems inspected and tested by a special inspector for compliance with the requirements of this code and the International Fire Code. The special inspector shall be an authorized representative of the fire department or another qualified individual with prior approval of the building official. Approval of special inspectors and reports by special inspectors shall be in accordance with Section 1704. 
Additional amendments to Chapter 9 of the IBC are provided to correlate with the amendments to the IFC and as prepared by the Central City fire Department. 
(l)	2015 Edition, International Building Code, Automatic Sprinkler Systems, is amended to add Section 903.2 
Section 903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and structures shall be provided in the locations described in this section. Automatic sprinkler systems shall be provided throughout buildings and structures of the following building groups. Group A-1, Group A-2, Group A-3, Group A-4, Group B, Group E, Group F-1, F-2, Group H, Group I, Group M, Group R-1, Group R-2, Group R-3, Group R-4, Group S-1, and Group S-2 where one of the following conditions exist. 
1.	The fire area exceeds 3600 square feet.
2.	The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more.
3.	The fire area is located on a floor area other than the level of exit discharge.
All Group H and I occupancies shall be provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system regardless of size. 
Fire sprinkler systems shall meet the requirements of the most current edition of NFPA 13, 13D, or 13R and the requirements of this code. 
(m)	2015 Edition, International Building Code, Section 903.2.1 thru Section 903.2.10.1 Delete in their entirety. The remainder of section 903.2 not affected by the above shall remain unchanged. 
(n)	2015 Edition, International Building Code, Automatic Sprinkler System, Add Section 903.2.1. 
903.2.1 Group A-2 Casino. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout every building containing Group A-2 Casino occupancy regardless of size. Such sprinkler system shall be provided throughout the entire building including the casino, offices, multipurpose areas, storage areas, parking garages, hotels and other spaces contiguous and accessory to the building. 
(o)	2015 Edition, International Building Code. Amend Section 905 Standpipe Systems.
Section 905.3 Required Installations. Standpipe systems shall be installed where required by Sections 905.3.1 through 905.3.6 and in the locations indicated in Sections 905.4, 905.5 and 905.6, Only Class I Standpipe systems with 1 ½" x 2 ½" National Hose adaptors as determined by the Authority Having Jurisdiction shall be installed. Standpipe systems are permitted to be combined with automatic sprinkler systems. In structures, 3 stories or more shall have standpipe systems installed all the way to the roof if needed as determined by the Authority having Jurisdiction. 
(p)	2015 Edition, International Building Code. Amend Section 905 Standpipe Systems.
Add Section 905.3.9, Locking Caps. New standpipes and fire department connections (FDC's) shall be equipped with locking caps approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction. 
(q)	2015 Edition, International Building Code, Fire Alarm and Detection Systems, Amend Section 907 Fire Alarm and Detection Systems. 
Add Section 907.2.1.1 Group A-2 Casino. An automatic and manual fire alarm system shall be installed in accordance with the most current edition of NFPA 72 and the provisions of this code throughout every building containing a casino regardless of size. Such fire alarm systems shall be provided throughout the casino and in offices, stages, storage areas, parking garages and on each elevator floor landing of a parking garage, hotels and other accessory spaces contiguous and accessory to such casino. 
Exception: New parking garages that are protected throughout by an automatic sprinkler system. 
(r)	2015 Edition, International Building Code. Amend Section 907 Fire Alarm and Detection Systems. Delete Section 907.2.1, Exception. 
(s)	2015 Edition, International Building Code. Amend Section 907 Fire Alarm and Detection Systems. Amend and change 907.2.1.1 to 907.2.1.2, and 907.2.1.2 to 907.2.1.3. 
(t)	Section 1608.2 of the International Building Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 
1608.2 Ground Snow Loads. The design ground snow load in the City of Central is 70 pounds per square foot. 
(u)	Section 1609.3 of the International Building Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 
1609.3 Ultimate Design Wind Speed. The ultimate design wind speed, Vult , for the determination of wind loads for any site within the limits of the City of Central shall be 155 miles per hour. 
(v)	Section 1612.3 of the International Building Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 
1612.3 Establishment of Flood Hazard Areas. Section 1612.3 is amended to read as follows: 
Establishment of flood hazard areas. To establish flood hazard areas, the governing body shall adopt a flood hazard map and supporting data. The flood hazard map shall include, at a minimum, areas of special flood hazard as identified by the Federal Emergency Management Agency in an engineering report entitled 'The Flood Insurance Study for the City of Central,' dated October 1991, as amended or revised with the accompanying Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) Panel Number - 080077 0001 C dated February 16, 1994, and Flood Boundary and Floodway Map (FBFM) and related supporting data, along with any revisions thereto. The adopted flood hazard map and supporting data are hereby adopted by reference and declared to be a part of this Section. 
(w)	Section 1703.1 of the International Building Code is amended to read as follows:
1703.1 Approved agency. An approved agency shall provide all information as necessary for the building official to determine that the agency meets the applicable requirements. The fire department with personnel that are certified fire suppression systems inspector by the State of Colorado Division of Fire safety shall be an approved agency for special inspection of fire protection systems required by this code. 
(x)	Section 1704.2.4 is amended by adding an exception to read as follows:
Exception: Special inspection by the fire department of fire protection systems shall not require reporting or a final report to the building official, but will require a final sign-off approving inspected systems for conformance to the approved construction documents. 
(y)	Section 1809.5, Item 1 of the International Building Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following: 
1.	Extending below the frost line of 36 inches.
Exception: Free-standing buildings meeting all of the following conditions shall not be required to be protected: 
1.	Assigned to Risk Category I.
2.	Area of 600 square feet (56 m2) for light-frame construction or 400 square feet (37 m2) or less for other than light-frame construction. 
3.	Eave height of 10 feet (3048 mm) or less.
(z)	Section 3001.1 of the International Building Code is amended to read as follows:
3001.1 Scope. This chapter governs the design, construction, installation, alteration, maintenance, and repair of elevators, escalators, dumbwaiters, wheelchair lifts, and other regulated conveying systems; requires permits therefor; and provides procedures for the inspection and maintenance of such conveyances. 
(aa)	Section 3001.2 of the International Building Code is amended to read as follows:
3001.2 Referenced standards. Except as otherwise provided for in this code, the design, construction, installation, alteration, repair and maintenance of elevators, escalators, dumbwaiters, wheelchair lifts and other regulated conveying systems and their components shall conform to ASME A17.1/CSA B44, ASME A17.3, ASME A90.1, ASME B20.1, ASME A18.1-2008, ASME A17.2-2005, ASME A17.3-2005, ALI ALCTV, ASCE 21 Parts 1, 2, 3, and 4, and ASCE 24 for construction in flood hazard areas established in Section 1612.3. The provisions of the most current editions of these standards as enforced by the Colorado State Department of Labor and Employment Elevator Section shall apply to these regulated conveyances. 
(2) 	Amendments to the International Fire Code 
(a)	2015 Edition, International Fire Code. Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows.
101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of Central City, hereinafter referred to as "this code". 
(b)	2015 Edition, International Fire Code. Section 101.2.1 is amended to add the following appendices. 
101.2.1 Appendices. Provisions in the appendices shall not apply unless specifically adopted. The following appendices and NFPA standards shall be adopted and made part of the Fire Code of the City of Central City. 
Appendix B, Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings, Appendix C, Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution, Appendix D, Fire Department Access Roads, and Appendix I, Fire Protection Systems - Noncompliant Conditions, and the most current editions of the National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Standards are specifically adopted and made a part of the Fire Code of the City of Central City. 
(c)	2015 Edition, International Fire Code is amended to add the following Section 103 Central City Fire Department, Division of Fire Prevention. 
103.2 Appointment. The fire code official shall be appointed by the Central City Fire Chief. 
(d)	Section 109.4 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:
109.4 Penalty. A person or entity who violates the provisions of this code shall be subject to the penalties as set forth in Section 1-4-20 of the City of Central Municipal Code. 
(e)	2015 Edition, International Fire Code. Amend Section 403 Emergency Preparedness Requirements.
In addition to Section 403.12.1.1 and 403.12.1.2 add new subsections 403.12.1.3 through 403.12.1.7 Required Fire Watch Permit 
403.12.1.3 When required. A fire watch permit shall be required: 
1.	When required by other sections of this code.
2.	When the Fire Code Official deems a condition essential for public safety.
3.	When the Fire Code Official determines that conditions may result in a rekindle.
4.	When the fire alarm system is off-line or out of service for repairs or maintenance.
5.	When the fire suppression system is off-line or out of service for repairs or maintenance.
6.	Fire Watch Permits shall be valid for a period not to exceed 24 hours unless otherwise authorized by the fire chief or the fire code official. 
403.12.1.4 Financial responsibility. The property owner, the tenant or occupant in control of the premises shall be responsible for the cost of providing a fire watch. 
403.12.1.5 Qualifications. Personnel assigned to fire watch duties shall possess the following minimum qualifications: 
1.	Shall be at least 18 years of age.
2.	Shall be able to speak, read, and understand English.
3.	Shall be capable of executing the duties and responsibilities as specified in Sections 403.12.1.1 and 403.12.1.7. 
4.	Shall be capable of operating a mobile telephone and/or portable radio.
5.	Shall be capable of walking the assigned watch area.
403.12.1.6 Number and hours. The Fire Code Official shall specify the number of fire watch personnel required and the hours during which they must be present based on the conditions and size of the facility. 
403.12.1.7 Duties and responsibilities. Fire watch duties and responsibilities include, but are not limited to the following: 
1.	Know the address of the facility being watched.
2.	Shall be equipped with a mobile telephone that can be used to contact 9-1-1 or a portable radio that can be used to communicate with a constantly attended security/communications center. 
3.	Continuously make rounds and monitor all assigned areas.
4.	Immediately report any sign of smoke, fire or other emergency to 9-1-1 or to the security/communications center. 
5.	In the event of any sign of fire or smoke shall activate the fire alarm system when the building is equipped with such a system or notify those present to evacuate the building or area. 
6.	Shall assist with the evacuation of people present in the area.
7.	Keep a fire watch log that includes the following information:
•  Identifies the building or area by name and address that is under watch. 
•  The date and time each round or tour is completed, plus comments on what was observed. 
•  Each entry shall contain the name and signature of the person conducting the watch. 
•  Fire watch logs shall be immediately accessible for review by the Fire Code Official. A copy of the fire watch log shall be submitted to the Central City Fire Department, Fire Prevention Division when the watch is concluded. 
  Fire watch personnel shall not be assigned additional duties during their fire watch tour. 
(f)	2015 Edition, International Fire Code, Section 507 Fire Protection Water Supplies. Add Section 507.5.3.1 and 507.5.3.2 
507.5.3.1 Fire mains. Fire mains and appurtenances shall be sized to accommodate the calculated fire flow but shall not be less than 6 inches (152 mm) in diameter. 
507.5.3.2 Dead-end fire mains. Dead-end fire mains shall not be less than 8 inches (203 mm) in diameter unless calculations determine otherwise and authorized by the authority having jurisdiction. 
(g)	2015 Edition, International Fire Code, Section 607 Elevator Operation, Maintenance, and Fire Service Keys is amended to add Section 607.8.1.1 Elevator Switch Keys. 
607.8.1.1 Elevator Switch Keys. The key switches required for all elevators in a building shall be operable by the same key. The keys shall comply with the requirements determined by the authority having jurisdiction. There shall be a key for each switch provided. All elevator switch keys shall be kept on the premises in a location specified by the authority having jurisdiction. The keys shall not be accessible to the public. 
(h)	2015 Edition, International Fire Code, Section 901.5 Installation acceptance testing is amended to add Section 901.5.2 
901.5.2 Special inspection required. Fire protection systems shall have the systems inspected and tested by a special inspector for compliance with the requirements of this code and the International Fire Code. The special inspector shall be an authorized representative of the fire department or another qualified individual with prior approval of the building official. Approval of special inspectors and reports by special inspectors shall be in accordance with Section 1704. 
(i)	2015 Edition, International Fire Code, Automatic Sprinkler Systems, is amended to add Section 903.2 
Section 903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and structures shall be provided in the locations described in this section. Automatic sprinkler systems shall be provided throughout buildings and structures of the following building groups. Group A-1, Group A-2, Group A-3, Group A-4, Group B, Group E, Group F-1, F-2, Group H, Group I, Group M, Group R-1, Group R-2, Group R-3, Group R-4, Group S-1, and Group S-2 where one of the following conditions exist. 
1.	The fire area exceeds 3600 square feet.
2.	The fire area has an occupant load of 100 or more.
3.	The fire area is located on a floor area other than the level of exit discharge.
All Group H and I occupancies shall be provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system regardless of size. 
Fire sprinkler systems shall meet the requirements of the most current edition of NFPA 13, 13D, or 13R and the requirements of this code. 
(j)	2015 Edition, International Fire Code, Section 903.2.1 thru Section 903.2.10.1 Delete in their entirety. The remainder of section 903.2 not affected by the above shall remain unchanged. 
(k)	2015 Edition, International Fire Code, Automatic Sprinkler System, Add Section 903.2.1.
903.2.1 Group A-2 Casino. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout every building containing Group A-2 Casino occupancy regardless of size. Such sprinkler system shall be provided throughout the entire building including the casino, offices, multipurpose areas, storage areas, parking garages, hotels and other spaces contiguous and accessory to the building. 
(l)	2015 Edition, International Fire Code. Amend Section 905 Standpipe Systems.
Section 905.3 Required Installations. Standpipe systems shall be installed where required by Sections 905.3.1 through 905.3.6 and in the locations indicated in Sections 905.4, 905.5 and 905.6, Only Class I Standpipe systems with 1 ½" x 2 ½" National Hose adaptors as determined by the Authority Having Jurisdiction shall be installed. Standpipe systems are permitted to be combined with automatic sprinkler systems. In structures, 3 stories or more shall have standpipe systems installed all the way to the roof if needed as determined by the Authority having Jurisdiction. 
(m)	2015 Edition, International Fire Code. Amend Section 905 Standpipe Systems.
Add Section 905.3.9, Locking Caps. New standpipes and fire department connections (FDC's) shall be equipped with locking caps approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction. 
(n)	2015 Edition, International Fire Code, Fire Alarm and Detection Systems, Amend Section 907 Fire Alarm and Detection Systems. 
Add Section 907.2.1.1 Group A-2 Casino. An automatic and manual fire alarm system shall be installed in accordance with the most current edition of NFPA 72 and the provisions of this code throughout every building containing a casino regardless of size. Such fire alarm systems shall be provided throughout the casino and in offices, stages, storage areas, parking garages and on each elevator floor landing of a parking garage, hotels and other accessory spaces contiguous and accessory to such casino. 
Exception: New parking garages that are protected throughout by an automatic sprinkler system. 
(o)	2015 Edition, International Fire Code. Amend Section 907 Fire Alarm and Detection Systems. Delete Section 907.2.1, Exception. 
(p)	2015 Edition, International Fire Code. Amend Section 907 Fire Alarm and Detection Systems. Amend and change 907.2.1.1 to 907.2.1.2, and 907.2.1.2 to 907.2.1.3. 
(3) 	Amendments to the International Residential Code 
(a)	Table R301.2(1) of the International Residential Code is amended by the addition of the following design criteria to the table: 
	Table R301.2(1)
Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria

	Ground Snow Load
	70 PSF

	Wind Speed
	120 MPH (3-second gust velocity)

	Wind Topographical Effects
	No reported history

	Special Wind Region
	No reported history

	Wind-borne Debris Zone
	No

	Seismic Design Category
	B

	Weathering Damage
	Severe

	Frost Line depth
	36"

	Termite Damage
	Slight to Moderate

	Winter Design Temp
	0°F

	Ice Barrier Underlayment Required
	Yes

	Flood Hazards
	The flood hazard map shall include, at a minimum, areas of special flood hazard as identified by the Federal Emergency Management Agency in an engineering report entitled, "The Flood Insurance Study for the City of Central," dated October 1991, as amended or revised with the accompanying Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) Panel Number-080077 0001 C dated February 16, 1994, and Flood Boundary and Floodway Map (FBFM) and related supporting data, along with any revisions thereto. The adopted flood hazard map and supporting data are hereby adopted by reference and declared to be a part of this Section. 

	Air Freezing Index
	2000

	Mean Annual Temp
	40°


 
(b)	Section R313 regarding automatic fire sprinkler systems is deleted in its entirety.
(c)	Section R321.1 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:
R321.1 Elevators. Where provided, passenger elevators, limited-use/limited-application elevators or private residence elevators shall comply with ASME A17.1. The provisions of the most current editions of this standard as enforced by the Colorado State Department of Labor and Employment Elevator Section shall apply to this regulated conveyance. 
(d)	Section 321.2 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:
R321.2 Platform lifts. Where provided, platform lifts shall comply with ASME A18.1. The provisions of the most current editions of this standard as enforced by the Colorado State Department of Labor and Employment Elevator Section shall apply to this regulated conveyance. 
(e)	Section R326 of the International Residential Code regarding swimming pools, spas, and hot tubs is deleted in its entirety. 
(f)	Section N1102.4.1.2 of the International Residential Code regarding air leakage testing is deleted in its entirety. 
(g)	Section N1103.3.3 of the International Residential Code regarding duct testing is deleted in its entirety. 
(h)	Section G2445 of the International Residential Code regarding unvented room heaters is deleted in its entirety. 
(i)	Section P2603.5.1 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:
P2603.5.1 Sewer Depth. Building sewers shall be not less than 48 inches (1219 mm) below grade. 
(4) 	Amendments to the International Mechanical Code 
(a)	Section 903.3 of the International Mechanical Code is amended to read as follows:
903.3 Unvented gas log heaters. An unvented gas log heater shall not be installed in a factory-built fireplace. 
(5) 	Amendments to the International Plumbing Code 
(a)	Section 305.4.1 of the International Plumbing Code is amended to read as follows:
305.4.1 Sewer Depth. Building sewers shall be not less than 48 inches (1219 mm) below grade. 
(b)	Section 903.1 of the International Plumbing Code is amended to read as follows:
903.1 Roof extension. Open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be terminated not less than 12 inches (305 mm) above the roof. Where a roof is to be used for assembly or as a promenade, observation deck, sunbathing deck or similar purposes, open vent pipes shall terminate not less than 7 feet (21345 mm) above the roof. 
(6) 	Amendments to the International Energy Conservation Code 
(a)	Section C501.6 of the International Energy Conservation Code is amended to read as follows: 
C501.6 Historic Building. No provisions of this code relating to the construction, repair, alteration, restoration and movement of structures, and change of occupancy shall be mandatory for historic buildings. 
(b)	Section R402.4.1.2 of the International Energy Conservation Code regarding air leakage testing is deleted in its entirety. 
(c)	Section R 403.3.3 of the International Energy Conservation Code regarding duct testing is deleted in its entirety. 
(d)	Section R501.6 of the International Energy Conservation Code is amended to read as follows: 
R501.6 Historic Building. No provisions of this code relating to the construction, repair, alteration, restoration and movement of structures, and change of occupancy shall be mandatory for historic buildings. 
(7) 	Amendments to the International Existing Building Code. 
(a)	Section 1401.2 of the International Existing Building Code is amended to read as follows:
1401.2 Applicability. These provisions shall not apply to buildings with occupancies in Group H or I-1, I-3 or I-4. 
(8) 	Amendments to the International Fuel Gas Code. 
(a)	Section 621 of the International Fuel Gas Code regarding unvented room heaters is deleted in its entirety. 
(Ord. No. 15-03, § 1, 2015)


FOOTNOTE(S):

--- (1) --- 
Editor's note—Ord. No. 15-03, §1, adopted July 7, 2015, repealed the former Ch. 18, Art. I, §§ 18-1-10—18-1-50, and enacted a new Ch. 18 as set out herein. The former Ch. 18 pertained to similar subject matter and derived from prior code 18-1, 18-3—18-5.(Back)
ARTICLE II Building Moving and Demolition
Sec. 18-2-10. Purpose.
Sec. 18-2-20. General.
Sec. 18-2-30. Definitions.
Sec. 18-2-40. Standards for review of demolition.
Sec. 18-2-50. Standards of review for relocation.
Sec. 18-2-60. Submission requirements.
Sec. 18-2-70. Fees.
Sec. 18-2-80. Certificate of appropriateness required.
Sec. 18-2-90. Public notice required.
Sec. 18-2-100. Voting.
Sec. 18-2-110. Penalty.
Sec. 18-2-120. Appeals.
Sec. 18-2-130. Standards for review of relocation of residential buildings within Historic Downtown Gaming (HDG) and Gregory Gulch Gaming (GGG) Zoning Districts.
Sec. 18-2-140. Fees and costs.
Sec. 18-2-150. Relocation of rated residential building.
Sec. 18-2-160. Submission requirements.
Sec. 18-2-170. Public notice required.
Sec. 18-2-180. Penalty.


[bookmark: BK_4DE1CA83548701251E5063DD4A892B0A]Sec. 18-2-10. Purpose.
The purpose of this Article is to provide a system by which moving and demolition of structures and buildings shall be regulated. The primary intent is to preserve the historical integrity and architectural character of the City through preservation, retention and maintenance of all structures designated by the City as "contributing" in their original locations. This Article also seeks to protect nonrated structures which contribute to a neighborhood's historical integrity, to maintain existing streetscapes and alleyscapes and to preserve and enhance the traditional mass and scale of the City's architecture. A further purpose is to preclude the relocation of any rated or unrated structure to a site outside the City. 
(Prior code 18-111)
[bookmark: BK_F2B3739B8C23A4F67F53AA6D0C83890D]Sec. 18-2-20. General.
(a)	No demolition or removal of any contributing or rated structure or building within the Central City National Historic Landmark District (hereinafter "NHLD") shall be permitted, unless the demolition is first approved by the Historic Preservation Commission (hereinafter, "HPC"), in accordance with the standards of Section 18-2-40 below. 
(b)	No relocation of a rated structure or building located within or from the NHLD shall be permitted, unless the relocation or move is first approved by the HPC in accordance with the standards of Section 18-2-50 or Section 18-2-130 of this Article. 
(c)	No demolition of a nonrated structure or building located within the NHLD shall be permitted, unless the demolition is first approved by the HPC in accordance with the standards of Section 16-11-60 of this Code and Subsection 18-2-40(b) below. 
(d)	No relocation of any nonrated structure within the City shall be permitted unless the relocation is first approved by the HPC in accordance with the standards of Subsection 18-2-50(b) of this Article. 
(e)	No owner of a rated structure and no lessee of a rated structure who is obligated by such lease to maintain and repair the structure (other than the interior), shall allow, cause or permit the structure to suffer or experience demolition by neglect. 
(f)	The partial demolition of a structure which occurs solely as part of a remodel, alteration or addition to an existing structure shall only be subject to the applicable review and approval requirements of Chapter 16, Article XI of this Code. 
(g)	In the event of any conflict or inconsistency between the provisions of this Article and Chapter 16 of this Code, the provisions of this Article shall control. 
(Prior code 18-112)
[bookmark: BK_0D27402FEC5AF9DE3D795D9069441D78]Sec. 18-2-30. Definitions.
As used in this Article, the following terms and phrases shall have the following meaning: 
Contributing structures means those structures or buildings which exist in comparatively original condition or which have been appropriately restored and clearly contribute to the historical significance of the City. 
Demolition means the total or partial destruction, damage, razing, arson or tearing down of a structure or any portion thereof. The term includes the removal of any material constituting part of the structure other than for purposes of ordinary maintenance or repair, which removal affects the exterior appearance of the structure or which reduces the stability or longevity of the structure. The term excludes the sudden or cataclysmic destruction of or damage to a structure due to acts of God including fire, earthquake, wind, flood or avalanche. 
Demolition by neglect means any total or partial destruction of or damage to a structure or any portion thereof due to the failure of an owner or lessee of the structure to adequately maintain and repair the structure. 
Local landmark means those structures which have been designated pursuant to Chapter 16, Article XI of this Code. 
Nonrated structure means a structure or building identified as "noncontributing with qualifications" or as "noncontributing without qualifications" in the 1987 National Register of Historic Places Registration Form, revised 1990 (hereinafter "Register"). 
Originating site means the lot or parcel of land on which a relocated structure was situated prior to its relocation. 
Rated structure means a structure or building identified as "contributing" in the Register. 
Receiving site means the lot or parcel of land on which a structure is situated after its relocation. 
Relocation means moving a structure to a new location within the City. 
Removal means the act of moving a structure from its present location in the City. The term removal includes relocation, but not repositioning, of a structure. 
Reposition means the relocation of a structure within the same lot or parcel of land on which the structure is situated. 
Residential building means a structure or building designed, built and historically used as a residence for human habitation, whether currently so utilized or not and whether or not so utilized at all times in its history, and including outbuildings associated with a residence and designed and built as accessory to the principal residence. 
(Prior code 18-113)
[bookmark: BK_17655A86F50E8EB2E7B8BEE57E90121D]Sec. 18-2-40. Standards for review of demolition.
(a)	No demolition of a rated structure within the NHLD shall be approved unless the HPC finds that all of the following standards have been met: 
(1)	The structure cannot be rehabilitated or reused on site as part of any reasonable beneficial use of the property. 
(2)	The structure proposed for demolition is structurally unsound despite efforts by the owner to properly maintain the structure. 
(3)	The structure cannot be practically moved to another site within the NHLD.
(4)	The demolition proposal mitigates to the greatest extent practical any impact to the character of the "neighborhood" of the property on which the demolition is proposed to occur. 
(5)	The historical integrity and architectural character of the area where the proposed demolition of a structure is to take place will not be substantially diminished or compromised. For the purposes of this Section, the term architectural character shall include, but is not limited to, height, coverage, setbacks, massing, siting, fenestration, streetscape, alleyscape, materials and scale of materials. 
(6)	Subsequent development on the property will add to the architectural character of the neighborhood more than the structure to be demolished. 
(7)	The demolition proposal mitigates to the greater extent practical any impact to the historical importance of any other structures located on the property and on adjacent parcels and on the integrity of the NHLD. 
(8)	The demolition proposal mitigates to the greatest extent practical any impact on the architectural character of a designated historical structure or part thereof. 
(9)	The applicant has agreed to redevelop the originating site after demolition pursuant to an approved redevelopment plan which provides for a replacement structure, which plan is compatible with and/or enhances the historical integrity and architectural character of the immediate area, neighborhood and the NHLD. This standard may be waived by the HPC if the applicant agrees to deed-restrict the property to open-space uses, and the HPC finds that such restriction constitutes a greater benefit to the NHLD or the City than redevelopment would. 
(b)	No demolition of a nonrated structure shall be approved unless the HPC finds that the standards of Paragraphs (a)(4) through (a)(8) above are met. 
(Prior code 18-114)
[bookmark: BK_F79159CAB449EFD47105772D0812370A]Sec. 18-2-50. Standards of review for relocation.
(a)	No relocation of rated structures within the NHLD except as permitted under Sections 18-2-130 through 18-2-180 of this Article shall be approved unless the HPC finds that all of the following standards have been met: 
(1)	The structure cannot be rehabilitated or reused on its originating site as part of any reasonable beneficial use of the property. 
(2)	The relocation activity is demonstrated to be the best method for preservation of the character and integrity of the structure, and the historical integrity of the existing neighborhoods and of structures adjacent to the receiving and originating sites will not be diminished due to the relocation. 
(3)	The structure to be relocated must retain sufficient historical features, integrity of design, materials, workmanship, feeling and associations, so as to continue to convey its architectural significance. 
(4)	The historical and present orientation, immediate setting and general environment of the relocated structure at the receiving site must be compatible with the architectural qualities and/or historical associations of structure in the neighborhood of the receiving site. 
(5)	The historical character and architectural integrity of the area of the proposed receiving site, the originating site (if located in the City), and of the structure itself, will not be substantially compromised or diminished, and the proposal for subsequent development on the originating site will add to the character of the neighborhood more than the structure to be moved. 
(6)	The structure has been demonstrated to be capable of withstanding the physical impacts of the relocation and resiting, based on a structural report by a licensed engineer attesting to the soundness of the structure proposed for relocation. 
(7)	The applicant has agreed to comply with a preservation, rehabilitation and restoration plan for the relocated structure which has received the approval of the HPC pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Chapter 16, Article XI of this Code. 
(8)	The receiving site is compatible in nature to the structure proposed to be moved, the character of the neighborhood is consistent with the architectural integrity of the structure and the relocation of the structure would not diminish the integrity or character of the neighborhood of the receiving site. 
(b)	No relocation of a nonrated structure shall be approved unless the HPC finds that the standards of Paragraphs (a)(6) through (a)(8) above are met. 
(Prior code 18-115)
[bookmark: BK_702351DDC8D0F37DAB44B50D68F70794]Sec. 18-2-60. Submission requirements.
(a)	For relocation or demolition requests involving local landmarks and rated structures located within the NHLD, the applicant shall submit in triplicate a written application which shall include: 
(1)	Elevations, drawings, plans, statements and other materials which satisfy the requirements for applications under Chapter 16 of this Code and Articles I, II and III of this Chapter, for any replacement structure or structures to be erected or constructed pursuant to a development plan; 
(2)	A report from a licensed engineer or architect regarding the soundness of the structure and its suitability for rehabilitation; 
(3)	An economic feasibility report prepared by an architect, developer, appraiser or other person who is experienced in rehabilitation of structures that addresses: 
a.	The estimated market value of the property on which the structure lies, both before and after demolition or removal, and 
b.	The feasibility of rehabilitation or reuse of the structure proposed for demolition or partial demolition; 
(4)	A statement addressing compliance with each applicable standard for review for demolition or relocation; and 
(5)	A redevelopment plan for any originating, receiving or demolition site, and a statement of the effect of the proposed redevelopment on the architectural and historical qualities of other structures and the character of the neighborhood around the sites. 
(b)	For relocation requests involving nonrated structures within the NHLD and the City, the applicant shall submit in triplicate a written application which shall include: 
(1)	A redevelopment plan for the receiving site, and a statement of the effect of the proposed redevelopment on the architectural and historical qualities of other structures and the character of the neighborhood around the site; 
(2)	Applications shall be submitted to the Historic Preservation Administrator at least sixteen (16) days prior to the next regularly scheduled meeting of the HPC. The application shall be put on the agenda for a hearing at such meeting if the application is determined to be complete by the Historic Preservation Administrator. Incomplete applications shall not be put on the agenda for hearing; 
(3)	The HPC may require the applicant to submit such additional information and exhibits as it deems reasonably necessary to enable the HPC to review the application, including, but not limited to, historic photographs; and 
(4)	Upon receipt of a complete application for requests within the City, the Historic Preservation Administrator shall schedule a site visit for the HPC to review such application. Any site visit shall be considered as part of the public hearing, for which notice shall be provided in accordance with applicable notice requirements. 
(c)	For demolition requests involving nonrated structures within the NHLD and the City, a certificate of appropriateness under the provisions of Section 16-11-60 of this Code shall be required. 
(Prior code 18-116)
[bookmark: BK_D69C198805A997990AA26B759D16AB96]Sec. 18-2-70. Fees.
(a)	Applications for relocation, removal or demolition of any structure subject to the provisions of this Article shall be accompanied by a fee according to the following schedule: 
	Local Landmarks; rated structures
	$500.00

	Nonrated structures
	100.00


 
(b)	The City Council may waive or reduce the above fees in consideration of hardship circumstances for residential properties. 
(Prior code 18-117)
[bookmark: BK_1B4460701C6BFD2144A9B0CF9191A6AF]Sec. 18-2-80. Certificate of appropriateness required.
(a)	The relocation of any structure, and the demolition of any rated structure located within the City, shall be prohibited unless a certificate of appropriateness for such activity has been issued in accordance with the provisions of this Article and the applicable provisions of Chapter 16, Article XI of this Code. 
(b)	No building permit for demolition or relocation shall be issued unless the Building Official has also issued a total building permit for the replacement structure. 
(c)	A certificate of appropriateness authorizing demolition shall become effective after a reasonable amount of time has elapsed, as determined by the HPC, after permit approval, provided that such time may not be less than one (1) month. The applicant shall be encouraged to sell or reclaim the structure and materials to be demolished or to permit others to salvage them in order to provide an opportunity for others to purchase or reclaim the building or its materials for use in the City. The applicant may be required to advertise the availability of the structure and materials for sale or salvage in a newspaper of general circulation within the City on at least three (3) occasions prior to demolition. 
(Prior code 18-118)
[bookmark: BK_F155F48D5D91247BE3191CF65C9E4798]Sec. 18-2-90. Public notice required.
Upon receipt by the Historic Preservation Administrator of a complete application for an approval of a certificate of appropriateness for the demolition of any rated structure of or for the relocation of any structure within the City, the HPC shall cause notice of a public hearing to consider the application to be mailed and published prior to the hearing in accordance with the notice requirements of Chapter 16, except that only five (5) days' advance mailing and publication shall be required. 
(Prior code 18-119)
[bookmark: BK_E6506C9FA403574B84406BFD07B0C9F4]Sec. 18-2-100. Voting.
Unless otherwise required by this Article or Chapter 16, Article XI of this Code, any action by the HPC in administering the provisions of this Article may be authorized upon the affirmative vote of a simple majority of the HPC when a quorum is present. 
(Prior code 18-120)
[bookmark: BK_31CDC645B9755890EB7B4442A7FC3255]Sec. 18-2-110. Penalty.
(a)	Any person who intentionally causes, intentionally permits or knowingly fails to prevent the unauthorized demolition, removal or relocation of a rated structure which the person owns or leases, who has knowingly permitted demolition by neglect of any rated structure which such person owns or leases, or who has violated any provision of this Article, may be punished in the Municipal Court by a fine of up to the estimated cost of repair, restoration and relocation of the structure to the originating site, or the cost of replacement of the structure at its originating site, whichever cost is greater (including engineering, materials and labor). Such fine may be suspended on the condition that the person agrees to repair, restore, replace and/or relocate the structure in a manner acceptable to the HPC and posts a bond or suitable collateral with the City for such work. 
(b)	In case any structure is demolished in violation of this Article, no replacement structure shall exceed the height and the floor square footage of the demolished building, and the uses of the replacement structure shall only be those uses that were permitted for the demolished structure prior to the effective date of the constitutional amendment that authorized limited gambling in the City. 
(c)	In addition, upon commencement of any prosecution in Municipal Court pursuant to Subsection (a) above, the HPC shall be authorized to impose a temporary moratorium on the issuance of building permits or certificates of occupancy for the property from which a structure was demolished, removed or relocated. Such moratorium shall remain in effect for the duration of the prosecution and any appeal therefrom. 
(d)	Notice of restrictions imposed pursuant to Subsection (b) above shall be recorded with the County Clerk and Recorder by the HPC. 
(e)	The penalty provisions of this Section are cumulative and are in addition to any other remedies at law or in equity or any other judicial or administrative remedies (including abatement) which may be available to the City. 
(Prior code 18-122)
[bookmark: BK_3D24186B482C05EAB634B8BD08FC0E46]Sec. 18-2-120. Appeals.
Any person aggrieved by the approval or denial by the HPC of an application of relocation or demolition may appeal such action to the City Council in accordance with the provisions of Chapter 16, Article XI of this Code. A moratorium on the proposed relocation or demolition shall be in effect until final action on the appeal by the City Council. 
(Prior code 18-123)
[bookmark: BK_B81D2E52AE0B35FC6EC9D18C6455F336]Sec. 18-2-130. Standards for review of relocation of residential buildings within Historic Downtown Gaming (HDG) and Gregory Gulch Gaming (GGG) Zoning Districts.
(a)	A rated residential building (hereinafter "rated building") in the HDG or the GGG Zoning Districts may be relocated from its historic site only if all of the following standards have been met: 
(1)	A significant loss of integrity of setting, feeling and association of the rated building has occurred as follows: 
a.	New work or construction, planned or completed, in the Neighborhood District of the originating site as defined in the design guidelines is of such a larger scale that it overwhelmed or will overwhelm the rated building. 
b.	That a feasibility study provided by the applicant demonstrates to the HPC by a preponderance of the evidence that no adaptive use or uses, including repositioning of the rated building consistent with the applicable Design Guidelines, are preferable to relocation. For the purpose of this Section, adaptive use shall mean a use different from the original or current use of the building, interactive with the proposed use of the originating site, incorporated into, surrounded by or placed adjacent to new, larger scale construction on the originating site. 
1.	The feasibility study shall be conducted by a person known to the City as being experienced in the area of historic preservation. 
2.	The HPC shall approve the feasibility study, excepting the conclusions contained therein; reject the study in total; or require further information. A request for further information shall not delay an application pursuant to this Section beyond thirty (30) days. 
c.	The relocation activity is demonstrated to be the best method for preservation of the character and integrity of the rated building, and the historic integrity of the buildings adjacent to the receiving and originating sites will not be diminished due to the relocation. 
(2)	The rated building to be relocated must maintain sufficient historical features, integrity of design, materials, workmanship, feeling and associations, so as to continue to convey its architectural significance. 
(3)	The present orientation, immediate setting and general environment of the relocated rated building at the receiving site must be compatible with the architectural qualities and/or historical associations of buildings in the neighborhood of the receiving site. 
(4)	The historic character and architectural integrity of the area of the proposed receiving site, and the rated building itself, will not be substantially compromised or diminished, and the proposal for subsequent development on the originating site will add to the character of the neighborhood consistent with the Design Guidelines. 
(5)	The rated building has been demonstrated to be capable of withstanding the physical impacts of the relocation and resetting, based on a structural report by a licensed engineer attesting to the soundness of the building proposed for relocation. 
(6)	The applicant has agreed to comply with a preservation plan for the relocated rated building which has received the approval of the HPC pursuant to the provisions and requirements of Chapter 16, Article XI, of this Code. 
(7)	The receiving site is compatible in nature with the rated building proposed to be moved and contains existing historic buildings of compatible context and scale, the character of the neighborhood is consistent with the architectural integrity of the rated building and the relocation of the rated building would not diminish the integrity or character of the neighborhood of the receiving site. 
(8)	The rated building will not be combined with another building, either existing in the receiving area or relocated to the receiving area, unless approved by the HPC. 
(b)	A nonrated residential building in the HDG or the GGG may be relocated from its historic site only if the provisions of Subsection 18-2-50(b) of this Article have been met. 
(Prior code 18-124)
[bookmark: BK_FC83143AEB6C08BD0DCD11F0449F4834]Sec. 18-2-140. Fees and costs.
(a)	In addition to the fees required by Section 18-2-70 of this Article, and prior to the issuance of a building permit for relocation of a rated residential building, an irrevocable letter of credit acceptable in form to the City Attorney must be furnished by the applicant to assure the completion of the relocation and restoration in the manner and time approved. Said guarantee shall be in an amount equal to one hundred twenty-five percent (125%) of the total estimated cost of relocation, acquisition of the receiving site and restoration of the relocated building. 
(b)	As an alternate guarantee to the irrevocable letter of credit in Subsection (a) above, the applicant may, prior to the issuance of a building permit, place funds in an escrow account to be held in trust until released by the City. The City may release a portion of the funds on a monthly basis equal to up to ninety-five percent (95%) of the cost of the work completed to that date, provided that the remaining funds in the account will cover the remaining costs of relocation, acquisition of the receiving site and restoration of the relocated building. In the event the applicant fails to complete the relocation and restoration in compliance with all of the applicant's permits and approvals, the bank shall immediately make all funds in escrow available to the City for completion of the relocation and renovation. The amount of said escrow account shall be as stated in Subsection (a) above. 
(Prior code 18-125)
[bookmark: BK_BB4AE0DDA5F256FF27EEB6621FE8F423]Sec. 18-2-150. Relocation of rated residential building.
(a)	The relocation of any rated residential building shall be prohibited unless a certificate of appropriateness for such activity as been issued in accordance with the provisions of this Article and the applicable provisions of Chapter 16, Article XI, of this Code. 
(b)	No building permit for relocation of a rated residential building pursuant to Section 18-2-130 above shall be issued unless the appropriate City approval, whether planned unit development approval, special review use approval or building permit, has been issued for the replacement building. 
(c)	No certificate of occupancy or temporary certificate of occupancy may be issued for the replacement building until a certificate of occupancy has been issued for the relocated rated residential building. A certificate of occupancy must be issued for the relocated rated residential building within six (6) months of the issuance of the building permit for relocation or the applicant shall be in violation of this Article. 
(d)	The relocation of a rated residential building shall not receive a certificate of appropriateness unless the applicant has provided the City with detailed photographs, notes and drawings which accurately record the exterior design, character of interiors, finishes and general structural systems, including overall building dimensions, setbacks and relation to adjacent buildings on the originating site. 
(Prior code 18-126)
[bookmark: BK_084A3B2056F559FE6F5E191583E93641]Sec. 18-2-160. Submission requirements.
Submission requirements for the relocation of a rated residential building pursuant to Section 18-2-130 of this Article shall be those requirements contained in Subsection 18-2-60(a). 
(Prior code 18-127)
[bookmark: BK_869D5CE79FAF3975D4ACD8E5F325320C]Sec. 18-2-170. Public notice required.
Public notice requirements of Section 18-2-90 of this Article shall apply to the relocation of a rated residential building. 
(Prior code 18-128)
[bookmark: BK_DF249F0A0AF391698E9CE05E9D85AEB0]Sec. 18-2-180. Penalty.
(a)	Any person failing to comply with this Article shall be subject to the fines and penalties as set forth in Section 1-4-20 of this Code. 
(b)	Failure to comply with any provisions of Sections 18-2-130 through 18-2-170 of this Article shall result in a forfeiture of the irrevocable letter of credit called for in Section 18-2-140 of this Article. The City may make any appropriate use of such letter of credit to complete the relocation, restore the rated building to its original site or such other action as the City determines to be appropriate in its sole discretion. 
(Prior code 18-129)
ARTICLE III Blasting and Use of Explosives
Sec. 18-3-10. Definitions.
Sec. 18-3-20. Permit required.
Sec. 18-3-30. Qualifications for permit.
Sec. 18-3-40. Blasting operations.
Sec. 18-3-50. Notification prior to blasting operations.
Sec. 18-3-60. Blasting plan.
Sec. 18-3-70. Blasting specifications.
Sec. 18-3-80. Manufacture and storage of explosives.
Sec. 18-3-90. Corrective measures.
Sec. 18-3-100. Revocation of permit.
Sec. 18-3-110. Violation and penalties.


[bookmark: BK_22DF78241E27A3BCFB2CFCDB8F49B89C]Sec. 18-3-10. Definitions.
As used in this Article, the following words shall be construed to have the meanings defined below: 
Blasting operations. The use of explosives within the City. 
Blasting permit. A permit issued by the City in accordance with the provisions of this Article to allow blasting operations within the City. 
Blasting plan. The plan for conduct of any blasting operations, and any amendments thereto, which have been approved by the City as provided in this Article. 
Explosives. Any material or container containing a chemical compound or mixture that is commonly used or intended for the purpose of producing an explosion and that contains any oxidizing and combustible materials or other ingredients in such proportions, quantities or packing that an ignition by fire, by friction, by compound or by mixture may cause such a sudden generation of highly heated gases that the resultant gaseous pressures are capable of producing destructive effects on contiguous objects, but shall not mean the components for hand-loading rifle, pistol and shotgun ammunition, or fireworks. 
Seismograph. The seismograph shall be capable of the following: measuring three (3) wave components; vertical, longitudinal and transverse; equipped with a self-triggering device; automatically calculate peak particle velocity; provide a hard copy of the wave forms; event summary on disk with internal disk storage system to store as many events as may occur each day. 
(Prior code 18-158)
[bookmark: BK_0FDBD5DC9150F8AB180E994B0924B218]Sec. 18-3-20. Permit required.
(a)	The manufacture, storage and use of explosives within the City is to be governed by this Article, which shall be known as the Blasting Ordinance of the City. It shall be unlawful to manufacture, store or use explosives except in compliance with this Article. A blasting permit issued by the City shall be required for the use of any explosives within the City. In order to obtain a permit, the applicant must have met all of the state or federal law, ordinance, rule and regulation. A blasting permit is personal to the individual to whom it is issued and may not be assigned. 
(b)	A building or excavation permit is required before a blasting permit will be issued. A blasting permit must be issued forty-eight (48) hours prior to blasting. 
(c)	Central City Opera House Association is exempted from the requirements of this Article for Opening Day celebrations. 
(Prior code 18-159)
[bookmark: BK_E632EB5BA91024A3587E59EA4F5EBF07]Sec. 18-3-30. Qualifications for permit.
In order to obtain a blasting permit, the applicant must: 
(1)	Have been issued a current explosives permit issued by the Colorado Department of Employment and Training pursuant to Section 9-7-101, et seq., C.R.S. 
(2)	Provide proof of workers' compensation insurance and general liability and property damage insurance coverage in an amount of at least one million dollars ($1,000,000.00). 
(3)	Provide a corporate surety bond in the principal sum of five hundred thousand dollars ($500,000.00) or public liability insurance policy for the same amount for the purpose of the payment of damages to persons or property which arise from, or are caused by, the blasting operations of a holder of a blasting permit. 
(4)	Provide evidence that the permittee is state certified in surface blasting operations.
(Prior code 18-160)
[bookmark: BK_47830183B115C4498B4C95325E83FBC0]Sec. 18-3-40. Blasting operations.
(a)	Blasting and drilling operations shall be conducted in accordance with this Chapter.
(b)	Explosives may only be handled by the permittee.
(c)	No person shall be on the property for which a blasting permit is issued or explosive materials are being handled or stored, while under the influence of alcohol, intoxicants, narcotics or other DEA-controlled substances during blasting operations, or at any other time. 
(d)	No person for which a blasting permit is issued shall smoke tobacco or any other substance within fifty (50) feet of any explosive material or have in his or her possession any matches, lighters or other spark-producing materials during blasting operations. 
(e)	No open flames shall be allowed on the property for which a blasting permit is issued during blasting operations. 
(f)	Only nonelectric initiation systems with 25 ms delay intervals may be used. Electric detonators or blasting caps are allowed only for the initiation of the blast. 
(g)	Prior to firing a blast, the permittee shall make certain that surplus explosive materials are in a safe place and that all persons and vehicles are at a safe distance or under sufficient cover. 
(h)	The permittee shall remove all debris, blasting caps and other materials related to the blasting operations from the site prior to leaving the site each day of blasting operations. 
(i)	All blasting and drilling operations shall be conducted according to the Fire Code as adopted by the City. 
(Prior code 18-161)
[bookmark: BK_A65DC2A279BB6AD822452FBA10588297]Sec. 18-3-50. Notification prior to blasting operations.
(a)	The Fire Department shall be notified thirty (30) minutes prior to any ignition of an explosive. 
(b)	The permittee must comply with the requirements of Section 9-1.5-101, et seq., C.R.S., regarding location of underground facilities prior to any blasting operations. 
(c)	The occupants of all property within two hundred (200) feet of the property for which a blasting permit is issued must be notified at least twenty-four (24) hours in advance by placing a notice on the door of all buildings within such area, and the permittee shall certify that such notice has been provided in writing to the City. Two (2) minutes prior to any blasting operations, the permittee will warn of the shot by use of an air horn that is clearly audible within such area. 
(Prior code 18-162)
[bookmark: BK_27CCD6EFC0E666F0354656BB94885086]Sec. 18-3-60. Blasting plan.
The permittee must submit, as part of the permit application, a detailed plan of the proposed blasting operations. All blasting operations shall be conducted in strict accordance with the approved blasting plan. Any changes to the planned blasting operations must be submitted as an amendment to the blasting plan to the City. The plan shall include: 
(1)	A map with north indicated by arrow, depicting the property for which a blasting permit is sought; the work area relative to any structures or other underground or overhead explosive materials to be used in the blast before, during and after each blast; the spacing, depth and diameter of bore holes; the area to be cleared of vehicles and persons immediately prior to and during any blast; and anything else required by applicable law, rule or regulation, or which the City determines is necessary to reasonably protect the public, health, safety and welfare of the residents of the City. 
(2)	A description of the maximum amount of explosives per day; the type of explosive product used; the method of ignition of the explosive; the loud warning signal that is to be sounded prior to each blast; the manner of locating and detonating any misfires; the manner in which qualified emergency and utility personnel are to be put on notice and called to respond in the event of an emergency; the manner of clearance of the site after blasting operations, including returning the site to its original condition; and anything else required by applicable law, rule or regulation, or which the City determines is necessary to reasonably protect the public, health, safety and welfare of the residents of the City. 
(Prior code 18-163)
[bookmark: BK_3A4DE76736560E6E28BCAD9C3AB9FA80]Sec. 18-3-70. Blasting specifications.
(a)	The maximum bore hole diameter shall be whatever is determined by the blaster as safe based upon a nationally accepted standard. 
(b)	The minimum bore hole depth shall be whatever is determined by the blaster as safe, based upon a nationally accepted standard. 
(c)	A seismograph must be used to monitor vibrations next to a structure when a structure is less than two hundred (200) feet from a borehole loaded with explosives. Seismographs may be required to be used by the City for structures farther away than two hundred (200) feet on a case-by-case basis. 
(d)	Explosive shall be used as determined by the blaster as safe based upon a nationally accepted standard. 
(e)	All boreholes containing explosives shall be adequately covered. Absent extenuating circumstances, adequate coverage may be blasting mats when the distance to the nearest structure is less than or equal to two hundred fifty (250) feet, and earth cover when the borehole is more than two hundred fifty (250) feet from the nearest structure. 
(f)	No blasting may occur within ten (10) feet of a structure unless determined by the blaster to be safe based upon a nationally accepted standard. 
(g)	Areas from which fugitive dust particulate emissions will be emitted shall be required to use all available and practical methods which are technologically feasible in order to minimize such emissions. All state and federal requirements shall be complied with during drilling and blasting operations. 
(Prior code 18-164)
[bookmark: BK_64D9535330DC5A048ADE82A33D7F5D4B]Sec. 18-3-80. Manufacture and storage of explosives.
Explosives may not be manufactured anywhere in the City. Explosives may not be anywhere other than locations approved by the Fire Chief in writing. However, explosives may be stored at the location of blasting operations in accordance with the terms of a blasting plan and storage permit that is required to store explosives in the City. 
(Prior code 18-165)
[bookmark: BK_1A5F4B66663AC17928631DBD25205A23]Sec. 18-3-90. Corrective measures.
(a)	The City, upon discovery of any defect in the work or for the permittee failing to complete the blasting operations or removal of debris for which a blasting permit is issued, may: 
(1)	In the event of an emergency, order a private contractor to do everything necessary to complete such work to acceptable standards, particularly where hazards exist due to the failure of the permittee to restore or maintain the site in accordance with the provisions and conditions of his or her permit. 
(2)	In the event of a nonemergency, give notice to the permittee and his or her sureties in writing of the nature and location of such defects, including notice of a reasonable time, not less than fourteen (14) calendar days, within which such defects are to be repaired. Such period of time may be extended by the City upon application for good cause shown. 
(3)	In the event of failure of the permittee to perform the required work within the period provided by such notice, a private contractor on order of the City shall make such repairs as may be necessary. 
(b)	The City shall recover any and all costs of work performed by its personnel or by a private contractor, including the cost of labor, equipment, materials and administrative costs at the expense of the permittee, by applying any deposit, bond, letter of credit or other security in its possession to payment thereof, and shall recover any remaining unpaid balance of such costs from the permittee. 
(Prior code 18-166)
[bookmark: BK_C18C1F6BFA0BD067AC38A460FCF1DA54]Sec. 18-3-100. Revocation of permit.
The City may revoke the permit granted by this Article if the applicant is found to have violated any of the provisions listed above, or in any of the following circumstances: 
(1)	The permittee violates any of the provisions of the ordinances of the City governing the activities permitted by the permit; 
(2)	The permittee obtains a permit by fraud or misrepresentation;
(3)	Revocation is necessary to maintain the public health, safety and welfare; or
(4)	The permittee fails to maintain the required insurance, bond, letter of credit or other guarantee of performance during the course of the construction and of the warranty period specified by the City. 
The City shall advise the permittee in writing of the grounds for revocation of the permit, and the permittee may be allowed to appeal such revocation to the City Council. 
(Prior code 18-167)
[bookmark: BK_7798C02EE5C238EB93C231A6633E139F]Sec. 18-3-110. Violation and penalties.
(a)	In addition to any other penalties authorized by this Code, the City is authorized to enforce this Article by injunction, including both the enjoining of contemplated actions or inactions in violation of this Article, including excavation or fill activities undertaken without or in violation of the terms of a permit; and mandatory injunction to require the removal of excavation or fill accomplished without or in violation of the terms of such a permit. In any such injunction action, the City shall be awarded its costs of suit and any costs incurred in the removal of fill and/or restoration of areas where fill or excavation activities have been undertaken in violation of the provisions of this Article. 
(b)	In addition, the City shall be entitled to recover its attorneys' fees incurred in bringing any action to compel compliance with the provisions of this Article or to compel compliance with any plan approved hereunder. 
(Prior code 18-168)
ARTICLE IV Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings
Sec. 18-4-10. Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings adopted.


[bookmark: BK_0C07398D50406F639CC1BF152DB8C01F]Sec. 18-4-10. Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings adopted.
The City hereby adopts the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1997 edition, published by the International Conference of Building Officials, 5360 Workman Mill Road, Whittier, CA. At least one (1) copy of the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings is available at the office of the City Clerk. 
(Prior code 18-181)
ARTICLE V Building Maintenance and Preservation of Rated and Contributing Structures
Sec. 18-5-10. Findings.
Sec. 18-5-20. Purpose and intent.
Sec. 18-5-30. Applicability.
Sec. 18-5-40. Application of other codes.
Sec. 18-5-50. Construction.
Sec. 18-5-60. Severability.
Sec. 18-5-70. Administration.
Sec. 18-5-80. Obligation to maintain; minimum requirements.
Sec. 18-5-90. Right of entry.
Sec. 18-5-100. Enforcement.
Sec. 18-5-110. Penalties.
Sec. 18-5-120. Municipal Court enforcement.
Sec. 18-5-130. Failure to pay.


[bookmark: BK_FE24B908106C02AD1668BCBFDBF58289]Sec. 18-5-10. Findings.
The City Council finds that the City's historical buildings are of significant importance to the overall value, economic vitality and unique character of the City. In so finding, the City Council has identified the need for property owners, agents, lessees and occupants of historic buildings to perform preventive maintenance in order to reduce the likelihood of demolition by neglect or replacement of historic buildings. 
(Prior code 18-201)
[bookmark: BK_B50B6F83172B272223E706DB91CBAEF6]Sec. 18-5-20. Purpose and intent.
The purpose of this Article is to protect rated and contributing structures from decay, deterioration, damage, dilapidation, neglect or negligence in order to: 
(1)	Preserve the historical architecture and character of the City;
(2)	Promote and protect the health, safety and welfare of the community; and
(3)	Prevent visual blight that diminishes the contributing status of the building as a rated or contributing structure. 
(Prior code 18-202)
[bookmark: BK_853211E5D68C8419F1A2BDD8ADD54D4A]Sec. 18-5-30. Applicability.
This Article shall apply to all rated and contributing structures and buildings located within the City as such terms are defined in Section 18-2-30 of this Chapter, as may be amended from time to time. References to buildings or structures used herein shall mean rated and contributing structures, as applicable. 
(Prior code 18-203)
[bookmark: BK_A6C60CE54ABF5EAF4C358C59DDDE4A4D]Sec. 18-5-40. Application of other codes.
Nothing in this Article shall be construed to modify, repeal or replace any provision of the International Building Codes, including but not limited to the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, adopted by the City and codified in this Chapter. 
(Prior code 18-204)
[bookmark: BK_696CCCDC9E94CAF2831C663476EE933C]Sec. 18-5-50. Construction.
This Article shall be liberally applied and construed to effectuate the purposes and intent of historic preservation set forth in this Article. 
(Prior code 18-205)
[bookmark: BK_2A73C1B4417E42B93188A00728F38648]Sec. 18-5-60. Severability.
If a section, subsection, clause or provision of this Article is, for any reason, held to be unconstitutional or invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this Article. 
(Prior code 18-206)
[bookmark: BK_7EBC802B58D21F9FB9B581EAC7E0CBA9]Sec. 18-5-70. Administration.
The Building Official and/or Historic Preservation Administrator are authorized and directed to administer the provisions of this Article. The Building Official and/or Historic Preservation Administrator shall have the power to render interpretations of this Article and to adopt and enforce rules and supplemental regulations in order to clarify the application of its provisions. Such interpretations, rules and regulations shall be in conformity with the intent and purposes of this Article. 
(Prior code 18-207)
[bookmark: BK_B851349F974140A25706EFE916E6519D]Sec. 18-5-80. Obligation to maintain; minimum requirements.
(a)	All owners shall maintain a rated or contributing structure in good repair and condition.
(b)	It shall be unlawful for an owner of a rated or contributing structure to allow:
(1)	The deterioration of exterior walls or other vertical supports as evidenced by cracks, moisture damage, warping, broken materials and other signs of decay and rotting; 
(2)	Deteriorated or inadequate foundation affecting its structural integrity;
(3)	The deterioration of roofs or other horizontal members;
(4)	The deterioration of external chimneys;
(5)	The deterioration or crumbling of exterior plasters, mortars, brick, stone or wood siding; 
(6)	The ineffective waterproofing of exterior walls, roof and foundations, including windows and doors; 
(7)	The peeling of paint, rotting, holes and other forms of decay;
(8)	The lack of maintenance of the surrounding environment, including but not limited to fences, gates, sidewalks, steps, retaining walls, signs and parking lots; 
(9)	The existence of broken windows or unsecured openings; or
(10)	The deterioration of any feature so as to create or permit the creation of any hazardous or unsafe condition. 
(Prior code 18-208)
[bookmark: BK_3BE9E284DADD7F224CFF039956A24CAD]Sec. 18-5-90. Right of entry.
(a)	The Building Official or Historic Preservation Administrator is authorized to enter upon all or any portion of private property to ascertain the existence of a violation of this Article if: 
(1)	Emergency conditions dangerous to the public health, safety or welfare are reasonably believed to exist upon such property or upon property which is accessible from the entered property; 
(2)	The Building Official or Historic Preservation Administrator has obtained a warrant from the Municipal Judge authorizing such entry; 
(3)	The private property is vacant and is not posted in a manner that would indicate the owner's prohibition of such access; or 
(4)	The Building Official or Historic Preservation Administrator has obtained consent of a person who purports to be in ownership, possession or control of the structure or property. 
(b)	The Municipal Judge shall have the power to issue a search warrant to permit the investigation of the existence of a violation under this Article upon a showing by the Building Official or Historic Preservation Administrator: (1) that there is probable cause that a violation exists; or (2) that, upon information and belief made after reasonable investigation, emergency conditions dangerous to the public health, safety or welfare may exist. 
(c)	The Building Official or Historic Preservation Administrator is authorized to enter upon private property in the same manner and by the same means as visitors to the property for the purpose of delivering, depositing, posting or otherwise providing a notice or other information necessary to implement or administer this Article. Such entry will customarily involve reaching the front or primary entrance to the property via the driveway, sidewalk, stairs or path. The Building Official or Historic Preservation Administrator shall not enter private property where the owner or person in possession denies consent except where emergency conditions are believed to exist or a search warrant authorizing entry is obtained. 
(Prior code 18-209)
[bookmark: BK_33F77278E0190D537D122B6B61FF833B]Sec. 18-5-100. Enforcement.
(a)	Notice to correct. Where the Building Official or Historic Preservation Administrator has reason to believe that a property owner has violated Section 18-5-80 above, such official shall send written notice to the property owner, and lessee or tenant, if any, of such violation. The notice to correct shall contain the following: 
(1)	Description of the property by street address or legal description.
(2)	Citation to the specific Subsections under Section 18-5-80 of this Article and identification of conditions for which maintenance is required. 
(3)	Statement and description of corrective action required to be taken with as much specificity as reasonably possible in order to remove or mitigate the deficiencies identified in Section 18-5-80 of this Article. 
(4)	The time period in which the noted corrective action must be commenced and/or completed. The time period for such corrective action must be reasonable in light of the work to be performed and shall not be less than thirty (30) days from the date of the written notice. 
(5)	Information on the right to appeal to the City Council.
(6)	Statement of possible enforcement action, including but not limited to abatement, citation into Municipal Court and/or denial or revocation of any applicable permits or licenses. 
(b)	Service of notice. The notice to correct shall be made upon the record property owner and any tenants or lessees of the structure by personal service or by mailing a copy of such notice to correct by regular and certified mail, postage prepaid, to each such person at his or her address as it appears on the property records of the county in which the structure is located. A copy of the notice to correct shall also be posted in a conspicuous location on the structure or property. Service by certified mail shall be effective on the date of mailing; personal service shall be effective on the date of such service. 
(c)	Proof of service. Proof of service of the notice to correct shall be certified at the time of service by a written declaration executed by the persons effecting service, declaring the time, date and manner in which service was made. The declaration, together with any receipt card returned in acknowledgment of receipt by certified mail, shall be affixed to the copy of the notice to correct retained by the Building Official or Historic Preservation Administrator. 
(d)	Compliance with notice to correct. The owner or owner's designee shall repair such building, structure or object within the period of time specified in the written notice to correct so that such structure shall be preserved and protected in accordance with the purposes of this Article. Upon good cause shown, the City may grant an owner's written request for an extension of time in which to complete the repairs, provided that the owner provides written justification and a schedule by which the repairs shall be completed. 
(e)	Right to appeal. A property owner may appeal in writing to the City Council any notice to correct within thirty (30) days of the date of the notice to correct. The City Council shall consider said appeal within thirty (30) days of the date of the notice of appeal or at the next regular City Council meeting, whichever occurs later. The City Council shall reverse a notice to correct only if it finds that the Historic Preservation Administrator or Building Official had no substantial justification for requiring action to be taken or that the measures required or time periods specified were not reasonable under all of the circumstances. 
(Prior code 18-210)
[bookmark: BK_93831944D250EEBEE770A44327B0B9CF]Sec. 18-5-110. Penalties.
Any property owner who shall violate a provision of this Article or fail to comply with a notice to correct or any requirement thereof shall be subject to any one (1) or more of the following penalties: 
(1)	Prosecution in Municipal Court in accordance with Section 1-4-20 of this Code. 
(2)	Denial, revocation or suspension of any license or permit, including but not limited to a business license, gaming device license or building permit. 
(3)	Abatement of the condition cited under Section 18-5-80 of this Article in accordance with the procedures for the abatement of nuisances specified in Sections 7-1-50 through 7-1-130 of this Code, except that the references to the Chief of Police therein shall mean, for purposes of this Section, the Building Official or Historic Preservation Administrator. 
(Prior code 18-211)
[bookmark: BK_B742D3B5D8C1FB245AE40DD3F7214EB4]Sec. 18-5-120. Municipal Court enforcement.
(a)	In any Municipal Court prosecution where it is found that a violation has occurred, the Municipal Court shall impose the following minimum penalty unless the City requests or consents to a lesser or different penalty: 
(1)	Enjoin or otherwise order the defendant property owner to fully abate and remedy the condition giving rise to the violation within a specified and reasonable period of time. 
(2)	Fine the defendant property owner for each violation an amount not less than two hundred fifty dollars ($250.00) nor more than the maximum fine authorized by Section 1-4-20 of this Code for this first violation; not less than five hundred dollars ($500.00) nor more than the maximum fine authorized by Section 1-4-20 of this Code for the second violation; and not less than seven hundred fifty dollars ($750.00) nor more than the maximum fine authorized by Section 1-4-20 of this Code for the third and each subsequent violation arising under this Article. No portion of any minimum fine may be suspended or held in abeyance by the Municipal Court. 
(3)	Order the defendant property owner to forthwith pay restitution to the City for the actual costs or loss caused to the City by the violation, including but not limited to administrative expenses, costs to protect the public from the violation, court costs and attorney fees. 
(4)	Authorize the City to assess any unpaid costs and expenses for abatement imposed by the Court in Paragraph (3) above as a lien against the owner's property and certify such lien to the County Clerk and Recorder for collection in the same manner as real estate taxes against the property. Each such lien shall have priority over other liens except general taxes and prior special assessments to the extent such priority is not precluded by state law. 
(b)	In addition to the minimum penalty required by this Section, the Municipal Court shall be authorized to: 
(1)	Permanently enjoin the defendant property owner from further engaging in the use of the structure or property in a manner that would constitute a violation of this Article; 
(2)	Find the property owner in contempt of Municipal Court and assess a penalty as specified by the Court, including a fine and/or imprisonment for failure to abide by, comply with or conform to any court order or injunction; and/or 
(3)	Impose any other penalty authorized by law.
(Prior code 18-212; Ord. 13-08 §9, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_4543C520A500BD3730A46686E6C32D8E]Sec. 18-5-130. Failure to pay.
Failure to timely pay an invoice, order or statement of costs issued by the City shall constitute a separate violation under this Article, which shall be subject to the penalties provided in Section 1-4-20 of this Code. 
(Prior code 18-213)
ARTICLE VI Flood Damage Prevention
Sec. 18-6-10. Findings of fact.
Sec. 18-6-20. Statement of purpose.
Sec. 18-6-30. Methods of reducing flood losses.
Sec. 18-6-40. Definitions.
Sec. 18-6-50. Lands to which this Article applies.
Sec. 18-6-60. Basis for establishing Special Flood Hazard Area.
Sec. 18-6-70. Establishment of Floodplain Development Permit.
Sec. 18-6-80. Compliance.
Sec. 18-6-90. Abrogation and greater restrictions.
Sec. 18-6-100. Interpretation.
Sec. 18-6-110. Warning and disclaimer of liability.
Sec. 18-6-120. Severability.
Sec. 18-6-130. Designation of Building Official.
Sec. 18-6-140. Duties and responsibilities of Building Official.
Sec. 18-6-150. Permit procedures.
Sec. 18-6-160. Variance procedures.
Sec. 18-6-170. Penalties for noncompliance.
Sec. 18-6-180. General standards.
Sec. 18-6-190. Specific standards.
Sec. 18-6-200. Standards for areas of shallow flooding (AO/AH zones).
Sec. 18-6-210. Floodways.
Sec. 18-6-220. Alteration of watercourse.
Sec. 18-6-230. Properties removed from floodplain by fill.
Sec. 18-6-240. Standards for subdivision proposals.
Sec. 18-6-250. Standards for critical facilities.


[bookmark: BK_F8625604E9EFCB27C70A7785ABA562B9]Sec. 18-6-10. Findings of fact.
(a)	The flood hazard areas of the City are subject to periodic inundation which results in loss of life and property, health and safety hazards, disruption of commerce, disruption of governmental services and extraordinary public expenditures for flood protection and relief, all of which adversely affect the public safety and welfare. 
(b)	These flood losses are created by the cumulative effect of obstructions in floodplains which cause an increase in flood heights and velocities, and by the occupancy of flood hazard areas by uses vulnerable to floods and hazardous to other lands because they are inadequately elevated, floodproofed or otherwise protected from flood damage. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_724547DF60DA277E1BF689BCEE8DD392]Sec. 18-6-20. Statement of purpose.
It is the purpose of this Article to promote public health, safety and general welfare and to minimize public and private losses due to flood conditions in specific areas by provisions designed to: 
(1)	Protect human life and health;
(2)	Minimize expenditure of public money for costly flood control projects;
(3)	Minimize the need for rescue and relief efforts associated with flooding and generally undertaken at the expense of the general public; 
(4)	Minimize prolonged business interruptions;
(5)	Minimize damage to critical facilities, infrastructure and other public facilities such as water, sewer and gas mains; electric and communications stations; and streets and bridges located in floodplains; 
(6)	Help maintain a stable tax base by providing for the sound use and development of flood-prone areas in such a manner as to minimize future flood blight areas; and 
(7)	Ensure that potential buyers are notified that property is located in a flood hazard area. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_DF0735A7CB45940074FD1A151287E271]Sec. 18-6-30. Methods of reducing flood losses.
In order to accomplish its purposes, this Article uses the following methods: 
(1)	Restrict or prohibit uses that are dangerous to health, safety or property in times of flood or cause excessive increases in flood heights or velocities; 
(2)	Require that uses vulnerable to floods, including facilities which serve such uses, be protected against flood damage at the time of initial construction; 
(3)	Control the alteration of natural floodplains, stream channels and natural protective barriers, which are involved in the accommodation of floodwaters; 
(4)	Control filling, grading, dredging and other development which may increase flood damage; 
(5)	Prevent or regulate the construction of flood barriers which will unnaturally divert floodwaters or which may increase flood hazards to other lands. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_9056709E4367B11D07F87B4968603B75]Sec. 18-6-40. Definitions.
Unless specifically defined below, words or phrases used in this Article shall be interpreted to give them the meaning they have in common usage and to give this Article its most reasonable application. 
Alluvial fan flooding means a fan-shaped sediment deposit formed by a stream that flows from a steep mountain valley or gorge onto a plain or the junction of a tributary stream with the main stream. Alluvial fans contain active stream channels and boulder bars and recently abandoned channels. Alluvial fans are predominantly formed by alluvial deposits and are modified by infrequent sheet flood, channel avulsions and other stream processes. 
Area of shallow flooding means a designated Zone AO or AH on a community's Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) with a one-percent chance or greater annual chance of flooding to an average depth of one (1) to three (3) feet where a clearly defined channel does not exist, where the path of flooding is unpredictable and where velocity flow may be evident. Such flooding is characterized by ponding or sheet flow. 
Base Flood Elevation (BFE) means the elevation shown on a FEMA Flood Insurance Rate Map for Zones AE, AH, A1-A30, AR, AR/A, AR/AE, AR/A1-A30, AR/AH, AR/ AO, V1-V30 and VE that indicates the water surface elevation resulting from a flood that has a one-percent chance of equaling or exceeding that level in any given year. 
Basement means any area of a building having its floor sub-grade (below ground level) on all sides. 
Channel means the physical confine of stream or waterway consisting of a bed and stream banks, existing in a variety of geometries. 
Channelization means the artificial creation, enlargement or realignment of a stream channel. 
Conditional Letter of Map Revision (CLOMR) means FEMA's comment on a proposed project, which does not revise an effective floodplain map, that would, upon construction, affect the hydrologic or hydraulic characteristics of a flooding source and thus result in the modification of the existing regulatory floodplain. 
Critical facility means a structure or related infrastructure, but not the land on which it is situated, as further defined and specified in Rule 6 of the Rules and Regulations for Regulatory Floodplains in Colorado effective January 14, 2011, adopted by the Department of Natural Resources, Colorado Water Conservation Board and adopted herein by reference, that, if flooded, may result in significant hazards to public health and safety or interrupt essential services and operations for the community at any time before, during and after a flood. 
Development means any man-made change in improved and unimproved real estate, including but not limited to buildings or other structures, mining, dredging, filling, grading, paving, excavation or drilling operations or storage of equipment or materials. 
DFIRM database means database (usually spreadsheets containing data and analyses that accompany DFIRMs). The FEMA Mapping Specifications and Guidelines outline requirements for the development and maintenance of DFIRM databases. 
Digital Flood Insurance Rate Map (DFIRM) means a FEMA digital floodplain map. These digital maps serve as "regulatory floodplain maps" for insurance and floodplain management purposes. 
Elevated building means a nonbasement building (i) built, in the case of a building in Zones A1-30, AE, A, A99, AO, AH, B, C, X and D, to have the top of the elevated floor above the ground level by means of pilings, columns (posts and piers) or shear walls parallel to the flow of the water and (ii) adequately anchored so as not to impair the structural integrity of the building during a flood of up to the magnitude of the base flood. In the case of Zones A1-30, AE, A, A99, AO, AH, B, C, X and D, elevated building also includes a building elevated by means of fill or solid foundation perimeter walls with openings sufficient to facilitate the unimpeded movement of floodwaters. 
Existing manufactured home park or subdivision means a manufactured home park or subdivision for which the construction of facilities for servicing the lots on which the manufactured homes are to be affixed (including, at a minimum, the installation of utilities, the construction of streets and either final site grading or the pouring of concrete pads) is completed before the effective date of the floodplain management regulations adopted by a community. 
Expansion to an existing manufactured home park or subdivision means the preparation of additional sites by the construction of facilities for servicing the lots on which the manufactured homes are to be affixed (including the installation of utilities, the construction of streets and either final site grading or the pouring of concrete pads). 
Federal Register means the official daily publication for rules, proposed rules and notices of federal agencies and organizations, as well as executive orders and other presidential documents. 
FEMA means the Federal Emergency Management Agency, the agency responsible for administering the National Flood Insurance Program. 
Flood control structure means a physical structure designed and built expressly or partially for the purpose of reducing, redirecting or guiding flood flows along a particular waterway. These specialized flood modifying works are those constructed in conformance with sound engineering standards. 
Flood or flooding means a general and temporary condition of partial or complete inundation of normally dry land areas from: 
a.	The overflow of water from channels and reservoir spillways;
b.	The unusual and rapid accumulation or runoff of surface waters from any source; or
c.	Mudslides or mudflows that occur from excess surface water that is combined with mud or other debris that is sufficiently fluid so as to flow over the surface of normally dry land areas (such as earth carried by a current of water and deposited along the path of the current). 
Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) means an official map of a community on which the Federal Emergency Management Agency has delineated both the Special Flood Hazard Areas and the risk premium zones applicable to the community. 
Flood Insurance Study (FIS) means the official report provided by the Federal Emergency Management Agency. The report contains the Flood Insurance Rate Map as well as flood profiles for studied flooding sources that can be used to determine Base Flood Elevations for some areas. 
Floodplain or flood-prone area means any land area susceptible to being inundated as the result of a flood, including the area of land over which floodwater would flow from the spillway of a reservoir. 
Floodplain development permit means a permit required before construction or development begins within any Special Flood Hazard Area (SFHA). If FEMA has not defined the SFHA within a community, the community shall require permits for all proposed construction or other development in the community, including the placement of manufactured homes, so that it may determine whether such construction or other development is proposed within flood-prone areas. Permits are required to ensure that proposed development projects meet the requirements of the NFIP and this Article. 
Floodplain management means the operation of an overall program of corrective and preventive measures for reducing flood damage, including but not limited to emergency preparedness plans, flood control works and floodplain management regulations. 
Floodplain management regulations means zoning ordinances, subdivision regulations, building codes, health regulations, special purpose ordinances (such as a floodplain ordinance, grading ordinance and erosion control ordinance) and other applications of police power. The term describes such state or local regulations, in any combination thereof, which provide standards for the purpose of flood damage prevention and reduction. 
Floodproofing means any combination of structural and/or nonstructural additions, changes or adjustments to structures which reduce or eliminate flood damage to real estate or improved real property, water and sanitary facilities, structures and their contents. 
Floodway (regulatory floodway) means the channel of a river or other watercourse and adjacent land areas that must be reserved in order to discharge the base flood without cumulatively increasing the water surface elevation more than a designated height. The statewide standard for the designated height to be used for all newly studied reaches shall be one-half (½) foot (six [6] inches). Letters of Map Revision to existing floodway delineations may continue to use the floodway criteria in place at the time of the existing floodway delineation. 
Freeboard means the vertical distance in feet above a predicted water surface elevation intended to provide a margin of safety to compensate for unknown factors that could contribute to flood heights greater than the height calculated for a selected size flood, such as debris blockage of bridge openings and the increased runoff due to urbanization of the watershed. 
Functionally dependent use means a use which cannot perform its intended purpose unless it is located or carried out in close proximity to water. The term includes only docking facilities, port facilities that are necessary for the loading and unloading of cargo or passengers and ship building and ship repair facilities, but does not include long-term storage or related manufacturing facilities. 
Highest adjacent grade means the highest natural elevation of the ground surface prior to construction next to the proposed walls of a structure. 
Historic structure means any structure that is: 
a.	Listed individually in the National Register of Historic Places (a listing maintained by the Department of Interior) or preliminarily determined by the Secretary of the Interior as meeting the requirements for individual listing on the National Register; 
b.	Certified or preliminarily determined by the Secretary of the Interior as contributing to the historical significance of a registered historic district or a district preliminarily determined by the Secretary of the Interior to qualify as a registered historic district; 
c.	Individually listed on a state inventory of historic places in states with historic preservation programs which have been approved by the Secretary of the Interior; or 
d.	Individually listed on a local inventory of historic places in communities with historic preservation programs that have been certified either: 
1.	By an approved state program as determined by the Secretary of the Interior; or
2.	Directly by the Secretary of the Interior in states without approved programs.
Letter of Map Revision (LOMR) means FEMA's official revision of an effective Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM), or Flood Boundary and Floodway Map (FBFM), or both. LOMRs are generally based on the implementation of physical measures that affect the hydrologic or hydraulic characteristics of a flooding source and thus result in the modification of the existing regulatory floodway, the effective Base Flood Elevations (BFEs) or the Special Flood Hazard Area (SFHA). 
Letter of Map Revision Based on Fill (LOMR-F) means FEMA's modification of the Special Flood Hazard Area (SFHA) shown on the Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) based on the placement of fill outside the existing regulatory floodway. 
Levee means a man-made embankment, usually earthen, designed and constructed in accordance with sound engineering practices to contain, control or divert the flow of water so as to provide protection from temporary flooding. For a levee structure to be reflected on the FEMA FIRMs as providing flood protection, the levee structure must meet the requirements set forth in 44 C.F.R. 65.10. 
Levee system means a flood protection system which consists of a levee or levees and associated structures, such as closure and drainage devices which are constructed and operated in accordance with sound engineering practices. 
Lowest floor means the lowest floor of the lowest enclosed area (including basement). Any floor used for living purposes which includes working, storage, sleeping, cooking and eating or recreation or any combination thereof. This includes any floor that could be converted to such a use such as a basement or crawl space. The lowest floor is a determinate for the flood insurance premium for a building, home or business. An unfinished or flood-resistant enclosure, usable solely for parking or vehicles, building access or storage in an area other than a basement area is not considered a building's lowest floor; provided that such enclosure is not built so as to render the structure in violation of the applicable non-elevation design requirement of Section 60.3 of the National Flood Insurance Program regulations. 
Manufactured home means a structure transportable in one (1) or more sections, which is built on a permanent chassis and is designed for use with or without a permanent foundation when connected to the required utilities. The term manufactured home does not include a recreational vehicle. 
Manufactured home park or subdivision means a parcel (or contiguous parcels) of land divided into two (2) or more manufactured home lots for rent or sale. 
Mean sea level means, for purposes of the National Flood Insurance Program, the North American Vertical Datum (NAVD) of 1988 or other datum, to which Base Flood Elevations shown on a community's Flood Insurance Rate Map are referenced. 
Material Safety Data Sheet (MSDS) means a form with data regarding the properties of a particular substance. An important component of product stewardship and workplace safety, it is intended to provide workers and emergency personnel with procedures for handling or working with that substance in a safe manner and includes information such as physical data (melting point, boiling point, flash point, etc.), toxicity, health effects, first aid, reactivity, storage, disposal, protective equipment and spill-handling procedures. 
National Flood Insurance Program (NFIP) means FEMA's program of flood insurance coverage and floodplain management administered in conjunction with the Robert T. Stafford Relief and Emergency Assistance Act. The NFIP has applicable Federal regulations promulgated in Title 44 of the Code of Federal Regulations. The U.S. Congress established the NFIP in 1968 with the passage of the National Flood Insurance Act of 1968. 
New manufactured home park or subdivision means a manufactured home park or subdivision for which the construction of facilities for servicing the lots on which the manufactured homes are to be affixed (including at a minimum, the installation of utilities, the construction of streets and either final site grading or the pouring of concrete pads) is completed on or after the effective date of floodplain management regulations adopted by a community. 
No-rise certification means a record of the results of an engineering analysis conducted to determine whether a project will increase flood heights in a floodway. A no-rise certification must be supported by technical data and signed by a registered Colorado professional engineer. The supporting technical data should be based on the standard step-backwater computer model used to develop the 100-year floodway shown on the Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) or Flood Boundary and Floodway Map (FBFM). 
Physical Map Revision (PMR) means FEMA's action whereby one (1) or more map panels are physically revised and republished. A PMR is used to change flood risk zones, floodplain and/or floodway delineations, flood elevations and/or planimetric features. 
Recreational vehicle means a vehicle which is: 
a.	Built on a single chassis;
b.	Four hundred (400) square feet or less when measured at the largest horizontal projections;
c.	Designed to be self-propelled or permanently towable by a light-duty truck; and
d.	Designed primarily not for use as a permanent dwelling but as temporary living quarters for recreational, camping, travel or seasonal use. 
Special Flood Hazard Area means the land in the floodplain within a community subject to a one-percent-or-greater chance of flooding in any given year, i.e., the 100-year floodplain. 
Start of construction means the date the building permit was issued, including substantial improvements, provided the actual start of construction, repair, reconstruction, rehabilitation, addition, placement or other improvement was within one hundred eighty (180) days of the permit date. The actual start means either the first placement of permanent construction of a structure on a site, such as the pouring of slab or footings, the installation of piles, the construction of columns or any work beyond the stage of excavation; or the placement of a manufactured home on a foundation. Permanent construction does not include land preparation, such as clearing, grading and filling; nor does it include the installation of streets and/or walkways; nor does it include excavation for basement, footings, piers or foundations or the erection of temporary forms; nor does it include the installation on the property of accessory buildings, such as garages or sheds not occupied as dwelling units or not part of the main structure. For a substantial improvement, the actual start of construction means the first alteration of any wall, ceiling, floor or other structural part of a building, whether or not that alteration affects the external dimensions of the building. 
Structure means a walled and roofed building, including a gas or liquid storage tank, which is principally above ground, as well as a manufactured home. 
Substantial damage means damage of any origin sustained by a structure whereby the cost of restoring the structure to its before-damaged condition would equal or exceed fifty percent (50%) of the market value of the structure just prior to when the damage occurred. 
Substantial improvement means any reconstruction, rehabilitation, addition or other improvement of a structure, the cost of which equals or exceeds fifty percent (50%) of the market value of the structure before start of construction of the improvement. The value of the structure shall be determined by the local jurisdiction having land use authority in the area of interest. This includes structures which have incurred substantial damage, regardless of the actual repair work performed. The term does not, however, include either: 
a.	Any project for improvement of a structure to correct existing violations of state or local health, sanitary or safety code specifications which have been identified by the local code enforcement official and which are the minimum necessary conditions; or 
b.	Any alteration of a historic structure provided that the alteration will not preclude the structure's continued designation as a historic structure. 
Threshold Planning Quantity (TPQ) means a quantity designated for each chemical on the list of extremely hazardous substances that triggers notification by facilities to the State that such facilities are subject to emergency planning requirements. 
Variance means a grant of relief to a person from the requirement of this Article when specific enforcement would result in unnecessary hardship. A variance, therefore, permits construction or development in a manner otherwise prohibited by this Article. 
(For full requirements, see Section 60.6 of the National Flood Insurance Program regulations).
Violation means the failure of a structure or other development to be fully compliant with the community's floodplain management regulations. A structure or other development without the elevation certificate, other certifications or other evidence of compliance required in Section 60.3(b)(5), (c)(4), (c)(10), (d)(3), (e)(2), (e)(4) or (e)(5) of the NFIP regulations is presumed to be in violation until such time as that documentation is provided. 
Water surface elevation means the height, in relation to the North American Vertical Datum (NAVD) of 1988 (or other datum, where specified), of floods of various magnitudes and frequencies in the floodplains of coastal or riverine areas. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_11A10B3384D0629E2118056B09727DE3]Sec. 18-6-50. Lands to which this Article applies.
This Article shall apply to all Special Flood Hazard Areas and areas removed from the floodplain by the issuance of a FEMA Letter of Map Revision Based on Fill (LOMR-F) within the jurisdiction of the City. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_7F266265D0E0D597D260BC9DCDED0D39]Sec. 18-6-60. Basis for establishing Special Flood Hazard Area.
The Special Flood Hazard Areas identified by the Federal Emergency Management Agency in a scientific and engineering report entitled, "The Flood Insurance Study for Gilpin County and the City of Central," dated February 16, 1994, with accompanying Flood Insurance Rate Maps (FIRMs) and any revisions thereto, duly adopted following the effective date of this Article, are hereby adopted by reference and declared to be a part of this Article. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_EA1D271F3B97749A1D202EFE3023CEFB]Sec. 18-6-70. Establishment of Floodplain Development Permit.
A Floodplain Development Permit shall be required to ensure conformance with the provisions of this Article. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_93E3ADC2B48D6B1912BF5E06B07F985D]Sec. 18-6-80. Compliance.
No structure or land shall hereafter be located, altered or have its use changed within the Special Flood Hazard Area without full compliance with the terms of this Article and other applicable regulations. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_E03E9ED65A98A784912F42E0F8AE1515]Sec. 18-6-90. Abrogation and greater restrictions.
This Article is not intended to repeal, abrogate or impair any existing easements, covenants or deed restrictions. However, where this Article and another provision of this Code conflict, whichever imposes the more stringent restrictions shall prevail. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_0A7D95F7BA363A7F36F70CABE4E87572]Sec. 18-6-100. Interpretation.
In the interpretation and application of this Article, all provisions shall be: 
(1)	Considered as minimum requirements;
(2)	Liberally construed in favor of the City; and
(3)	Deemed neither to limit nor repeal any other powers granted to the City under state statutes or the City's Home Rule Charter. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_DF9C2C641876EBA5725FD9615D69FCBD]Sec. 18-6-110. Warning and disclaimer of liability.
The degree of flood protection required by this Article is considered reasonable for regulatory purposes and is based on scientific and engineering considerations. On rare occasions greater floods can and will occur and flood heights may be increased by man-made or natural causes. This Article does not imply that land outside the Special Flood Hazard Area or uses permitted within such areas will be free from flooding or flood damages. This Article shall not create liability on the part of the City or any official or employee thereof for any flood damages that result from reliance on this Article, any administrative decision of the City or any other decision lawfully made hereunder. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_3D5B5264E65EE07E4BD9318A2317BEAB]Sec. 18-6-120. Severability.
This Article and the various parts thereof are hereby declared to be severable. Should any section of this Article be declared by a court of competent jurisdiction to be unconstitutional or invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity of the Article as a whole or any portion thereof other than the section so declared to be unconstitutional or invalid. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_D15FB025527B00A09A5055C71BCE0972]Sec. 18-6-130. Designation of Building Official.
The Building Official is hereby appointed to administer, implement and enforce the provisions of this Article and other appropriate sections of 44 C.F.R. 
(NFIP) pertaining to floodplain management.
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_C05E9308D1A02E00C3D1B3F6B598724D]Sec. 18-6-140. Duties and responsibilities of Building Official.
Duties and responsibilities of the Building Official shall include, but not be limited to, the following: 
(1)	Maintain and hold open for public inspection all records pertaining to the provisions of this Article in accordance with the Colorado Open Records Act. 
(2)	Review, approve or deny all applications for Floodplain Development Permits required by the adoption of this Article. 
(3)	Review Floodplain Development Permit applications to determine whether a proposed building site, including the placement of manufactured homes, will be reasonably safe from flooding. 
(4)	Review permits for proposed development to assure that all necessary permits have been obtained from those federal, state or local governmental agencies (including Section 404 of the Federal Water Pollution Control Act Amendments of 1972, 33 U.S.C. 1334) from which prior approval is required. 
(5)	Inspect all development at appropriate times during the period of construction to ensure compliance with all provisions of this Article, including proper elevation of the structure. 
(6)	Where interpretation is needed as to the exact location of the boundaries of the Special Flood Hazard Area (for example, where there appears to be a conflict between a mapped boundary and actual field conditions) the Building Official shall make the necessary interpretation. 
(7)	When Base Flood Elevation data has not been provided in accordance with Section 18-6-60 of this Article, the Building Official shall obtain, review and reasonably utilize any Base Flood Elevation data and floodway data available from a federal, state or other source in order to administer the provisions of this Article. 
(8)	For waterways with Base Flood Elevations for which a regulatory floodway has not been designated, no new construction, substantial improvements or other development (including fill) shall be permitted within Zones A1-30 and AE on the community's FIRM, unless it is demonstrated that the cumulative effect of the proposed development, when combined with all other existing and anticipated development, will not increase the water surface elevation of the base flood more than one-half (½) foot at any point within the community. 
(9)	Under the provisions of 44 C.F.R., Chapter 1, Section 65.12 of the NFIP regulations, a community may approve certain development in Zones A1-30, AE and AH on the community's FIRM which increases the water surface elevation of the base flood by more than one-half (½) foot, provided that the community first applies for a conditional FIRM revision through FEMA (Conditional Letter of Map Revision), fulfills the requirements for such revisions as established under the provisions of Section 65.12 and receives FEMA approval. 
(10)	Notify adjacent communities and the state coordinating agency, which is the Colorado Water Conservation Board, prior to any alteration or relocation of a watercourse, and submit evidence of such notification to FEMA. 
(11)	Ensure that the flood-carrying capacity within the altered or relocated portion of any watercourse is maintained. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_1D213319130182A9839D9B10AEB3C151]Sec. 18-6-150. Permit procedures.
(a)	An application for a Floodplain Development Permit shall be presented to the Building Official on forms furnished by him or her and may include, but not be limited to, plans in duplicate drawn to scale showing the location, dimensions and elevation of proposed landscape alterations, existing and proposed structures, including the placement of manufactured homes and the location of the foregoing in relation to Special Flood Hazard Area. Additionally, the following information is required: 
(1)	Elevation (in relation to mean sea level) of the lowest floor (including basement) of all new and substantially improved structures; 
(2)	Elevation in relation to mean sea level to which any nonresidential structure shall be floodproofed; 
(3)	A certificate from a registered Colorado professional engineer or architect that the nonresidential floodproofed structure shall meet the floodproofing criteria of Paragraph 18-6-190(2); 
(4)	Description of the extent to which any watercourse or natural drainage will be altered or relocated as a result of proposed development. 
(5)	Maintain a record of all such information in accordance with Paragraph 18-6-140(1) above. 
(b)	Approval or denial of a Floodplain Development Permit by the City Manager shall be based on all of the provisions of this Article and the following relevant factors: 
(1)	The danger to life and property due to flooding or erosion damage;
(2)	The susceptibility of the proposed facility and its contents to flood damage and the effect of such damage on the individual owner; 
(3)	The danger that materials may be swept onto other lands to the injury of others;
(4)	The compatibility of the proposed use with existing and anticipated development;
(5)	The safety of access to the property in times of flood for ordinary and emergency vehicles; 
(6)	The costs of providing governmental services during and after flood conditions, including maintenance and repair of streets and bridges, and public utilities and facilities such as sewer, gas, electrical and water systems; 
(7)	The expected heights, velocity, duration, rate of rise and sediment transport of the floodwaters and the effects of wave action, if applicable, expected at the site; 
(8)	The necessity to the facility of a waterfront location, where applicable;
(9)	The availability of alternative locations, not subject to flooding or erosion damage, for the proposed use; 
(10)	The relationship of the proposed use to the Comprehensive Plan for that area.
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_D1BE2A4EAADA3BEB8154F3FC26546DEA]Sec. 18-6-160. Variance procedures.
(a)	The City Council shall hear and render judgment on requests for variances from the requirements of this Article. 
(b)	The City Council shall hear and render judgment on an appeal only when it is alleged there is an error in any requirement, decision or determination made by the Building Official in the enforcement or administration of this Article. 
(c)	Any person or persons aggrieved by the decision of the City Council may appeal such decision in a court of competent jurisdiction, pursuant to C.R.C.P., 106(a)(4). 
(d)	The Building Official shall maintain a record of all actions involving an appeal and shall report variances to the Federal Emergency Management Agency upon request. 
(e)	Variances may be issued for new construction and substantial improvements to be erected on a lot of one-half (½) acre or less in size contiguous to and surrounded by lots with existing structures constructed below the base flood level, providing the relevant factors in Subsection 18-6-150(b) above have been fully considered. As the lot size increases beyond the one-half (½) acre, the technical justification required for issuing the variance increases. 
(f)	Upon consideration of the factors noted above and the intent of this Article, the Appeal Board may attach such conditions to the granting of variances as it deems necessary to further the purpose and objectives of this Article as stated in Section 18-6-20 of this Article. 
(g)	Variances shall not be issued within any designated floodway if any increase in flood levels during the base flood discharge would result. 
(h)	Variances may be issued for the repair or rehabilitation of historic structures upon a determination that the proposed repair or rehabilitation will not preclude the structure's continued designation as a historic structure and the variance is the minimum necessary to preserve the historic character and design of the structure. 
(i)	Prerequisites for granting variances:
(1)	Variances shall only be issued upon a determination that the variance is the minimum necessary, considering the flood hazard, to afford relief. 
(2)	Variances shall only be issued upon:
a.	Showing a good and sufficient cause;
b.	A determination that failure to grant the variance would result in exceptional hardship to the applicant; and 
c.	A determination that the granting of a variance will not result in increased flood heights, additional threats to public safety, extraordinary public expense, create nuisances, cause fraud on or victimization of the public or conflict with existing local laws or ordinances. 
(3)	Any applicant to whom a variance is granted shall be given written notice that the structure will be permitted to be built with the lowest floor elevation below the Base Flood Elevation and that the cost of flood insurance will be commensurate with the increased risk resulting from the reduced lowest floor elevation. 
(j)	Variances may be issued by the City for new construction and substantial improvements and for other development necessary for the conduct of a functionally dependent use provided that: 
(1)	The criteria outlined in this Section are met; and
(2)	The structure or other development is protected by methods that minimize flood damages during the base flood and create no additional threats to public safety. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_50E5C7DA25593E8EF86522CBF4C69E9C]Sec. 18-6-170. Penalties for noncompliance.
Failure to comply with the terms of this Article shall constitute a civil infraction. Any person who is found guilty of, or pleads guilty or nolo contedere to the commission of the civil infraction shall be subject to a civil penalty as set forth in Section 1-4-20 of this Code. For each day or portion thereof during which any violation continues, a person may be cited for a separate civil infraction. The penalties specified in this Section shall be cumulative and nothing shall be construed as either prohibiting or limiting the City from pursuing such other remedies or penalties in an action at law or equity. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_518D1A0FD53890D5DCAEBFBC4164B452]Sec. 18-6-180. General standards.
In all Special Flood Hazard Areas the following provisions are required for all new construction and substantial improvements: 
(1)	All new construction or substantial improvements shall be designed (or modified) and adequately anchored to prevent flotation, collapse or lateral movement of the structure resulting from hydrodynamic and hydrostatic loads, including the effects of buoyancy; 
(2)	All new construction or substantial improvements shall be constructed by methods and practices that minimize flood damage; 
(3)	All new construction or substantial improvements shall be constructed with materials resistant to flood damage; 
(4)	All new construction or substantial improvements shall be constructed with electrical, heating, ventilation, plumbing and air conditioning equipment and other service facilities that are designed and/or located so as to prevent water from entering or accumulating within the components during conditions of flooding; 
(5)	All manufactured homes shall be installed using methods and practices which minimize flood damage. For the purposes of this requirement, manufactured homes must be elevated and anchored to resist flotation, collapse or lateral movement. Methods of anchoring may include, but are not limited to, use of over-the-top or frame ties to ground anchors. This requirement is in addition to applicable state and local anchoring requirements for resisting wind forces. 
(6)	All new and replacement water supply systems shall be designed to minimize or eliminate infiltration of floodwaters into the system; 
(7)	New and replacement sanitary sewage systems shall be designed to minimize or eliminate infiltration of floodwaters into the system and discharge from the systems into floodwaters; and 
(8)	On-site waste disposal systems shall be located to avoid impairment to them or contamination from them during flooding. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_48CDDE7ACD9D2B12638D79C103431644]Sec. 18-6-190. Specific standards.
In all Special Flood Hazard Areas where Base Flood Elevation data has been provided as set forth in Section 18-6-60, Paragraph 18-6-140(7) or Section 18-6-240 of this Article, the following provisions are required: 
(1)	Residential construction. New construction and substantial improvement of any residential structure shall have the lowest floor (including basement), electrical, heating, ventilation, plumbing and air conditioning equipment and other service facilities (including ductwork) elevated to one (1) foot above the Base Flood Elevation. Upon completion of the structure, the elevation of the lowest floor, including basement, shall be certified by a registered Colorado professional engineer, architect or land surveyor. Such certification shall be submitted to the Building Official. 
(2)	Nonresidential construction. With the exception of critical facilities, new construction and substantial improvements of any commercial, industrial or other nonresidential structure shall either have the lowest floor (including basement), electrical, heating, ventilation, plumbing and air conditioning equipment and other service facilities (including ductwork) elevated to one (1) foot above the Base Flood Elevation or, together with attendant utility and sanitary facilities, be designed so that at one (1) foot above the Base Flood Elevation the structure is watertight with walls substantially impermeable to the passage of water and with structural components having the capability of resisting hydrostatic and hydrodynamic loads and effects of buoyancy. 
A registered Colorado professional engineer or architect shall develop and/or review structural design, specifications and plans for the construction, and shall certify that the design and methods of construction are in accordance with accepted standards of practice as outlined in this Subsection. Such certification shall be maintained by the Building Official as set forth in Section 18-6-150 above. 
(3)	Enclosures. New construction and substantial improvements, with fully enclosed areas below the lowest floor that are usable solely for parking of vehicles, building access or storage in an area other than a basement and which are subject to flooding, shall be designed to automatically equalize hydrostatic flood forces on exterior walls by allowing for the entry and exit of floodwaters. 
Designs for meeting this requirement must either be certified by a registered Colorado professional engineer or architect or meet or exceed the following minimum criteria: 
a.	A minimum of two (2) openings having a total net area of not less than one (1) square inch for every square foot of enclosed area subject to flooding shall be provided. 
b.	The bottom of all openings shall be no higher than one (1) foot above grade.
c.	Openings may be equipped with screens, louvers, valves or other coverings or devices provided that they permit the automatic entry and exit of floodwaters. 
(4)	Manufactured homes. All manufactured homes that are placed or substantially improved within Zones A1-30, AH and AE on the community's FIRM on sites (i) outside of a manufactured home park or subdivision, (ii) in a new manufactured home park or subdivision, (iii) in an expansion to an existing manufactured home park or subdivision or (iv) in an existing manufactured home park or subdivision on which manufactured home has incurred substantial damage as a result of a flood, be elevated on a permanent foundation such that the lowest floor of the manufactured home, electrical, heating, ventilation, plumbing and air conditioning equipment and other service facilities (including ductwork) are elevated to one (1) foot above the Base Flood Elevation and be securely anchored to an adequately anchored foundation system to resist flotation, collapse and lateral movement. 
All manufactured homes placed or substantially improved on sites in an existing manufactured home park or subdivision within Zones A1-30, AH and AE on the community's FIRM that are not subject to the provisions of the above Paragraph (4), shall be elevated so that either: 
a.	The lowest floor of the manufactured home, electrical, heating, ventilation, plumbing and air conditioning equipment and other service facilities (including ductwork) are one (1) foot above the Base Flood Elevation; or 
b.	The manufactured home chassis is supported by reinforced piers or other foundation elements of at least equivalent strength that are no less than thirty-six (36) inches in height above grade and be securely anchored to an adequately anchored foundation system to resist flotation, collapse and lateral movement. 
(5)	Recreational vehicles. All recreational vehicles placed on sites within Zones A1-30, AH and AE on the community's FIRM either: 
a.	Be on the site for fewer than one hundred eighty (180) consecutive days,
b.	Be fully licensed and ready for highway use, or
c.	Meet the permit requirements of Section 18-6-150 above and the elevation and anchoring requirements for manufactured homes in Paragraph (4) above. 
A recreational vehicle is ready for highway use if it is on its wheels or jacking system, is attached to the site only by quick disconnect type utilities and security devices and has no permanently attached additions. 
(6)	Prior approved activities. Any activity for which a Floodplain Development Permit was issued by the City or a CLOMR was issued by FEMA prior to April 15, 2013, may be completed according to the standards in place at the time of the permit or CLOMR issuance and will not be considered in violation of this Article if it meets such standards. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_D03946EE139D41291872D277EF38C23B]Sec. 18-6-200. Standards for areas of shallow flooding (AO/AH zones).
Located within the Special Flood Hazard Area established in Section 18-6-60 of this Article, are areas designated as shallow flooding. These areas have special flood hazards associated with base flood depths of one (1) to three (3) feet where a clearly defined channel does not exist and where the path of flooding is unpredictable and where velocity flow may be evident. Such flooding is characterized by ponding or sheet flow; therefore, the following provisions apply: 
(1)	Residential construction. All new construction and substantial improvements of residential structures must have the lowest floor (including basement), electrical, heating, ventilation, plumbing and air conditioning equipment and other service facilities (including ductwork) elevated above the highest adjacent grade at least one (1) foot above the depth number specified in feet on the community's FIRM (at least three [3] feet if no depth number is specified). Upon completion of the structure, the elevation of the lowest floor, including basement, shall be certified by a registered Colorado professional engineer, architect or land surveyor. Such certification shall be submitted to the Building Official. 
(2)	Nonresidential construction. With the exception of critical facilities, outlined in Section 18-6-250 below, all new construction and substantial improvements of nonresidential structures must have the lowest floor (including basement), electrical, heating, ventilation, plumbing and air conditioning equipment and other service facilities (including ductwork) elevated above the highest adjacent grade at least one (1) foot above the depth number specified in feet on the community's FIRM (at least three [3] feet if no depth number is specified) or, together with attendant utility and sanitary facilities, be designed so that the structure is watertight to at least one (1) foot above the base flood level with walls substantially impermeable to the passage of water and with structural components having the capability of resisting hydrostatic and hydrodynamic loads and effects of buoyancy. A registered Colorado professional engineer or architect shall submit a certification to the Building Official that the standards of this Section, as proposed in Section 18-6-150 of this Article, are satisfied. 
Within Zones AH or AO, adequate drainage paths around structures on slopes are required to guide floodwaters around and away from proposed structures. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_D995C714F21DC9BDD1C693F03F620929]Sec. 18-6-210. Floodways.
Floodways are administrative limits and tools used to regulate existing and future floodplain development. The State has adopted floodway standards that are more stringent than the FEMA minimum standard (see definition of floodway in Section 18-6-40 of this Article). Located within the Special Flood Hazard Area established in Section 18-6-60 of this Article, are areas designated as floodways. Since the floodway is an extremely hazardous area due to the velocity of floodwaters which carry debris, potential projectiles and erosion potential, the following provisions shall apply: 
(1)	Encroachments are prohibited, including fill, new construction, substantial improvements and other development within the adopted regulatory floodway unless it has been demonstrated through hydrologic and hydraulic analyses performed by a licensed Colorado professional engineer and in accordance with standard engineering practice that the proposed encroachment would not result in any increase (requires a no-rise certification) in flood levels within the community during the occurrence of the base flood discharge. 
(2)	If Paragraph (1) above is satisfied, all new construction and substantial improvements shall comply with all applicable flood hazard reduction provisions of Sections 18-6-180 through 18-6-250 of this Article. 
(3)	Under the provisions of 44 C.F.R., Chapter 1, Section 65.12 of the National Flood Insurance Regulations, a community may permit encroachments within the adopted regulatory floodway that would result in an increase in Base Flood Elevations, provided that the community first applies for a CLOMR and floodway revision through FEMA. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_DA8CC11647B4DAA975ECAEA0A11DB1F4]Sec. 18-6-220. Alteration of watercourse.
For all proposed developments that alter a watercourse within a Special Flood Hazard Area, the following standards apply: 
(1)	Channelization and flow diversion projects shall appropriately consider issues of sediment transport, erosion, deposition and channel migration and properly mitigate potential problems through the project as well as upstream and downstream of any improvement activity. A detailed analysis of sediment transport and overall channel stability should be considered, when appropriate, to assist in determining the most appropriate design. 
(2)	Channelization and flow diversion projects shall evaluate the residual 100-year floodplain.
(3)	Any channelization or other stream alteration activity proposed by a project proponent must be evaluated for its impact on the regulatory floodplain and be in compliance with all applicable federal, state and local floodplain rules, regulations and ordinances. 
(4)	Any stream alteration activity shall be designed and sealed by a registered Colorado professional engineer or certified professional hydrologist. 
(5)	All activities within the regulatory floodplain shall meet all applicable federal, state and city floodplain requirements and regulations. 
(6)	Within the regulatory floodway, stream alteration activities shall not be constructed unless the project proponent demonstrates through a floodway analysis and report, sealed by a registered Colorado professional engineer, that there is not more than a 0.00-foot rise in the proposed conditions compared to existing conditions floodway resulting from the project, otherwise known as a no-rise certification, unless the community first applies for a CLOMR and floodway revision in accordance with Section 18-6-210 above. 
(7)	Maintenance shall be required for any altered or relocated portions of watercourses so that the flood-carrying capacity is not diminished. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_9721296EDEF14D8BB0BD27F7F200B6E3]Sec. 18-6-230. Properties removed from floodplain by fill.
A Floodplain Development Permit shall not be issued for the construction of a new structure or addition to an existing structure on a property removed from the floodplain by the issuance of a FEMA Letter of Map Revision Based on Fill (LOMR-F), unless such new structure or addition complies with the following: 
(1)	Residential construction. The lowest floor (including basement), electrical, heating, ventilation, plumbing and air conditioning equipment and other service facilities (including ductwork) must be elevated to one (1) foot above the Base Flood Elevation that existed prior to the placement of fill. 
(2)	Nonresidential construction. The lowest floor (including basement), electrical, heating, ventilation, plumbing and air conditioning equipment and other service facilities (including ductwork) must be elevated to one (1) foot above the Base Flood Elevation that existed prior to the placement of fill or, together with attendant utility and sanitary facilities, be designed so that the structure or addition is watertight to at least one (1) foot above the base flood level that existed prior to the placement of fill with walls substantially impermeable to the passage of water and with structural components having the capability of resisting hydrostatic and hydrodynamic loads and effects of buoyancy. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_5BF2D0F5136C36719234B1430BA552D0]Sec. 18-6-240. Standards for subdivision proposals.
(a)	All subdivision proposals including the placement of manufactured home parks and subdivisions shall be reasonably safe from flooding. If a subdivision or other development proposal is in a flood-prone area, the proposal shall minimize flood damage. 
(b)	All proposals for the development of subdivisions including the placement of manufactured home parks and subdivisions shall meet Floodplain Development Permit requirements contained in this Article. 
(c)	Base Flood Elevation data shall be generated for subdivision proposals and other proposed development including the placement of manufactured home parks and subdivisions which is greater than fifty (50) lots or five (5) acres, whichever is lesser, if not otherwise provided pursuant to Sections 18-6-70 or 18-6-140 of this Article. 
(d)	All subdivision proposals including the placement of manufactured home parks and subdivisions shall have adequate drainage provided to reduce exposure to flood hazards. 
(e)	All subdivision proposals including the placement of manufactured home parks and subdivisions shall have public utilities and facilities such as sewer, gas, electrical and water systems located and constructed to minimize or eliminate flood damage. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_B52C3EA90659359E288A7353E7D05AAB]Sec. 18-6-250. Standards for critical facilities.
Critical facilities shall be subject to the provisions of Rule 6 of the Rules and Regulations for Regulatory Floodplains as adopted herein by reference and exemptions may be authorized by the Building Official in accordance therewith. All new and substantially improved critical facilities and new additions to critical facilities located within the Special Flood Hazard Area shall be required to meet one (1) of the following: 
(1)	Location outside the Special Flood Hazard Area; or
(2)	Elevation of the lowest floor or floodproofing of the structure, together with attendant utility and sanitary facilities, to at least two (2) feet above the Base Flood Elevation. 
New critical facilities shall, when practicable as determined by the Building Official, have continuous noninundated access (ingress and egress for evacuation and emergency services) during a 100-year flood event. 
(Ord. 13-15 §1, 2013)
ARTICLE VII Standards and Specifications for Design and Construction
Sec. 18-7-10. Title; purpose.
Sec. 18-7-20. Code adopted.
Sec. 18-7-30. Permit and regulations.
Sec. 18-7-40. Penalties and fines.


[bookmark: BK_3ED1B96576F0A7BD0E2B9D1E73EF9D2A]Sec. 18-7-10. Title; purpose.
The provisions of the ordinance codified herein shall be known and cited collectively as the "City of Central Standards and Specifications for Design and Construction" or "Design and Development Standards." The Design and Development Standards set forth minimum design and technical criteria to safeguard life or limb, property and public welfare that apply to all proposed construction submitted for approval under the provisions of Chapter 16 or Chapter 17 of this Code. Unless otherwise noted, the adoption includes all supplements to the code. 
(Ord. 13-06 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_10C46008DC5DF1139DCBFD570E0FBFF6]Sec. 18-7-20. Code adopted.
The City adopts by reference the following code: 
(1)	City of Central Standards and Specifications for Design and Construction, 2013 Edition, with certain appendices as hereafter set out, as published by the City of Central, 141 Nevada Street, Central City, CO 80427. 
(2)	A copy of the City of Central Standards and Specifications for Design and Construction is available on the City's website and at City Hall, 141 Nevada Street, Central City, CO 80427. 
(Ord. 13-06 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_639BD21CB3F401F01950920A0518FB48]Sec. 18-7-30. Permit and regulations.
(a)	The right-of-way use permit must be obtained at least five (5) days prior to any commencement of construction. Applications may be downloaded from the City website at www.centralcitycolorado.us. The applicant shall submit construction plans, specifications and a written schedule covering the general sequence and staging of the work to be performed on large scale projects. The right-of-way use permit may contain stipulations and must be adhered to or the permit shall be revoked. 
(b)	Work authorized by this permit shall be performed between the hours of 7:00 a.m. and 7:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, unless the applicant obtains written permission from the Operations Director to do the work earlier or later than the stated hours or on a weekend. 
(c)	Once the permit is approved, no change shall be allowed to the schedule or plans without the consent of the City. Permits must be available at the work site, on demand to City personnel at all times. Construction permits expire at the approved scheduled ending date and must be renewed in advance if the bond is not to default. 
(d)	Any person conducting work within the right-of-way without an approved right-of-way use permit shall be subject to the fines and penalties set forth in Section 18-7-40 of this Article. 
(Ord. 13-06 §1, 2013)
[bookmark: BK_45F50E73B686FED704D58814B2FB0DB8]Sec. 18-7-40. Penalties and fines.
(a)	Penalties. Every person convicted of a violation of any provision of this Article shall be subject to the fines and penalties set forth in this Section. Additionally, the violator may be required to replace the graded, excavated or filled land to its original condition. 
(b)	It is unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to violate any provisions of this Article or any amendment thereof. Any person failing to comply with this Article shall be subject to the fines and penalties as set forth in Section 1-4-20 of this Code. The City may seek restitution for expenses of enforcement or damage to public property. In addition, for any violation of this Article or any condition which may constitute a threat to the public health, safety and welfare or damage to property, the City may: 
(1)	Issue cease and desist orders to halt a violation of this Article;
(2)	Hold further permits related to platting, construction, expansion or operation of a use until the violations are corrected, or until the Municipal Court or other Court of appropriate jurisdiction orders that the hold be lifted; 
(3)	Revoke permits; or
(4)	Issue stop work orders to stop any or all construction activities.
(Ord. 13-06 §1, 2013)
	Central City, Colorado, Municipal Code	Page 1
