CHAPTER 15

Buildings and Construction

Article 15-4 International Building Code and Standads
Sec. 15-4-10  Code adopted; purpose
Sec. 15-4-15  Nonliability
Sec. 15-4-20  Copy of code on file
Sec. 15-4-30  Deletions and substitutions; fees
Sec. 15-4-40  Substitution of particular terms
Sec. 15-4-50  Section B 101.2.2 amended; Board pEAls
Sec. 15-4-60  Copies of code available for sale
Sec. 15-4-70 Penalties and civil remedies
Sec. 15-4-75 Conflict with other codes

Article 15-6 Uniform Building Conservation Code
Sec. 15-6-10  Code adopted; purpose
Sec. 15-6-15  Nonliability
Sec. 15-6-20  Copy of code on file
Sec. 15-6-30  Deletions and substitutions; fees
Sec. 15-6-40  Substitution of particular terms
Sec. 15-6-50  Section 207 amended; Board of Appeals
Sec. 15-6-60  Copies of code available for sale
Sec. 15-6-70  Penalties and civil remedies

Article 15-8 Dangerous Buildings Abatement Code
Sec. 15-8-10  Code adopted; purpose
Sec. 15-8-15  Nonliability
Sec. 15-8-20  Copy of code on file
Sec. 15-8-30 Deletions and substitutions; fees
Sec. 15-8-40  Substitution of particular terms
Sec. 15-8-50  Section 205 amended; Board of Appeals
Sec. 15-8-60  Copies of code available for sale
Sec. 15-8-70  Penalties and civil remedies

Article 15-12  National Electrical Code
Sec. 15-12-10 Code adopted; purpose
Sec. 15-12-15 Nonliability
Sec. 15-12-20 Copy of code on file
Sec. 15-12-30 Deletions and substitutions; fees
Sec. 15-12-40 Substitution of particular terms
Sec. 15-12-50 Appeals process; Board of Appeals
Sec. 15-12-60 Copies of code available for sale
Sec. 15-12-70 Penalties and civil remedies

Article 15-16  Contractor Licenses
Sec. 15-16-10 Purpose and intent
Sec. 15-16-15 Nonliability
Sec. 15-16-20 License required
Sec. 15-16-30 Responsibility of licensee and EieaitCode registrants
Sec. 15-16-40 Application for license
Sec. 15-16-50 License classifications
Sec. 15-16-60 Insurance required



Sec
Sec
Sec
Sec

.15-16-70
. 15-16-80
. 15-16-90
. 15-16-100

License nontransferable
Suspension or revocation of license
Denial of license

Appellate review for denial or reaew

Article 15-20 International Fire Code

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

15-20-10
15-20-15
15-20-20
15-20-30
15-20-40
15-20-50
15-20-55
15-20-60
15-20-70
15-20-75

Code adopted; purpose

Nonliability

Copy of code on file

Deletions and substitutions; fees
Substitution of particular terms

Specific amendments to code

Section 108 amended; appeals process
Copies of code available for sale
Penalties and civil remedies

Conflict with other codes

Article 15-24  Moving of Structures

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

15-24-10
15-24-20
15-24-30
15-24-40
15-24-50
15-24-60
15-24-70
15-24-80
15-24-90
15-24-100
15-24-110
15-24-120
15-24-130
15-24-140
15-24-150
15-24-160

Definitions

Permit required

Contents of application

Permit term, contents, conditions

Permit prerequisite to issuance

Permit fee, application and inspactio

Basis for fee

Bond or security deposit required

Mover to provide escort

Parking along route prohibited

Time limitation; extension

Warning devices required

Utility notification and serviceatisnection; costs
Damage; liability for repair

Clearing of vacated site

Inspection and compliance requoedypancy permit

Article 15-28 International Residential Code

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

15-28-10
15-28-15
15-28-20
15-28-30
15-28-40
15-28-50
15-28-55
15-28-60
15-28-70
15-28-75

Code adopted; purpose
Nonliability

Copy of code on file

Deletions and substitutions; fees
Substitution of particular terms
Specific amendments to Code
Appeals process; Board of Appeals
Copies of code available for sale
Penalties and civil remedies
Conflict with other codes

Article 15-32 International Mechanical Code

Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

15-32-10
15-32-15
15-32-20
15-32-30
15-32-40
15-32-50

Adopted; purpose

Nonliability

Copy of code on file

Deletions and substitutions; fees
Substitution of particular terms
Specific amendments to code



Sec. 15-32-55 Appeals process; Board of Appeals
Sec. 15-32-60 Copies of code available for sale
Sec. 15-32-70 Penalties and civil remedies

Sec. 15-32-75 Conflict with other codes

Article 15-36  International Plumbing Code
Sec. 15-36-10 Code adopted; purpose
Sec. 15-36-15 Nonliability
Sec. 15-36-20 Copy of code on file
Sec. 15-36-25 Deletions and substitutions; fees
Sec. 15-36-30 Substitution of particular terms
Sec. 15-36-35 Appeals process; Board of Appeals
Sec. 15-36-40 Cross-connection control program
Sec. 15-36-45 No license required
Sec. 15-36-50 Copies of code available for sale
Sec. 15-36-55 Penalties and civil remedies
Sec. 15-36-60 Conflict with other codes

Article 15-42  Energy Efficiency Code for Nonresidetial Buildings
Sec. 15-42-10 Code adopted; purpose
Sec. 15-42-20 Provisions effective when and comjlalvle where
Sec. 15-42-30 Amendments
Sec. 15-42-40 Appeal procedures
Sec. 15-42-50 Penalties and civil remedies

Article 15-46  Energy Conservation Performance Codér New Construction and Renovation of
Residential Buildings
Sec. 15-46-10 Code adopted; purpose
Sec. 15-46-20 Provisions effective when and comylable where
Sec. 15-46-30 Amendments
Sec. 15-46-40 Appeal procedures
Sec. 15-46-50 Penalties and civil remedies

Article 15-50  Uniform Building Security Code
Sec. 15-50-10 Code adopted; purpose
Sec. 15-50-20 Provisions effective when and comyjlalvle where
Sec. 15-50-30 Amendments
Sec. 15-50-40 Board of Appeals
Sec. 15-50-50 Violation; penalty and civil remedies



ARTICLE 15-4
International Building Code and Standards
Sec. 15-4-10. Code adopted; purpose.

(@) The 2003nternational Building Code, published by the International Code Council, Inc.,
5203 Leesburg Pike, Suite 708, Falls Church, VA 22041-3401, is hereby aGdyptbe City by
reference as a primary code, and incorporated into the Brightoncidal Code. A copy of this
primary code, together with all appendices and standards, is on file in tteeadfthe City Clerk.

(b) Such code and said appendices and standards are adopted for the pilugroseding
minimum standards to safeguard life, limb, health, property and pweli@are by regulating and
controlling the design, construction, quality of materials, use armipaocy, location and
maintenance of all buildings and structures within the City amthineequipment specifically
regulated herein.

(c) The purpose of the International Building Code is not to €reatotherwise establish or
designate any particular class or group of persons who wilhauld be especially protected or
benefited by the terms of the International Building Code. (Ord. $42Fart), 1992; Ord. 1464,
1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-4-15. Nonliability.

The adoption of this code by this Article shall not create any tbuany person with regard to the
enforcement or nonenforcement of this Article or said code pé¥son shall have any civil liability
remedy against the City or its officers, employees or agémt any damage arising out of or in any
way connected with the adoption, enforcement or nonenforcementsoftticle or said code.
Nothing in this Article or in said code shall be construed tateraay liability, or to waive any of the
immunities, limitations of liability or other provisions of ti@vernmental Immunity Act, Section
24-10-101 et seq., C.R.S., or to waive any immunities or limitatiorigbility otherwise available to
the City or its officers, employees or agents. (Ord. 1427 8)(A&%92; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814
83, 2004)

Sec. 15-4-20. Copy of code on file.

At least one (1) copy of the International Building Code, astadojs on file in the office of the
City Clerk and may be inspected during regular business hodtsr the date on which this Article
shall take effect, the provisions of the International Buildirayl€; the appendices thereto hereby
adopted and the standards hereby adopted shall be controlling witltiorlogate limits of the City.
(Ord. 1427 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 8§83, 2004)

Sec. 15-4-30. Deletions and substitutions; fees.

Anything contained in the International Building Code or the appendiesstd hereby adopted
which is now or is hereafter inconsistent with other speoifithances of this City is deleted and not
adopted by this Article. Any reference in the Internationalddwy Code or the appendices and
standards hereby adopted regarding permit fees, inspection rf@disggfees, fees for certificates of



occupancy or the like shall be replaced by specific reference to the titeragrrent City of Brighton
Fee Resolution, in lieu thereof. (Ord. 1427 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord.
1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-4-40. Substitution of particular terms.

Whenever the termBuilding Official is used in the International Building Code or the appendices
thereto hereby adopted, the te@hief Building Official of the City of Brighton or his or her duly
authorized representatives, designees or appointees shall be inserted in lieu thereof. (Ord. 1427
81(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-4-50. Section B 101.2.2 amended; Board of Appeals.
Section B 101.2.2 of the International Building Code is amended to read as follows:
"Section 101.2.2. Board of Appeals

"(a) Appointment and qualifications. There is hereby estaddi a Board of Appeals which
shall consist of five (5) residents of this City who gtalified by experience or training to pass
upon matters pertaining to building construction. The Board stialhaorder to determine the
suitability of alternate materials and types of constructiod to provide for reasonable
interpretations of the provisions of this Code. The Board shaBist of five (5) individuals, one
(1) from each of the following professions or disciplines:

1. Professional with architectural experience or a buildesuperintendent of building
construction with at least ten (10) years' experience, fivgdais of which shall have been in
responsible charge of work.

2. Professional with structural engineering experience.

3. Professional with mechanical and plumbing engineering experignaentechanical
contractor with at least ten (10) years' experience, fiveegg)s of which shall have been in
responsible charge of work.

4. Professional with electrical engineering experience orlestrieal contractor with at
least ten (10) years' experience, five (5) years of which shall have beepansib& charge of
work.

5. Professional with fire protection engineering experienca fire protection contractor
with at least ten (10) years' experience, five (5) yeawhoth shall have been in responsible
charge of work.

"(b) Term of office. The Board of Appeals shall be appoiftedhe Mayor, with the advice
and consent of the City Council and shall hold office at the pleasfuthe City Council. Three
(3) consecutive unexcused absences of any member from medtihgsBoard shall render any
such member subject to immediate removal from office.



"(c) Procedure. Three (3) members of the Board shall coestitquorum. In rendering any
decision on an appeal hereunder, no less than three (3) affenvaties shall be required. No
Board member shall act in a case in which he has a personal inEnesthief Building Official,
or his or her designated representative or appointee, shalt aecretary of the Board of Appeals
without vote and shall set forth the reasons for the Boardisioles; the vote of each member
participating therein, the absence of any member and any faflarenember to vote. The Board
may adopt rules and regulations for its own procedure, includingrdgiin of officers, other
than the secretary, not inconsistent with the provisions of thie Cby motion duly made at a
meeting of the Board of Appeals.

"(d) Meetings. The Board shall meet at such time astesrdaed by the Chairman or any
two (2) members within a reasonable time after the filingroappeal with such Board, provided
that such hearing date shall not be less than five (5) daysarerthan sixty (60) days from the
date the appeal was filed with the Building Official.

"(e) Appeals. Whenever it is claimed that the provisionthisfCode do not apply, or that an
equally good or more desirable form of construction can be employadyi specific case, or
when it is claimed that the true intent and meaning of the Qwdany of the regulations
thereunder have been misconstrued or wrongly interpreted, theswtiex of such building or
structure or his or her duly authorized agent may appealtfirerdecision of the Building Official
to the Board of Appeals. Such appeal shall be in writing andlslatiade within thirty (30) days
of the action causing the appeal.

"(f) Decision of the Board of Appeals. The Board of Appeals, when acting upgpeal and
after a hearing, shall determine the suitability of altermahaterials and methods of construction
and make interpretations of the provisions of this Code consigii¢gh its purpose and intent.
Every decision of the Board of Appeals shall be in writing andl sidicate the vote upon the
decision. Every decision shall be filed in the office of thdddug Official within thirty (30) days
of such decision and shall be open to public inspection. A copy of traeshall be sent by
mail or otherwise delivered to the applicant. The Board mbeals shall in every case reach a
decision without unreasonable or unnecessary delay, and the Buildioigl®Ghall immediately
act in accordance with such decision. A decision of the BobAppeals, which in effect shall
modify the provisions of this Code, shall not be considered agentéor future decisions of the
Building Official or Board of Appeals.

"(g) Appeals from Board's decision. All decisions made by thedBafAppeals are final and
may not be appealed except to a court of law.

"(h) Limitations of authority. The Board of Appeals shall daw authority relative to
interpretation of the administrative provisions of this Code,shall the Board be empowered to
waive requirements of this Code."

(Ord. 1427 §1(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1814 §3, 2004)



Sec. 15-4-60. Copies of code available for sale.

Copies of the International Building Code are available fa &athe public through the office of
the City Clerk, at a price equal to the cost to the Cityrd (@427 §1(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995;
Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-4-70. Penalties and civil remedies.

(&) It shall be unlawful for any person to erect, construct, galaiter, repair, move, improve,
remove, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any buildgtgioture in the City, or
cause the same to be done, contrary to or in violation of anyegbrovisions of this Article, the
International Building Code, including all appendices and standardsahbkeseby adopted, or any
order issued by the Building Official hereunder. Any person wageaany of said provisions or any
such order shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor, and each ssmh giall be deemed guilty of
a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof aumin any violation of such
provisions or of such order is committed, continued or permitted, and @perction of any such
violation, such person shall be punished by a fine of not more thevhdiivdred dollars ($500.00) or
by imprisonment for not more than ninety (90) days, or by both such fine and imprisonment

(b) In any case of a failure to comply with any requirementshef Article or of the
International Building Code, including all appendices theretobyeaeopted, the City or any person
affected by such failure may, in addition to the penalties provigeldw, initiate a civil action for
injunction, mandamus, abatement or any other appropriate reliefvienprenjoin, abate, remove or
eliminate such violations. (Ord. 1427 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1699804
83, 2004)

Sec. 15-4-75. Conflict with other codes.

If a dispute or conflict arises between the International Bigl€ode as adopted herein, and any
plumbing, mechanical, building, electrical, fire or other unifamde adopted by the State, then the
more stringent provisions of each respective code shall prevail. (Ord. 18140438, 20

ARTICLE 15-6
Uniform Building Conservation Code
Sec. 15-6-10. Code adopted; purpose.

There is hereby adopted by the City teiform Code for Building Conservation, 1994 edition,
including Appendix Articles 3 and 4, promulgated by the International e&2emnée of Building
Officials for the purpose of encouraging the use or reusegaflyeexisting buildings and structures

within the City by applying reasonable life safety and $tmat standards contained in said code.
(Ord. 1421 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)



Sec. 15-6-15. Nonliability.

The adoption of the code by this Article shall not create anytduany person with regard to the
enforcement or nonenforcement of this Article or said code pé¥son shall have any civil liability
remedy against the City or its officers, employees or agémt any damage arising out of or in any
way connected with the adoption, enforcement or nonenforcementsoftticle or said code.
Nothing in this Article or in said code shall be construed toteraay liability, or to waive any of the
immunities, limitations or liability or other provisions of tB®vernmental Immunity Act, Section
24-10-101 et seq., C.R.S., or to waive any immunities or limitatarngbility otherwise available to
the City or its officers, employees or agents. (Ord. 1421 §)(A&92; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814
83, 2004)

Sec. 15-6-20. Copy of code on file.

Not less than one (1) copy of said code has been and is now fileel affice of the City Clerk,
and from the date on which this Article shall take effect,pfmvisions of said Uniform Building
Conservation Code, and the appendices thereto hereby adoptetestatitrolling within the limits
of the City. (Ord. 1421 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 §3, 2004)

Sec. 15-6-30. Deletions and substitutions; fees.

Anything contained in the Uniform Code for Building Conservatiod #those appendices thereto
hereby adopted which is now or is hereafter inconsistentatliggr specific ordinances of the City is
deleted and not adopted by this Article. Any reference in th#otdm Code for Building
Conservation regarding permit fees, inspection fees, grading fees, feedifmates of occupancy or
the like shall be replaced by reference to the phitaseurrent City of Brighton Fee Resolution, in
lieu thereof (Ord. 1421 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 8§83, 2004)

Sec. 15-6-40. Substitution of particular terms.

Whenever the termBuilding Official is used in the Uniform Code for Building Conservation or in
appendices thereto hereby adopted, the t@hief Building Official of the City of Brighton or his or
her duly authorized representatives, designees or appointees shall be inserted in lieu thereof. (Ord.
1421 8§1(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-6-50. Section 207 amended; Board of Appeals.
Section 207 of the Uniform Code for Building Conservation is amended to reacassfoll
"Section 207. Board of Appeals

"207.1 Appointment and qualifications. There is hereby establishedrd BbAppeals which
shall consist of five (5) residents of this City who gtmlified by experience or training to pass
upon matters pertaining to building construction. The Board stialhaorder to determine the
suitability of alternate materials and types of constructimd to provide for reasonable
interpretations of the provisions of this Code. The qualifiostiof the Board are as set forth in
Section 15-4-50 of the Brighton Municipal Code.



"207.2 Term of office. The Board of Appeals shall be appointethéyMayor, with the
advice and consent of the City Council, and shall hold office gpl#esure of the City Council.
Three (3) consecutive unexcused absences of any member from mettiveg8oard shall render
any such member liable to immediate removal from office.

"207.3 Procedure. Three (3) members of the Board shall constituteram. In rendering
any decision on an appeal hereunder, no less than three (3) affrrates shall be required. No
Board member shall act in a case in which he or she has@npkinterest. The Chief Building
Official, or his or her designated representative or appointel ashas secretary of the Board of
Appeals without vote and shall set forth the reasons for the Badedisions, the vote of each
member participating therein, the absence of any member and hmg fafi a member to vote.
The Board may adopt rules and regulations for its own procedwiediimg designation of
officers, other than the secretary, not inconsistent with the poosisif this Code, by motion duly
made at a meeting of the Board of Appeals.

"207.4 Meetings. The Board shall meet at such time addsndeed by the Chairman or any
two (2) members within a reasonable time after the filingroappeal with such Board, provided
that such hearing date shall not be less than five (5) daysarerthan sixty (60) days from the
date the appeal was filed with the Building Official.

"207.5 Appeals. Whenever it is claimed that the provisions ottds do not apply or that an
equally good or more desirable form of construction can be employady specific case, or
when it is claimed that the true intent and meaning of the code or any of the oagulagreunder
have been misconstrued or wrongly interpreted, the owner of siilding or structure or his or
her duly authorized agent may appeal from the decision of uidifgy Official to the Board of

Appeals. Such appeal shall be in writing and shall be matenvthirty (30) days of the action
causing the appeal.

"207.6 Decision of the Board of Appeals. The Board of Appeals, whigrg agton an appeal
and after a hearing, shall determine the suitability of radter materials and methods of
construction and make interpretations of the provisions of this Cosistent with its purpose
and intent. Every decision of the Board of Appeals shall beitmg/iand shall indicate the vote
upon the decision. Every decision shall be filed in the offidd@Building Official within thirty
(30) days of such decision and shall be open to public inspection. Aotdpy decision shall be
sent by mail or otherwise delivered to the applicant. The BolAppeals shall in every case
reach a decision without unreasonable or unnecessary delay, andiltiegBOfficial shall
immediately act in accordance with such decision. A decisidhe Board of Appeals, which in
effect shall modify the provisions of this Code, shall not besitered a precedent for future
decisions of the Building Official or Board of Appeals.

"207.6.1 Appeals from Board's decision. All decisions made by the Board of Apmehiwhbr
and may not be appealed except to a court of law.

"207.7 Limitations of authority. The Board of Appeals shall haveutbority relative to
interpretation of the administrative provisions of this Coue,shall the Board be empowered to
waive requirements of this Code."

(Ord. 1421 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)



Sec. 15-6-60. Copies of code available for sale.

Copies of the Uniform Code for Building Conservation are atsbel for sale to the public by the
office of the City Clerk at a price equal to the costi® €ity. (Ord. 1421 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1464,
1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-6-70. Penalties and civil remedies.

(&) It shall be unlawful for any person to erect, construct, galaiter, repair, move, improve,
remove, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any buildstguoture in the City, or
cause the same to be done, contrary to or in violation of anyegbrovisions of this Article, the
Uniform Code for Building Conservation, including all appenditteseto hereby adopted, or any
order issued by the Building Official hereunder. Any person wageiny of said provisions or any
such order shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor, and each ssmh $ieall be deemed guilty of
a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof aumin any violation of such
provisions or of such order is committed, continued or permitted, and upeitttan of any such
violation, such person shall be punished by a fine of not more theuhdindred dollars ($500.00) or
by imprisonment for not more than ninety (90) days, or by both such fine and imprisonment

(b) In any case of a failure to comply with any requirementhisfArticle or of the Uniform
Code for Building Conservation, including all appendices thereteblgeadopted, the City or any
person affected by such failure may, in addition to the penalties provided by l&te iaitivil action
for injunction, mandamus, abatement or any other appropriate eppeétent, enjoin, abate, remove
or eliminate such violations. (Ord. 1421 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589,Ct€99;
1814 8§83, 2004)

ARTICLE 15-8
Dangerous Buildings Abatement Code
Sec. 15-8-10. Code adopted; purpose.

There is hereby adopted by the City thaform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings,
1997 edition, promulgated by the International Conference of Buildingi@é#jdor the purpose of
providing a just, equitable and practicable method wherebgibgd or structures which endanger
the life, limb, health, morals, property, safety or welfare ofgewieeral public or their occupants may
be required to be repaired, vacated or demolished. (Ord. 1422 §1(pa2t)Or891464, 1995; Ord.
1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-8-15. Nonliability.

The adoption of the code by this Article shall not create anytduany person with regard to the
enforcement or nonenforcement of this Article or said code pé¥son shall have any civil liability
remedy against the City or its officers, employees or agémt any damage arising out of or in any
way connected with the adoption, enforcement or nonenforcementsoftticle or said code.
Nothing in this Article or in said code shall be construed tateraay liability, or to waive any of the
immunities, limitations of liability or other provisions of ti@vernmental Immunity Act, Section
24-10-101 et seq., C.R.S., or to waive any immunities or limitatiorigbility otherwise available to



the City or its officers, employees or agents. (Ord. 1422 8)(A&%92; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814
§3, 2004)

Sec. 15-8-20. Copy of code on file.

Not less than one (1) copy of said code has been and is now filegl @ffice of the City Clerk,
and from the date on which this Article shall take effect pifuwisions of said Uniform Code for the
Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, 1997 edition, shall be controllittynaihe limits of the City.
(Ord. 1422 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 8§83, 2004)

Sec. 15-8-30. Deletions and substitutions; fees.

Anything contained in the Uniform Code for the Abatement of DangeBuilslings hereby
adopted which is now or is hereafter inconsistent with other speaoificances of this City is deleted
and not adopted by this Article. Any reference in the Uniform Godthe Abatement of Dangerous
Buildings or the appendices hereby adopted regarding permiirispsction fees, grading fees, fees
for certificates of occupancy or the like shall be replaced by referetice ptrase¢he current City of
Brighton Fee Resolution, in lieu thereof. (Ord. 1422 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589,
1999; Ord. 181483, 2004)

Sec. 15-8-40. Substitution of particular terms.

Whenever the terrBuilding Official is used in the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous
Buildings, the termChief Building Official of the City of Brighton or his or her duly authorized
agents, representatives, designees or appointees shall be inserted in lieu thereof. (Ord. 1422 §1(part),
1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 8§83, 2004)

Sec. 15-8-50. Section 205 amended; Board of Appeals.

Section 205 of the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings is amendad ts
follows:

"Section 205. Board of Appeals

"205.1 Appointment and qualifications. There is hereby establishedrd BbAppeals which
shall consist of five (5) residents of this City who gualified by experience or training to pass
upon matters pertaining to building construction. The Board stialhaorder to determine the
suitability of alternate materials and types of constructimad to provide for reasonable
interpretations of the provisions of this Code. The qualiboatiof the Board are as set forth in
Section 15-4-50 of the Brighton Municipal Code.

"205.2 Term of office. The Board of Appeals shall be appointethéyMayor, with the
advice and consent of the City Council, and shall hold office apldesure of the City Council.
Three (3) consecutive unexcused absences of any member from megtivegBoard shall render
any such member liable to immediate removal from office.

"205.3 Procedure. Three (3) members of the Board shall constituteram. In rendering
any decision on an appeal hereunder, no less than three (3) af@wates shall be required. No



Board member shall act in a case in which he or she has@npkinterest. The Chief Building
Official, or his or her designated representative or appointek ashas secretary of the Board of
Appeals without vote and shall set forth the reasons for the Badedisions, the vote of each
member participating therein, the absence of any member and hmg fzfi a member to vote.
The Board may adopt rules and regulations for its own procedutdedimg designation of
officers, other than the secretary, not inconsistent with the poosgisif this Code, by motion duly
made at a meeting of the Board of Appeals.

"205.4 Meetings. The Board shall meet at such time agdsndeed by the Chairman or any
two (2) members within a reasonable time after the filingroappeal with such Board, provided
that such hearing date shall not be less than five (5) daysarerthan sixty (60) days from the
date the appeal was filed with the Building Official.

"205.5 Appeals. Whenever it is claimed that the provisions ®iGbde do not apply, or that
an equally good or more desirable form of construction can be emplogey specific case, or
when it is claimed that the true intent and meaning of the Q@wdany of the regulations
thereunder have been misconstrued or wrongly interpreted, the diwguehdouilding or structure
or his or her duly authorized agent may appeal from the decisidre @uilding Official to the
Board of Appeals. Such appeal shall be in writing and shall ble m#hin thirty (30) days of the
action causing the appeal.

"205.6 Decision of the Board of Appeals. The Board of Appeals, when acting upon an appeal and
after a hearing, shall determine the suitability of altermaaterials and methods of construction
and make interpretations of the provisions of this Code consigtigh its purpose and intent.
Every decision of the Board of Appeals shall be in writing andl sidicate the vote upon the
decision. Every decision shall be filed in the office of thdddug Official within thirty (30) days

of such decision and shall be open to public inspection. A copy of tieateshall be sent by
mail or otherwise delivered to the applicant. The Board meals shall in every case reach a
decision without unreasonable or unnecessary delay, and the Buildiog/Ghall immediately
act in accordance with such decision. A decision of the BobAppeals, which in effect shall
modify the provisions of this Code, shall not be considered agentéor future decisions of the
Building Official or Board of Appeals.

"205.6.1 Appeals from Board's Decision. All decisions made byBteed of Appeals are
final and may not be appealed except to a court of law.

"205.7 Limitations of Authority. The Board of Appeals shall have mbaity relative to
interpretation of the administrative provisions of this Code,shall the Board be empowered to
waive requirements of this Code."

(Ord. 1422 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)
Sec. 15-8-60. Copies of code available for sale.
Copies of the Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous iBg#dare available for sale to

the public by the office of the City Clerk at a price eqoahe cost to the City. (Ord. 1422 81(part),
1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 §3, 2004)



Sec. 15-8-70. Penalties and civil remedies.

(a) It shall be unlawful for any person to erect, construct, @alaiter, repair, move, improve,
remove, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any buildstgioture in the City, or
cause the same to be done, contrary to or in violation of anyegbrovisions of this Article, the
Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, hereby adaptedy order issued by the
Building Official hereunder. Any person violating any of saidvgsions or any such order shall be
deemed guilty of a misdemeanor, and each such person shall beddpeltyeof a separate offense
for each and every day or portion thereof during which any violaiaguch provisions or of such
order is committed, continued or permitted, and upon convictiomyf®ach violation, such person
shall be punished by a fine of not more than five hundred do#$&@30(00) or by imprisonment for
not more than ninety (90) days, or by both such fine and imprisonment.

(b) In any case of a failure to comply with any requirementhisfArticle or of the Uniform
Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings hereby adopted, ttherGiny person affected by
such failure may, in addition to the penalties provided by laitvat@ a civil action for injunction,
mandamus, abatement or any other appropriate relief to prevenit), eijate, remove or eliminate
such violations. (Ord. 1422 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 §3 2004)

ARTICLE 15-12
National Electrical Code
Sec. 15-12-10. Code adopted; purpose.

There is hereby adopted by the City th&tional Electrical Code, 2002 edition, promulgated by
the National Fire Protection Association, and tform Administrative Code Provisions for the
National Electrical Code, 2002 edition, promulgated by the International Conference of Bgildi
Officials for the purpose of providing minimum standards to sefetylife and limb, property and
public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, construction, ingiallguality of materials,
location, operation and maintenance of electrical wiring and eguipin the City. (Ord. 1349
81(part), 1990; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1502 81(part), 1997; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-12-15. Nonliability.

The adoption of the code by the ordinance codified in this Arsicédl not create any duty to any
person with regard to the enforcement or nonenforcement of thideAor said code. No person
shall have any civil liability remedy against the Cityity officers, employees or agents, for any
damage arising out of or in any way connected with, the adoptifercement or nonenforcement of
this Article or said code. Nothing in this Article or in saimde shall be construed to create any
liability, or to waive any of the immunities, limitations ofaliility or other provisions of the
Governmental Immunity Act, Section 24-10-101 et seq., C.R.S., or to vaayemmunities or
limitations on liability otherwise available to the Cityits officers, employees or agents. (Ord. 1349
81(part), 1990; Ord. 1502 §1(part), 1997; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 §3, 2004)



Sec. 15-12-20. Copy of code on file.

Not less than one (1) copy of the National Electrical Code lamdJhiform Administrative Code
Provisions for the National Electrical Code, 2002 edition, have &ed@rmmre now on file in the office
of the City Clerk; and from the effective date of the ordasaamending this Article, the provisions
of said code shall be controlling within the limits of theyCi{Ord. 1349 81(part), 1990; Ord. 1464,
1995; Ord. 1502 8§1(part), 1997; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-12-30. Deletions and substitutions; fees.

Anything contained in the National Electrical Code and the Unifédministrative Code
Provisions for the National Electrical Code, 2002 editionetheradopted which is now or is
hereafter inconsistent with other specific ordinances ofCite is deleted and not adopted by the
ordinance codified in this Article. Any reference in the NatldBlectrical Code or the appendices
hereby adopted regarding permit fees, inspection fees, grading feesr festifioates of occupancy,
or the like, shall be replaced by reference to the phhaszirrent City of Brighton Fee Resolution, in
lieu thereof. (Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1502 §1(part), 1997; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-12-40. Substitution of particular terms.

Whenever the ternBuilding Official or authority having jurisdiction is used in the National
Electrical Code and the Uniform Administrative Code Provsifor the National Electrical Code,
2002 edition, the ternthief Building Official of the City of Brighton or his or her duly authorized
agents, representatives, designees or appointees shall be inserted in lieu thereof. (Ord. 1349 §1(part),
1990; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1502 81(part), 1997; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-12-50. Appeals process; Board of Appeals.

In order to provide for final interpretation of the provisiarfsthis code and to hear appeals
therefrom, the Board of Appeals, appointed and organized pursuadoption of the International
Building Code by the City in Article 15-4 of this Chapter, isigeated as the Board of Appeals for
purposes of this code, and the administrative and appeal procealittesity and responsibilities set
forth in the International Building Code shall be applicable atidwed in the administration of this
Code. (Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-12-60. Copies of code available for sale.

Copies of the National Electrical Code and the Uniform Adrisiize Code Provisions for the
National Electrical Code, 2002 editions are available fta gathe public by the office of the City
Clerk at a price equal to the cost to the City. (Ord. 1349 8)(A&90; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1502
81(part), 1997; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-12-70. Penalties and civil remedies.

(@) It shall be unlawful for any person to erect, construct, gmlaiter, repair, move, improve,
remove, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any buildgtgioture in the City, or
cause the same to be done, contrary to or in violation of atiyegbrovisions of this Article, the
National Electrical Code and the Uniform Administrative C&devisions of the National Electrical



Code, 2002 editions, hereby adopted or any order issued by the Builificigldereunder. Any
person violating any of said provisions or any such order shaleémed guilty of a misdemeanor,
and each such person shall be deemed guilty of a separate dffeaaeh and every day or portion
thereof during which any violation of such provisions or of such osglepinmitted, continued or
permitted, and upon conviction of any such violation, such person shall shguiy a fine of not
more than five hundred dollars ($500.00) or by imprisonment for not morenthety (90) days, or
by both such fine and imprisonment.

(b) In any case of a failure to comply with any requirementhisefArticle or of the National
Electrical Code and the Uniform Administrative Code Provisiohshe National Electrical Code,
2002 editions, hereby adopted, the City or any person affected byasiuca may, in addition to the
penalties provided by law, initiate a civil action forungtion, mandamus, abatement or any other
appropriate relief to prevent, enjoin, abate, remove or elimswie violations. (Ord. 1349 81(part),
1990; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1502 81(part), 1997; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

ARTICLE 15-16
Contractor Licenses
Sec. 15-16-10. Purpose and intent.

This Article is enacted to protect the health, safety aetfave of the general public and to
preserve life, limb and the value of property within the City, dssuring that building and
construction contractors working within the City are appropriageBlified and duly licensed. (Ord.
1350 81(part), 1990; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-16-15. Nonliability.

The adoption of the ordinance codified in this Article shall meate any duty to any person with
regard to the enforcement or nonenforcement of this Article pédson shall have any civil liability
remedy against the City or its officers, employees or agémt any damage arising out of or in any
way connected with the adoption, enforcement or nonenforcement dhrtiike. Nothing in this
Article shall be construed to create any liability, or towsaany of the immunities, limitations of
liability or other provisions of the Governmental Immunity ActctBe 24-10-101 et seq., C.R.S., or
to waive any immunities or limitations on liability otherwiagailable to the City or its officers,
employees or agents. (Ord. 1350 81(part), 1990; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-16-20. License required.

(@) A contractor license is required for any person, firmnpaship, corporation, association or
any combination thereof which undertakes to perform any of the wmrkvhich a license is
authorized in this Article within the City for any compensation.

(b) The following are excepted from the requirements of this Article:

(1) Any person performing work under the direction of a licensed contractor;



(2) An owner performing work on his or her own personal residemddaildings accessory
thereto. Pursuant to this exception, he or she may construcoral{l) residence as his or her
personal residence within a period of three (3) consecutive years;

(3) Owners of commercial buildings may, at the discretion oBihikding Official, be issued
permits for minor remodel projects not involving structurbbhriges, such as relocations of
counters, construction of partitions and facade, provided thaheimopinion of the Building
Official, the building owner is capable of doing the work. Adatrical and plumbing work must
be done by licensed electricians and licensed plumbers respectively;

(4) Public utility companies and water and sanitation districts nwhagaged in the
installation, operation and maintenance of equipment used in praadumtiservice from their
source through the facilities owned or operated by such utibitgpany to the point of customer
service;

(5) Contractors installing fabricated or manufactured units siscleabinets, counter tops,
storm windows, carpet, gutters, downspouts and landscaping materials; and

(6) Electrical contractors registered pursuant to Articlela5 (Ord. 1350 §1(part), 1990;
Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-16-30. Responsibility of licensee and Electrical Code régists.

Contractors licensed as provided in this Article and persagistered pursuant to the Electrical
Code under Article 15-12 of this Code shall be responsible fgrtheer conduct of their business in
the City, to include:

(1) Obtaining required permits before commencing work;

(2) Completion of construction in accordance with drawings and fegaicins filed and
approved and permit issued by the City, except for good cause amdler City-approved
changes;

(3) Calling for all required inspections and giving twenty-four-hour miminmotice;

(4) Maintaining building plans, permits and inspection recordshenjdb site accessible to
City inspectors;

(5) Providing adequate job site sanitary facilities and safetsisures to protect workers and
the general public;

(6) Paying for all licenses and fees as required by the City's fees agdshesolution; and

(7) Proper supervision of all subcontractors and employ@esd. 1350 §1(part), 1990; Ord.
1814 83, 2004)



Sec. 15-16-40. Application for license.

(&) Applicants for a contractor license and for Electricatle registration pursuant to Article
15-12 of this Code shall submit an application form provided by the &ty pay the required
application fees. Such form shall be accurately completed and signedapptizant.

(b) Any applicant for a contractor license shall establistohiser competence to perform the
activities authorized by the license to the satisfactioth@fBuilding Official. (Ord. 1350 §1(part),
1990; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-16-50. License classifications.

The following classes of contractor licenses are estaddi and the holder of each license shall be
authorized to perform work permitted by such license. All lieershall be valid for twelve (12)
months from the date of issue.

(1) Class A — Unlimited General Contractor. The holder of tbenBe shall be authorized to
construct, alter, repair or demolish any building or structure.

(2) Class B — Limited General Contractor. The holder of libé&se shall be authorized to
construct Type lll, IV or V buildings which do not exceed threes(8)ies in height and which
would not be used for Group E or | Occupancy. This class licens®rias interior
nonstructural work on all building types and all occupancy grotips. holder may perform work
authorized by C and D class licenses.

(3) Class C — Residential General Contractor. The holderofitense shall be authorized to
construct, alter, repair or demolish residential buildings roe&ding three (3) stories in height
above grade and not involving reinforced concrete above grade. The malggerform work
authorized by a Class D or E license.

(4) Class D — Jobbing Contractor. The holder of this licensé lshauthorized to construct,
alter, repair or demolish nonhabitable buildings or portions of Imgiidior structures such as
private garages, carports, patios, sheds, swimming pools, fencesgaad The license holder
may also perform work authorized by a Class E license.

(5) Class E — Specialty Trades. The holder of this licehaél be authorized to perform one
(1) specified building trade such as housemover, mobile home, sedispnry, concrete flatwork,
framing, drywall, roofing, glazing, irrigation systems, fire paiton systems, elevator systems,
security systems, solar energy collection/conversion systiais, laying, water and sewer mains
and paving, but shall not authorize electrical or mechanical war&rorections to a potable water
system.

(6) Class P — Plumbing Contractor. The holder of this liceha# be authorized to perform
all work described in the adopted plumbing code. This clasaskcahall be issued to an
individual, or to a business entity employing, in a supervisapacity, an individual holding a
current and valid State Master's Plumbing License.



(7) Class M — Mechanical Contractor. The holder of this $ieeshall be authorized to
construct, install, repair or alter all mechanical systdesribed in the adopted mechanical code,
but shall not authorize electrical work or connections to a potaftter system. (Ord. 1350
§1(part), 1990; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-16-60. Insurance required.

Before any contractor license shall be issued to an applitentapplicant shall furnish to the
Building Official a certificate of general liabilitynsurance in favor of the City and valid for the
period of the license. Coverage shall not be less than one hundreahthdo#lars ($100,000.00) for
injury or death to one (1) person and three hundred thousand dollars ($300,000r§0)yfer death
to more than one (1) person in any single accident or event, afesadhan fifty thousand dollars
($50,000.00) for property damage or destruction. Lapse of insurancershddr the license
suspended until such insurance is reinstated. (Ord. 1350 81(part), 1990; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-16-70. License nontransferable.

A change in name or ownership of a licensed business entilly heha the legal effect of
terminating the license. All such changes shall be repastdeetBuilding Official and a new license
applied for. Licenses are not transferable. (Ord. 1350 8§1(part), 1990; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)
Sec. 15-16-80. Suspension or revocation of license.

(@) The City Council shall have the right to suspend or revalantxactor license for violation
of the provisions of this Article or violation of any other ordinance, code artestat effect within the
City.

(b) The City Manager shall notify the licensee in writing bytified mail or by personal service
at least seven (7) calendar days prior to the City Councilimgeet which the suspension or
revocation is to be considered. (Ord. 1350 §1(part), 1990; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 8§83, 2004)
Sec. 15-16-90. Denial of license.

The Building Official may deny an application for a licensdia@nse renewal under this Article
upon a determination that:

(1) The applicant has provided false information on the application form;

(2) The applicant is not qualified by education, training or expeeido perform the work
authorized by the license; or

(3) The applicant has previously failed to comply with ordinanodsregulations of the City
relating to contractor licenses or construction. (Ord. 1350 81(part), 199 &2i83, 2004)



Sec. 15-16-100. Appellate review for denial or renewal.

(@) The Board of Appeals, as established under Article 15HioCde, shall hear any appeal
submitted by an applicant whose contractor license applicatiornewal has been denied by the
Building Official.

(b) The applicant shall submit his or her appeal in writinchtoBoard of Appeals within ten
(10) calendar days after his or her application has been denied.

(c) The Board of Appeals, after a hearing, shall determinehahéte City abused its discretion
in denying the application for a license authorized in this Article.

(d) The Board of Appeals shall make its decision in writingg ghall have the decision
delivered to the applicant by certified mail or personal serwithin thirty (30) days of the hearing.
The City shall immediately act in accordance with the decision. (Ord. 13p8r811990; Ord. 1814
83, 2004)

ARTICLE 15-20
International Fire Code
Sec. 15-20-10. Code adopted; purpose.

(&) There is hereby adopted by the City lthter national Fire Code, including Appendix B-Fire
Flow Requirements for Buildings, Appendix C-Fire Hydrant Locations and Distothuppendix E-
Hazard Categories, Appendix F-Hazard Ranking, and Appendix G-@mmdrluids Weight and
Volume Equivalents. The 2003 International Fire Code is puldidhe the International Code
Council, 5203 Leesburg Pike, Suite 708, Falls Church, Virginia 22041-340&agktone (1) copy of
the 2003 International Fire Code, as adopted, is on file in the offiteec€ity Clerk and may be
inspected during regular business hours.

(b) The purpose of the code is not to recreate or otherwidalisistar designate any particular
class or group of persons who will or should be especially gieateor benefited by the terms of the
International Fire Code, but rather, for the purpose of prescribégglations governing the
conditions hazardous to life and property from fire or explosighimithe limits of the City. The
purpose of this code is to establish the minimum requirementsstamtsiith nationally recognized
good practice for providing a reasonable level of life sadety property protection from the hazards
of fire, explosion or dangerous conditions in new and existing buddstguctures and premises and
to provide safety to fire fighters and emergency respondeirsgdeimergency operations. (Ord. 1814
83, 2004)

Sec. 15-20-15. Nonliability.

The adoption of this code by this Article shall not create any tduany person with regard to the
enforcement or nonenforcement of this Article or said codepé¥son shall have any civil liability
remedy against the City or its officers, employees or agentsny damage arising out of or in any
way connected with the adoption, enforcement or nonenforcementsofitticle or said code.



Nothing in this Article or in said code shall be construed tateraay liability, or to waive any of the
immunities, limitations of liability or other provisions of ti@vernmental Immunity Act, Section
24-10-101 et seq., C.R.S., or to waive any immunities or limitatiorisboility otherwise available to

the City, or its officers, employees or agents. (Ord. 1424 81(p84Qp; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814
83, 2004)

Sec. 15-20-20. Copy of code on file.

Not less than one (1) copy of the International Fire Code é&s, land is now on file in the office
of the City Clerk, and from the effective date of the ordieacodified herein amending this Article,
the provisions of said code shall be controlling within thetsinof the City. (Ord. 1424 §1(part),
1992; Ord. 1467, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-20-30. Deletions and substitutions; fees.

Anything contained in the International Fire Code hereby adopted, whiatwisor is hereafter
inconsistent with other specific ordinances of the Citydketed and not adopted by the ordinance
codified in this Article. Any reference in the Internatioiéte Code or the appendices hereby
adopted regarding permit fees, inspection fees, grading s fdr certificates of occupancy, etc.,
shall be replaced by referencethe current fee schedule as adopted by the Board of the Brighton
Fire Protection District or the current fee schedule as adopted by the Board of the South Adams Fire
Protection District, as applicable, in lieu thereof. (Ord. 1467, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83,
2004)

Sec. 15-20-40. Substitution of particular terms.

(@) Whenever the terr@hief, Chief of Fire Department, Chief of Bureau of Fire Prevention,
Fire Prevention Bureau or Fire Prevention Engineer or similar title is used in the International Fire
Code, including the appendices thereto hereby adopted, theFteenChief of the Brighton Fire
Protection Digtrict or Fire Chief of the South Adams Fire Protection District, as applicable, shall be
inserted in lieu thereof, as appropriate.

(b) Whenever the termorporation counsel is used in the codes adopted hereby, it shall be held
to mean the City Attorney.

(c) Whenever the termmunicipality or jurisdiction is used in the codes adopted hereby, it shall
be held to mean the City, as represented by the City Coun@kuspecifically otherwise defined or
referred to herein or in such code.

(d) Whenever the termdministrator, manager, officer or similar title is used in the codes
adopted hereby, the ter@ity Manager of the City of Brighton or his or her duly authorized agents,
representatives, designees or appointees shall be inserted in lieu thereof. (Ord. 1424 81(part), 1992;
Ord. 1467, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)



Sec. 15-20-50. Specific amendments to code.
Chapter 1 — Administration
(@) Section 101.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to readassfoll

"101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Cotlee cCity of Brighton,
Colorado, hereinafter referred to as 'this Code."

(b) Section 102.3 of the International Fire Code is amended to readoagsfoll

"102.3 Change of use or occupancy. The provisions of the 2003 Inteahd&iglling Code
shall apply to all buildings undergoing a change of use or occupancy."”

(c) Section 102.4 of the International Fire Code is amended to reatbassfol

"102.4 Application of Building Code. The design and construction of newtstes shall
comply with the 2003 International Building Code. Repairs, alteratimsadditions to existing
structures shall comply with the 2003 International Building Code."

(d) Section 102.5 of the International Fire Code is amended to read asfollow

"102.5 Historic buildings. The construction, alteration, repair, e@faegt, restoration,
relocation or movement of existing buildings or structures tteatlesignated as historic buildings
when such buildings or structures do not contribute a distinctdhézdife or property shall be in
accordance with the provisions of the 2003 International Building Code."

(e) Section 102.6 of the International Fire Code is amended to readassfoll

"102.6 Referenced codes and standards. The codes and standards referendedda #tiall
be the most recent edition of those that are listed in Chapter 45, and such codesdandisstaall
be considered part of the requirements of this Code to the prescribed extent ofcbaeliesence.
Where differences occur between the provisions of this Code anefdrenced standards, the
provisions of this Code shall apply. Where this Code refers tiCthdelectric Code it means the
2002 National Electric Code."

(f) Section 102.7 of the International Fire Code is amended to readagsfoll

"102.7 Subjects not regulated by this Code. Where no applicable rslsimdaequirements
are set forth in this Code or are contained within other laades; regulations, ordinances or
bylaws adopted by the City, compliance with applicable stalsdaf the National Fire Protection
Association or other nationally recognized fire safety stalsdas approved, shall be deemed as
prima facie evidence of compliance with the intent of @isle. Nothing herein shall derogate
from or diminish the authority of the fire code official determine compliance with codes or
standards for those activities or installations within tbede official's jurisdiction or
responsibility."

(g) Section 103 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:



"Section 103 - Division of Fire and Life Safety"
(h) Section 103.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to readoagsfoll

"103.1 General. The Division of Fire and Life Safety is esthdtl under the direction of the
Fire Chief. The function of the Division shall be the impdeation, administration, and
enforcement of the provisions of this Code, within the corpdirates of the City, in consultation
or in connection with the Chief Building Official of the City."

() Section 103.2 of the International Fire Code is amended to readagsfoll

"103.2 Appointment. The Fire Chief is appointed by the BoarDifctors of the Greater
Brighton Fire Protection District, and shall serve as the fire codaaiffi

() Section 103.3 of the International Fire Code is amended to readagsioll

"103.3 Deputies. In accordance with the prescribed procedures of@hteiGBrighton Fire
Protection District, the Fire Chief shall have the autiidotappoint a deputy fire code official,
other related technical officers, inspectors and other employees."

(k) Section 103.4.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows

"103.4.1 Any suit instituted against any officer or employee ef @®reater Brighton Fire

Protection District because of a lawful act performed by éfiécer or employee in the lawful

discharge of his or her duties under the provisions of this Ceale e defended by the legal
representative of the Greater Brighton Fire Protectiorribigintil the final determination of the

proceedings. The fire code official or any subordinate shall not be l@ttedts in an action, suit

or proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the pavssof this Code; and any officer of the
Division of Fire and Life Safety, acting in good faith and withalice, shall be free from

liability for acts performed under any of its provisions or &gson of any act or omission in the
performance of official duties in connection therewith."

(D A new Section 105.1.4, Fees, of the International Fire Code is added ts fedldvas:

"105.1.4 Fees. The required fee for each Fire Code inspectiablegyior to the issuance of
a permit or certificate of occupancy shall be calculatentloerwise established by referringthe
current fee schedule as adopted by the Board of the Brighton Fire Protection District or the
current fee schedule as adopted by the Board of the South Adams Fire Protection District, as
applicable or as otherwise set forth in the current City of Brighton Esel&ion."

(m) Section 105.3.3 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as:follows

"105.3.3 Occupancy prohibited before approval. A building or strushak not be occupied
prior to the issuance of a certificate of occupancy by thé&digi Official of the City, nor shall
operations within or upon such premises be commenced prior tssience of an operational
permit, when required by the fire code official pursuant to this Code."

(n) Subsection 105.3.4 of the International Fire Code is repealed entirely.



(o) The first sentence in Section 105.3.6 of the InternationalGéde is amended to read as
follows:

"105.3.6 Compliance with code. The issuance or granting of a perithinahlbe construed to
be a permit for or a waiver or approval of any violation of any of the provisiohssafdde or any
other ordinance of the City."

(p) Section 105.4.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

"105.4.1 Submittals. Construction documents shall be submitted in(8)reets and in such
form and detail as required by the fire code official. Firetgution system construction
documents, including shop drawings, calculations, specificationsthed required information,
shall be reviewed and signed by a design professional cedsiedNICET Level Ill, as defined
by the National Institute for Certification in Engineering fieglogies, a NICET Level IV, or
Professional Engineer."

(q) Section 105.6 of the International Fire Code is amended to read asfollow

"105.6 Required operational permits. The fire code officiauitorized to issue operational
permits for the operations set forth in Sections 105.6.2, 105.6.4, 105.6.15, 105.6.17 (4, 6, 10),
105.6.21, 105.6.22, 105.6.24 (1), 105.6.27, 105.6.31, and 105.6.37 of this Code."

(r) Section 105.7.5 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows

"105.7.5 Flammable and combustible liquids. A permit is requoddstall, alter, remove,
abandon or otherwise dispose of a flammable or combustible liquid tank."

(s) Section 105.7.8 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as:follows

"105.7.8 LP-gas. A construction permit is required for instatlatf or modification to an
LP-gas system serving any but Group R-3 occupancies.”

(t) Section 109.2.3 of the International Fire Code is amended as follows:
"The word 'jurisdiction’ shall be replaced with 'City of Brighton'."
(u) Section 109.3 of the International Fire Code is amended to read asfollow

"109.3 Violations and penalties. Persons who violate a provisiathis Code or fail to
comply with any of the requirements hereof, or who shall erestall, alter, repair or do work in
violation of the approved construction documents or contrary to angtideeof the fire code
official or the terms and provisions of any permit or certificateadgpursuant to the provisions of
this Code shall be subject to the fines and penalty provisiotissoArticle, set forth in Section
15-20-70 of the Brighton Municipal Code. Each day that a violation contintezsiak notice has
been served shall be deemed a separate offense."

(v) Section 111.4 of the International Fire Code is amended to readaasstoll



"111.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work afténg been served
with a stop work order, except such work as that person is etir¢ot perform to remove a
violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject to fines and/or impment as set forth in this
Article."

Chapter 3 — General Precautions Against Fire

(a) Section 308.3.1.1 of the International Fire Code is amended bgdthieon of a new
exception and the renumbering of both exceptions as follows:

"EXCEPTIONS:
"1. One- and two-family dwellings.

"2. Where buildings, balconies and decks are protected by an autepratider system."
(b) Section 311.2.2 of the International Fire Code is amended by the deletiorentd¢iptions.
Chapter 5 — Fire Service Features
(a) Section 503.1.1 of the International Fire Code is amended by the deletixepti&n #3.
(b) Section 503.1.3 of the International Fire Code is repealed in its gntiret
(c) Subsection 503.2.1 of the International Fire Code is repealed in retyenti

Chapter 9 — Fire Protection Systems

(8) Section 903.2.7 of the International Fire Code is amended bylditea of the following
exception:

"EXCEPTIONS:

"An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance wittti&@e 903.3.1.1 shall be provided
throughout all Group R-2 occupancies that meet the FederaH&aging Act definition of senior
housing or housing for older persons."

(b) Section 903.3.1.1.1 of the International Fire Code is repealed in itsyentiret

(c) Section 903.6 of the International Fire Code is repealed in itetgnt

(d) Section 905.11 of the International Fire Code is repealed in itstgntire

(e) The first paragraph of Section 907.3 of the International Cage is amended to read as
follows:

"907.3 Where required — retroactive in existing buildings. An approatial, automatic or
manual and automatic fire alarm system shall be installexkisting buildings and structures in



accordance with Sections 907.3.1.2, 907.3.1.3 and 907.3.1.4. Where automatic sprinkler
protection is provided in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 and corinettted

building fire alarm system, automatic heat detection requiredhisy Section shall not be
required.”

() The following Sections of the International Fire Coderapealed in their entirety: 907.3.1,
907.3.1.1, 907.3.1.5, 907.3.1.6, 907.3.1.7 and 907.3.1.8

(g) Section 907.20 of the International Fire Code is amended to read asfollow

"907.20 Inspection, testing and maintenance. The maintenance dng settedules and

procedures for fire alarm and fire detection systems shati becordance with this Section and
NFPA 72."

(h) Section 907.20.2 of the International Fire Code is amended by tht#odedf the words
"Chapter 7 of" in the first sentence.

Chapter 23 — High-Piled Combustible Storage
(@) Section 2306.6 of the International Fire Code is amended to read asfollow
"2306.6 Building access. Fire apparatus access roads in ac@wdgmSection 503 shall be
provided within one hundred fifty (150) feet (45,720 mm) of all portiohthe exterior wall of
buildings used for high-piled storage."

Chapter 32 — Cryogenic Fluids

(@) The second paragraph of Section 3204.3.1.1 of the International ddeei€amended to
read as follows:

"Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary eowdrs outside of buildings is
prohibited within the corporate limits of the City."

Chapter 34 — Flammable and Combustible Liquids

(@) Section 3404.2.9.5.1 of the International Fire Code is amendeddaoasefollows and
includes the new exception:

"3404.2.9.5.1 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited. Stor@tessfi and I

liquids in above-ground storage tanks outside of buildings iskptet within the corporate limits
of the City.

"EXCEPTION: Storage tanks in service prior to January 1, 2004."

(b) Section 3406.2.4.4 of the International Fire Code is amended tagdalibws and includes
the new exception:



"3406.2.4.4 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited. The stofGgssf and |l
liquids in above-ground tanks is prohibited within the corporate limitiseo€ity."

"EXCEPTION: Storage tanks in service prior to January 1, 2004."
Chapter 38 — Liquefied Petroleum Gas

(@) Section 3804.2 of the International Fire Code is amended to sefaticavs, exception is
retained:

"3804.2 Maximum capacity within established limits. The agdesgapacity of any one (1)
installation within the corporate limits of the City shall reotceed a water capacity of two
thousand (2,000) gallons (7570 L)."

(Ord. 1424 §1(part), 1992; Ord. 1467, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 §3, 2004)
Sec. 15-20-55. Section 108 amended; Appeals process.
(&) Section 108 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:
"Section 108 — Appeals Taskforce."
(b) Section 108.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to read asfollow

"108.1 Appeals process established. In order to hear and decidesayfpmdiers, decisions or
determinations made by the fire code official relative toapglication and interpretation of this
Code, there shall be and is hereby created an Appeals TaskidreeAppeals Taskforce shall be
comprised of the fire chief, the chief building official thie City of Brighton, and five (5) other
individuals meeting the requirements of Section 108.3. Thetiief and building official shall
be ex officio advisory members of the Taskforce and shall haxauthority to vote on any matter
coming before the taskforce. The Appeals Taskforce may aglagpbnable rules of procedure for
conducting its business and shall render its decisions and firidimg#ing to the appellant. The
Appeals Taskforce shall conduct its business and proceedingsteahsvith the administrative
provisions and appeals procedures of Section 15-4-50 of the Brightonipéli@ode, which sets

forth the guidelines and procedures for the Board of Appeals undenttraedtional Building
Code."

(c) The last sentence of Section 108.2 of the InternationalCGode is amended to read as
follows:

"The Appeals Taskforce shall have no authority to waive the regemtsnof this Code."
(d) Section 108.3 of the International Fire Code is amended to read asfollow
"108.3 Qualifications. The Appeals Taskforce shall consistaesfibers who are qualified by

professional experience and training to pass on matters pegtatnhazards of fire, explosions,
hazardous conditions or fire protection systems, and except for theduals identified in



Section 108.1, such individuals shall not be employees of the CityedBiteater Brighton Fire
Protection District."

(Ord. 1814 83, 2004)
Sec. 15-20-60. Copies of code available for sale.

Copies of the International Fire Code are available fortsallbe public through the office of the
City Clerk, at a price equal to the cost to the Cityrd(Q467, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 8§83,
2004)

Sec. 15-20-70. Penalties and civil remedies.

(a) It shall be unlawful for any person to erect, construct, @alaiter, repair, move, improve,
remove, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any buildstgioture in the City, or
cause the same to be done, contrary to or in violation of anyegbrovisions of this Article, the
International Fire Code hereby adopted or any order issued by éh€liief or Fire Chief hereunder.
Any person violating any of said provisions or any such order shaltledeened guilty of a
misdemeanor, and each such person shall be deemed guilty of deseffarese for each and every
day or portion thereof during which any violation of such provisionsfsuch order is committed,
continued or permitted, and upon conviction of any such violation, such person shall be punehed by
fine of not more than five hundred dollars ($500.00) or by imprisonmemdiomore than ninety
(90) days, or by both such fine and imprisonment.

(b) In any case of a failure to comply with any requirementshaf Article or of the
International Fire Code hereby adopted, the City or any persocteaffdy such failure may, in
addition to the penalties provided by law, initiate a civilacfor injunction, mandamus, abatement
or any other appropriate relief to prevent, enjoin, abatapve or eliminate such violations.(Ord.
1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-20-75. Conflict with other codes.

If a dispute or conflict arises between the 2003 International@ade as adopted herein, and any
plumbing, mechanical, building, electrical, fire, or other unifoodecadopted by the State, then the
more stringent provisions of each respective code shall prevail. (Ord. 1814 §3, 2004)

ARTICLE 15-24
Moving of Structures
Sec. 15-24-10. Definitions.

Each definition used in this Article is as follows unless the contextwid®indicates:

(1) Building means a building, house or structure moved within the City.



(2) Mover means any person who desires to move a house, building or stinctieeCity.
(Ord. 898 83, 1976; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-24-20. Permit required.

It is unlawful for any person to move any building, house or strecver, upon, along or across
any public street in the City or from any site or to any wiithin the City without having first
obtained a written permit to do so from the Director of Publmrk&, provided, however, that the
ordinance codified in this Article shall apply only to those public stimets which the City exercises
exclusive jurisdiction; and, therefore, any such move throughCttye solely upon the streets or
highways that are a part of the State Highway System dfdteral Highway System are not subject
to the requirements of this Article. (Ord. 898 84, 1976; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-24-30. Contents of application.

Application for a permit required hereunder shall be made to treetbr of Public Works and
shall contain the following information:

(1) Name and address of the applicant;

(2) Location of the building, house or structure to be moved;

(3) Location of the proposed site to which the building, house or structarbesmoved;
(4) Date and time of the proposed move;

(5) Map or description of the route to be taken;

(6) Height, width and length of the building, house or structureetenbved and truck or
equipment to be used for moving the house, building or structure;

(7) Proof of insurance with an insurance company licensed to do ssism€olorado with
the following coverage and stipulations:

a. Bodily injury liability in the amount of: one hundred thousandad®l($100,000.00)
each person and three hundred thousand dollars ($300,000.00) aggregate,

b. Property damage liability in the amount of: twenty-fikeusand dollars ($25,000.00)
each occurrence and fifty thousand dollars ($50,000.00) aggregate, and

c. Such proof of insurance shall include all operations of theemownnected to or
regarding the house, building or structure to be moved and all vehicles invodvenht

(8) Certificate or statement that all legal requiremeaniposed by the Colorado Utilities
Commission, Interstate Commerce Commission and Colorado Sigksvay Department or
Colorado Department of Transportation ("CDOT") have been complied with;

(9) A performance bond as required by Section 15-24-80 of this Article; and



(10) A building permit for the site to which the building is to beved if such site is located
within the City. (Ord. 898 85, 1976; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-24-40. Permit term, contents, conditions.

(@) The moving permit shall be obtained prior to or at theestime as the building permit, and
the moving permit shall expire sixty (60) days from date of issuance.

(b) A moving permit shall specify the date and time in which ghgposed move may be
accomplished and shall also specify the route to be taken in cimme@th such move. The mover
shall have the permit in the vehicle during the progreghenimove and shall show the permit on
demand to any police officer or any authorized employee of tlye Gard. 898 86, 1976; Ord. 1814
83, 2004)

Sec. 15-24-50. Permit prerequisite to issuance.

If the building, house or structure proposed to be moved is to be located upon a sit€ity, tthe
Director of Public Works shall, prior to issuing the moving geprovided for herein, assure that the
requirements of this Article have been complied with and thatbthigling, house or structure
proposed to be moved shall be compatible in size, structure, age,avalugeneral architectural
design to the neighborhood to which the move is contemplated andshalé that the proposed use
is consistent with the zoning classification of the landbéoused for the relocation. (Ord. 898 87,
1976; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-24-60. Permit fee, application and inspection.

A twenty-five-dollar permit application fee shall be paidhagiach application for each building,
house or structure to be moved to any site within the Cityadtiition thereto, in the case of a
building being moved from a site outside the City limits, th ©f fifteen cents ($0.15) per mile
measured from the City limits of the City to the location he# building, house or structure to be
moved and return mileage to the City limits of the Chglkbe paid by the applicant to defray the
cost of inspection of the building, house or structure by thédiBgi Department. (Ord. 898 §8,
1976; Ord. 1814 83, 2004))

Sec. 15-24-70. Basis for fee.

Every applicant before being granted a moving permit shalbpgagrmit fee based upon the size
of the structure as follows:

(1) Structures other than residential and commercial:

a. Up to and including twelve-feet wide, twenty-four-feet longlhve-feet high — twenty-
five dollars ($25.00); and

b. More than twelve-feet wide or twenty-four-feet long orlwedeet high — fifty dollars
($50.00).



(2) Residential or commercial structures — one hundred fiftiardo{$150.00). (Ord. 898 §9,
1976; Ord. 1814 §3, 2004)

Sec. 15-24-80. Bond or security deposit required.

(@) The owner of the building, house or structure to be movetieombver shall, before a
permit is issued hereunder, in addition to all other remérgs of this Article, furnish and deliver to
the City a performance and completion bond in the sum of two thoasdiads ($2,000.00), issued
by a corporate surety conditioned upon the applicant's faithfdbrpgance of all ordinances,
regulations, conditions and requirements of the City and at thement of any building, house or
structure pursuant to the permit issued hereunder, shalitiaeith within sixty (60) days from the
issuance of the permit and that all necessary constructidefiaged herein shall be completed within
one hundred eighty (180) days from date of issuance of the moving permit.

(b) Necessary construction as defined herein means all foundation work, building, heating,
plumbing and electrical construction as required by the ordinarfdbe City and the state statutes
for construction of a new structure.

(c) In the alternative, the applicant may deposit two thoustatidrs ($2,000.00) by cash or
certified funds with the Director of Finance or provide otbecurity acceptable to the Director of
Finance rather than post a corporate surety bond upon the same comaditwagrovided for herein.
(Ord. 898 810, 1976; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-24-90. Mover to provide escort.

As a condition to issuance of the moving permit provided for hererDittector of Public Works
shall have the authority to require a mover to provide an escbe atdver's expense for the purpose
of regulating traffic along the route such house, building or streiégs to be moved. (Ord. 898 811,
1976; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-24-100. Parking along route prohibited.

The City Manager may prohibit parking for a period not in exoéssenty-four (24) hours along
the route designated for the house, building or structure to bedmonevided that such notice shall
be given not less than twenty-four (24) hours prior to the time ofmihee, and shall be given by
posting signs stating "No Parking — Tow Away Zone" betweenindntaurs. The Chief of Police is
empowered to move any vehicle parked in violation of the foregoirigngarestriction and charge
the cost of such move to the motor vehicle or its owner. (Ord. 898 §12, 1976; Ord. 1814 §3, 2004)

Sec. 15-24-110. Time limitation; extension.

Time of the movement shall be designated by the Director ofd™Ahkirks. Every such permit
shall become and be void unless such move shall be completed andiske tholding or structure
removed from the public right-of-way within the time spexdfion the application for such permit;
provided, however, that the Director of Public Works may exterah time when the moving of a
house, building or structure is rendered impracticable by rea$anslemency of weather, strikes or
other causes not within the control of the mover. (Ord. 898 8§13, 1976; Ord. 1814 §3, 2004)



Sec. 15-24-120. Warning devices required.

No person moving any house, building or structure over, upon, alongoassamy public street
shall fail, neglect or refuse to keep signal devices asrestjby the Director of Public Works at all
times at each corner of such house, building or structure and at the end ajjactygor thereof while
the same is located in or upon any public street. (Ord. 898 8§14, 1976; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-24-130. Utility notification and service disconnection; cgst

(a) Before any house, building or structure shall be moved pursuamis Article, the mover
shall give written notice to the public utilities or agencies aftebtethe proposed move.

(b) Prior to issuance of a moving permit, the power tolatitec service lines shall be shut off
and all lines cut or disconnected outside the property line arghslwater, steam, sewer or other
service lines shall be shut off and capped outside the building line or curb, ®naithtransmission
line as directed by the Director of Utilities.

(c) All costs of water or sewer connection and/or tapping shall be paid tbe lapplicant or his
or her authorized agent. (Ord. 898 8§15, 1976; Ord. 1814 8§83, 2004)

Sec. 15-24-140. Damage,; liability for repair.

() Itis the duty of any person so moving any house, building or steustaler the provisions
of this Article to forthwith repair any damage done to anyveadle alley, street, tree, utility poles,
wires or other property, and failure to do so shall constitute a violationsdAtticle.

(b) Whenever any such person moving any house, building or structurethegeovisions of
this Article is not the owner of the vehicle making the madke owner of the load, as well as the
owner of the vehicle and the person operating the same, shallntlg goid severally liable and
responsible for compliance with the requirements of thisckerti (Ord. 898 8§16, 1976; Ord. 1814 83,
2004)

Sec. 15-24-150. Clearing of vacated site.

In the event the building, house or structure is to be removed from a site tv@hCity, the owner
of the site and/or the mover shall ensure that the vacatktingusite is cleaned and cleared of any
and all debris and material and that all holes and irregelsudtn the site which constitute an unsafe,
unhealthy or dangerous condition are eliminated. (Ord. 898 8§16, 1976; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-24-160. Inspection and compliance required; occupancy permit.

Upon relocation of any building, house or structure within the @y,owner of such building,
house or structure shall request the Director of Public Worksat@ an inspection. No occupancy
permit shall be issued until full compliance is obtained withhadlrequirements of the City. (Ord.
898 8§16, 1976; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 8§83, 2004)



ARTICLE 15-28
International Residential Code
Sec. 15-28-10. Code adopted; purpose.

(@) There is hereby adopted by the City the 200& national Residential Code, published by
the International Code Council, Inc., 5203 Leesburg Pike, Suite 708,CGfairch, VA 22041-3401.
The 2003 International Residential Code, including all appendicestdhés hereby adopted as a
primary code by reference and incorporated into this Code.

(b) The purpose of the code is to provide a just, equitable anticptamethod to be cumulative
with and in addition to, any other remedy provided by the provisionki©fChapter, or otherwise
available at law, whereby buildings or structures which fieomy cause endanger the life, limb,
health, morals, property, safety or welfare of the generalgabtheir occupants, may be required to
be repaired, vacated or demolished. The purpose of the codeascneate or otherwise establish or
designate any particular class or group of persons who wilhauld be especially protected or
benefited by the terms of the code, but rather, for the purpopeowiding requirements for the
protection of life and limb, property, safety and welfare ofdbeeral public and the owners and
occupants of residential buildings within the City. (Ord. 1423 81)(pE992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord.
1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-28-15. Nonliability.

The adoption of the code by this Article shall not createdarty to any person with regard to the
enforcement or nonenforcement of this Article or said code pé¥son shall have any civil liability
remedy against the City or its officers, employees or agentsny damage arising out of or in any
way connected with the adoption, enforcement or nonenforcementsoftticle or said code.
Nothing in this Article or in said code shall be construed toteraay liability, or to waive any of the
immunities, limitations of liability or other provisions of t&overnmental Immunity Act, Section
24-10-101 et seq., C.R.S., or to waive any immunities or limitatiorigbility otherwise available to
the City, its officers, employees or agents. (Ord. 1423 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1589, 19812 §3,
2004)

Sec. 15-28-20. Availability of copy of code.

At least one (1) copy of the 2003 International Residential Code, as adopted, esiothi office
of the City Clerk and may be inspected during regular business.hdan addition, copies are
available for sale to the public at a price not to ex¢kedtost thereof to the City. Not less than one
(1) copy of said code has been and is now filed in the offickeo€City Clerk, and from the date on
which this Article shall take effect, the provisions of tiernational Residential Code shall be
controlling within the corporate limits of the City. (Ord. 1423 rt), 1992; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord.
1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-28-30. Deletions and substitutions; fees.

Anything contained in the International Residential Code that is maw leereafter inconsistent
with other specific ordinances of the City, is deleted and not adbptetk ordinance codified in this



Article. Any reference in the International Residential Codehe appendices hereby adopted
regarding permit fees, inspection fees, grading fees,féee=rtificates of occupancy, etc., shall be
replaced by reference to the phrésecurrent City of Brighton Fee Resolution, in lieu thereof. (Ord.
1423 §1(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 &3, 2004)

Sec. 15-28-40. Substitution of particular terms.

Whenever the terrBuilding Official or other similar title is used in the International Residénti
Code, the terntChief Building Official of the City of Brighton or his or her duly authorized agents,
representatives, designees or appointees shall be inserted in lieu thereof. (Ord. 1423 81(part), 1992;
Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 8§83, 2004)

Sec. 15-28-50. Specific amendments to code.
(@) Section R308.4 of the International Residential Code is deleted.
(b) Section R309.2 of the International Residential Code is amended to felidves

"309.2 Separation required. The garage shall be separated froesittence and its attic area
by not less thafk inch Type X gypsum board applied to the garage side adjacdre tmbitable
space.”

(c) Section R311.4.1 of the International Residential Code is amended asriedidws:

"311.4.1 Exit door required. Not less than one exit door conforminggdsection shall be
provided for each dwelling unit. The required exit door shall profadalirect access from the
habitable portions of the dwelling to the exterior without reqggiriravel through a garage.
Access to habitable levels not having an exit in accordanbethig Section shall be by a ramp in
accordance with Section R311.6 or a stairway in accordance ggtios R311.5. Any residence
greater than 1,000 square feet requires two exits."

(d) Section R311.4.3 of the International Residential Code is amended t@ feddves:

"311.4.3 Landings at doors. There shall be a floor or landing on edlofseach exterior
door. The floor or landing at the exit door required by Section R311.4.1 shall not btharode5
inches (38 mm) lower than the top of the threshold. The floomaiirlg at exterior doors other
than the exit door required by Section R311.4.1 shall not be requiredniplyc with this
requirement but shall have a rise no greater than that permittectionS@811.5.3.

"EXCEPTION:

"The landing at an exterior doorway shall not be more than 7% iftB6smm) below the
top of the threshold, provided that the door, other than an exstdon or screen door,
does not swing over the landing.

"The width of each landing shall not be less than the dowederEvery landing shall have a
minimum dimension of 36 inches (914 mm) measured in the direction of travel."



(e) Section R311.6 of the International Residential Code is deleted. (Ord. 1814 83, 2004)
Sec. 15-28-55. Appeals process; Board of Appeals.

In order to provide for final interpretation of the provisionstioé code and to hear appeals
therefrom, the Board of Appeals, appointed and organized pursuadbption of the International
Building Code by the City in Article 15-4 of this Chapter, is deatgd as the Board of Appeals for
purposes of the code, and the administrative and appeal procedunesiyaahd responsibilities set
forth in the International Building Code shall be applicable arldvi@d in the administration of this
code. (Ord. 1051 83, 1980; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-28-60. Copies of code available for sale.

Copies of the International Residential Code are availablgaferto the public through the office
of the City Clerk at a price equal to the cost to the Qi@rd. 1423 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995;
Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 §3, 2004)

Sec. 15-28-70. Penalties and civil remedies.

(@) It shall be unlawful for any person to erect, construct, gmlaiter, repair, move, improve,
remove, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any buildgtgioture in the City, or
cause the same to be done, contrary to, or in violation of fathe@rovisions of this Article, the
International Residential Code or any order issued by the BuildifigaDhereunder. Any person
violating any of said provisions or any such order shall be degmitd of a misdemeanor, and each
such person shall be deemed guilty of a separate offensecfoiard every day or portion thereof
during which any violation of such provisions or of such order is atteui continued or permitted
and, upon conviction of any such violation, such person shall be punistzefingyof not more than
five hundred dollars ($500.00) or by imprisonment for not more than nin@jyd¢ds, or by both
such fine and imprisonment.

(b) In any case of a failure to comply with any requirementshaf Article or of the
International Residential Code hereby adopted, the City or any person affestathbgilure may, in
addition to the penalties provided by law, initiate a civilacfor injunction, mandamus, abatement
or any other appropriate relief to prevent, enjoin, abate, remoeéminate such violations. (Ord.
1423 §1(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 &3, 2004)

Sec. 15-28-75. Conflict with other codes.
If a dispute or conflict arises between the Internationaideatial Code as adopted herein, and

any plumbing, mechanical, building, electrical, fire or other codetaddyy the State, then the more
stringent provisions of each respective code shall prevail. (Ord. 1814 §3, 2004)



ARTICLE 15-32
International Mechanical Code
Sec. 15-32-10. Adopted; purpose.

(@) The 2003nternational Mechanical Code, including all appendices thereto, published by the
International Code Council, Inc., is hereby adopted by the Cityeteyance as a primary code and
incorporated into this Code. A copy of this primary code is lenirii the office of the City Clerk.
The 2003 International Mechanical code is published by the IntenafdtCode Council, Inc., 5203
Leesburg Pike, Suite 708, Falls Church, VA 22041-3401.

(b) The purpose of this code is not to create or otherwise ishtal designate any particular
class or group of persons who will or should be especially gisnteor benefited by the terms of the
code. The purpose of this code is to provide minimum standardsetguaad life, limb, health,
property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the destgnstruction, installation,
quality of materials, location, operation and maintenance or useatihdpeventilating, cooling and
refrigeration systems, incinerators and other miscellanesatspnoducing appliances within the City.
(Ord. 1425 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1814 8§83, 2004)

Sec. 15-32-15. Nonliability.

The adoption of the code by this Article shall not create anytduany person with regard to the
enforcement or nonenforcement of this Article or said codepé¥son shall have any civil liability
remedy against the City or its officers, employees or agémt any damage arising out of or in any
way connected with the adoption, enforcement or nonenforcementsofAtticle or said code.
Nothing in this Article or said code shall be construed &ater any liability or to waive any of the
immunities, limitations of liability or other provisions of t&overnmental Immunity Act, Section
24-10-101 et seq., C.R.S., or to waive any immunities or limitationislboility otherwise available to
the City or its officers, employees or agents. (Ord. 1425 8)(A&%92; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814
83, 2004)

Sec. 15-32-20. Availability of copy of code.

At least one (1) copy of the International Mechanical Codedagpted, is on file in the office of
the City Clerk and may be inspected during regular business.htuddition, copies are available
for sale and distribution to the public at a price not to exteedost thereof to the City. Not less
than one (1) copy of the International Mechanical Code has Inekis @mow on file in the office of
the City Clerk, and from the effective date of the ordinamseraling this Article, the provisions of
said code shall be controlling within the corporate limitthefCity. (Ord. 1425 81(part), 1992; Ord.
1464, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 8§83, 2004)

Sec. 15-32-30. Deletions and substitutions; fees.

Anything contained in the International Mechanical Code that is mow loereafter inconsistent
with other specific ordinances of the City is deleted andadopted by the ordinance codified in this
Article. Any reference in the International Mechanical Cadethe appendices hereby adopted
regarding permit fees, inspection fees, grading fees,féeartificates of occupancy, etc., shall be



replaced by specific reference to the phriamecurrent City of Brighton Fee Resolution, in lieu
thereof. (Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-32-40. Substitution of particular terms.

Whenever the terrBuilding Official is used in the International Mechanical Code, the teniaf
Building Official of the City of Brighton or his or her duly authorized agents, representatives,
designees or appointees shall be inserted in lieu thereof. (Ord. 1425 §1(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995
Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-32-50. Specific amendments to code.
Subsection 306.6 of the International Mechanical Code is amended to rebhoves fo

"306.6 Sloped roofs. Where appliances are installed on a roof havshgpe of 3 units
vertical in 12 units horizontal (25-percent slope) or greated having an edge more than 30
inches (762 mm) above grade at such edge, a level platforhbshalovided on each side of the
appliance to which access is required by the manufacturerdlatisth instructions for service,
repair or maintenance. The platform shall not be less thamcB@s (762 mm) in any dimension
and shall be provided with guards in accordance with Section 304.10.

"EXCEPTION:
"This subsection shall not apply to residential roofs."
(Ord. 1814 83, 2004)
Sec. 15-32-55. Appeals process; Board of Appeals.

In order to provide for final interpretation of the provisionstiedé code and to hear appeals
therefrom, the Board of Appeals, appointed and organized pursuadbption of the International
Building Code by the City in Article 15-4 of this Chapter, is deated as the Board of Appeals for
purposes of the code, and the administrative and appeal procedunesiyaahd responsibilities set
forth in the International Building Code shall be applicable arldvi@d in the administration of this
code. (Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-32-60. Copies of code available for sale.

Copies of the International Mechanical Code are availabledier to the public by the office of
the City Clerk at a price equal to the cost to the Cityrd(@425 8§1(part), 1992; Ord. 1464, 1995;
Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 §3, 2004)

Sec. 15-32-70. Penalties and civil remedies.

(@) It shall be unlawful for any person to erect, construct, galaiter, repair, move, improve,
remove, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any buildstguoture in the City, or
cause the same to be done, contrary to or in violation of artyegbrovisions of this Article, the
International Mechanical Code hereby adopted or any order issueithebyBuilding Official



hereunder. Any person violating any of said provisions or anyaulen shall be deemed guilty of a
misdemeanor and each such person shall be deemed guilty of aeseffarate for each and every

day or portion thereof during which any violation of such provisiansf such order is committed,
continued or permitted, and upon conviction of any such violation, such person shall be punished by a
fine of not more than five hundred dollars ($500.00) or by imprisonmemidiomore than ninety

(90) days, or by both such fine and imprisonment.

(b) In any case of a failure to comply with any requirementshaf Article or of the
International Mechanical Code, the City or any person affecteddbyfailure may, in addition to the
penalties provided by law, initiate a civil action forungtion, mandamus, abatement or any other
appropriate relief to prevent, enjoin, abate, remove or elimswie violations. (Ord. 1425 81(part),
1992; Ord. 1464, 1995; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-32-75. Conflict with other codes.

If a dispute or conflict arises between the 2003 Internatigieghanical Code as adopted herein,
and any plumbing, mechanical, building, electrical, fire or othee @ubbpted by the State, then the
more stringent provisions of each respective code shall prevail. (Ord. 18140438, 20

ARTICLE 15-36
International Plumbing Code
Sec. 15-36-10. Adopted; purpose.

There is hereby adopted by the City thieernational Plumbing Code, 2003 edition, including all
appendices and standards thereto, promulgated by the International Codel, Aoancs203
Leesburg Pike, Suite 708, Falls Church, VA 22041-3401, save and except such amendanerststas
forth herein, and subject to the conflict of law provisions ofdtdnance codified in this Article.
The purpose of this Article is to provide minimum requirememd standards regarding plumbing
systems for the protection of the public health, safety and neeléand not to create or otherwise
establish or designate any particular class or group of perseoswill or should be especially
protected or benefited by the terms of the code. This ArBcéelopted for the purpose of providing
minimum standards to safeguard life, limb, health, property and puldifare by regulating
plumbing methods, services and materials within the City. (Ord. 12g&8), 1992; Ord. 1508
81(part), 1997; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-36-15. Nonliability.

The adoption of the code by this Article shall not create anytduany person with regard to the
enforcement or nonenforcement of this Article or said codepé¥son shall have any civil liability
remedy against the City or its officers, employees or agémt any damage arising out of or in any
way connected with the adoption, enforcement or nonenforcemenitsoftticle or said code.
Nothing in this Article or in said code shall be construedréate any liability, to waive any of the
immunities, limitations of liability or other provisions of tki&overnmental Immunity Act, Section
24-10-101 et seq., C.R.S., or to waive any immunities or limitatiorisboility otherwise available to



the City or its officers, employees or agents. (Ord. 1426 8)(d£®2; Ord. 1508 8§1(part), 1997,
Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-36-20. Availability of copy of code.

At least one (1) copy of the International Plumbing Code as adopted, incthdiagpendices and
standards herein adopted, is on file in the office of the City Clerk and maypleetied during regular
business hours. The provisions of the International Plumbing CGutithea appendices and standards
hereby adopted shall be controlling within the corporate ligfitee City from the date on which this
Article shall take effect. (Ord. 1426 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1508&81) 1997; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord.
1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-36-25. Deletions and substitutions; fees.

Anything contained in the International Plumbing Code, those appendaresotiereby adopted
and the standards hereby adopted, which is now or is hereafter gtennhswvith other specific
ordinances of this City, is deleted and not adopted by the ordiraodified in this Article. Any
reference in the International Plumbing Code or the appendicdsy/latepted regarding permit fees,
inspection fees, grading fees, fees for certificates afpancy, etc., shall be replaced by reference to
the phrasehe current City of Brighton Fee Resolution, in lieu thereof. (Ord. 1426 81(part), 1992;
Ord. 1508 81(part), 1997; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-36-30. Substitution of particular terms.

Whenever the terrBuilding Official is used in the International Plumbing Code or the appendices
thereto hereby adopted, the te@hief Building Official of the City of Brighton or his or her duly
authorized representatives, designees or appointees shall be inserted in lieu thereof. The
administrative authority as defined herein mean<Cthief Building Official of the City of Brighton or
his or her duly authorized agents, representatives, designees or appointees, and shall be the authority
authorized to enforce this Code. (Ord. 1814 8§83, 2004)

Sec. 15-36-35. Appeals process; Board of Appeals.

In order to provide for final interpretation of the provisiasfsthis code and to hear appeals
therefrom, the Board of Appeals, appointed and organized pursuadoption of the International
Building Code by the City in Article 15-4 of this Chapter, is deated as the Board of Appeals for
purposes of this plumbing code, and the administrative and appeal pesceduthority and
responsibilities set forth in the International Building Coddl 4b& applicable and followed in the
administration of this code. (Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-36-40. Cross-connection control program.
The International Plumbing Code is amended to read as follows:

"Cross-Connection Control Program established.

"(a) Administration.



"(1) General. The Administrative Au-thority will operateceoss-connection control
program, including the keeping of necessary records, which fuflfilsrequirements of the
State of Colorado Department of Health and Environment, Waterit@uiVvision and
Sections 24-4-104, 24-4-105, 25-1-107, 25-1-108, 25-1-109 and 25-1-114, C.R.S. (1973 as
amended).

"(2) Scope. The Administrative Authority and/or UtilityrBctor shall be responsible for
reasonable protection of all public potable water distributiotesys private water distribution
systems having more than one (1) service connection, and plunyisiegns presenting a risk
to the public from contamination or pollution due to the backflow or tmpkonage of
contaminants into such systems from fixtures on the premises. prbvisions of this Code
shall apply to both new and existing water services and plumbingnsyswvithin the City.
Water services located outside the City boundaries which are atedni® the City potable
water system will be subject to the cross-connection controlagis contained in this Code.

"(3) Program to begin in 1996. Beginning in 1996, the Administradivthority will
conduct a survey of existing water services in conjunctioh imitial premises inspections to
determine the nature of existing or potential hazards. Initialsfeall be on high hazard
industrial and commercial water premises followed by thosenises presenting a lower
hazard.

"(4) Degree of hazard. The City recognizes the thretiid@ublic potable water supply
system arising from cross-connections. All threats will lasstfied by degree of hazard and
will require the installation of an approved backflow preveirtiea location approved by the
Administrative Authority.

"a. High hazard. Cross-connections that present a threator@&mination (see
definition for contamination) are considered to be high hazard. Identification of specific
high hazard water services will be conducted during initial gesnsurvey and inspection
to begin in 1993.

"b. Low hazard. Cross-connections that present a threatlofipol(see definition for
pollution) are considered to be low hazard.

"(5) Appeals. Appeals by the owner from decisions of the Adtmatige Authority
relative to the administrative provisions of this Code maybeainade to the Board of Appeals.
All appeals must be directed to the State of Colorado Depattai Health and Environment,
Water Quality Division.

"Note: Since federal and state laws supersede locailatemns, appeals from such
regulations must be made to the appropriate authority, in this case, thefSiatorado.

"(b) Definitions.

"(1) Administrative Authority. The Administrative Authority is the Chief Building @fial
of the City or his or her designee.



"(2) Approved means accepted or acceptable under an applicable specificattandard
stated or cited in this Code, or accepted as suitabledqgortyposed use under procedures and
authority of the Administrative Authority.

"(3) Backflow. Backflow is the flow of water or other liquids, mixtur@ssubstances into
the distributing pipes of a potable supply of water from any seustiger than its intended
source (see definitions for back siphonage and back-pressikffolaimn Section 103 of this
Code).

"(4) Backflow prevention device. A backflow prevention device is a device approved by
the Administrative Authority which will prevent pollution or tlkentamination of a potable
water supply.

"(5) Certified backflow assembly tester. A certified backflow assembly tester is a person
who has shown competence to test and maintain backflow preventiooesiela the
satisfaction of the Administrative Authority and the StateCoforado Department of Health
and Environment, Water Quality Division.

"(6) Containment. A method used to isolate a water service from the potabter supply
by the installation of an approved backflow prevention device so tlyahazards that may
exist on the customer's side of the device are 'contained' Withioustomer's water piping
system, thus the term ‘containment.’

"(7) Contamination. An impairment of the potable water which creates an actaaldh&o
the public health through the spread of disease by sewage, onipgiy industrial or
commercial fluids, solids, gases or waste. Also defined as highdhazar

"(8) Cross-connection. A cross-connection is any connection or amamg, physical or
otherwise, between a potable water supply system and any plunikimge for any tank,
receptacle, equipment or device through which it may be possiblacigpotable, used,
unclean, polluted and contaminated water or other substances tontmtany part of such
potable water system under any condition.

"(9) Fixtureisolation. A method of backflow prevention in which a backflow preveister
located to prevent contamination through a cross-connection withimwner's building or
premises plumbing system as opposed to containment which doeddnegsaany hazards to
the owner's plumbing system but protects the potable water supply system.

"(10) High hazard threat. Cross-connections classified by the Administrative Authority
which present a threat of contamination (see definition for ountdion) are considered to be
high hazard.

"(11) Low hazard threat. Cross-connections that present a threat of pollution (see
definition for pollution) are considered to be low hazard.

"(12) Owner. Any person who has legal title to or license to operaiahabit, or in any
manner has control of a property upon which a cross-connection may bet pitetbe time of
adoption of this Code or any time hereafter.



"(13) Pollution. An impairment of the quality of the potable water to a degtdeh does
not create a hazard to the public health but which does advarsglynreasonably affect the
aesthetic qualities of such potable waters for domestic use, as whendpeithteontoxic dye,
sugar, etc. Also defined as low hazard.

"(14) Potable water. Potable water is water which is satisfactory for drinkinginary and
domestic purposes and meets requirements of the health authonity haigdiction.

"(15) Premises. The property of the owner, including all buildings, grounds and equipment
which are located within the property boundaries. This includesasér service lines up to
the City right-of-way.

"(16) Water service. That point in the owner's water system beyond the sanatyot of
the City of Brighton Utilities Department or other water sigipdf more than two (2) taps; the
outlet end of the water meter, and always before any unprotected waiee seanch.

"(c) New services. Authority to connect.

"(1) Written approval required. Water service connectiamsnEw services may not be
made until approval to connect is given by the Administrative Aitthor writing after all
backflow prevention devices have been tested by a certifiedl®ackssembly tester and
approved.

"(2) Temporary service connection. Temporary connectionsetqtiblic potable water
supply to test water piping and fixtures will be allowed only wiiennew water piping is first
flushed out properly and there exists no unprotected cross-connegitbins the plumbing
system. Discovery of cross-connections during constructionb@itause for termination of
construction water service until the cross-connection is eélinated or protected by an
approved backflow prevention device.

"(3) Disinfection and approval of water mains. To complyhw@ity of Brighton Utility
Department regulations, water mains and all water piping @pstod the water meter must be
disinfected and flushed, and must receive Tri-County Health Depat's inspection and
written approval before being placed into service and accepted by yhe Cit

"(4) Meter location. All water meter locations and speatfons are subject to Utility
Department construction specifications.

"(d) Grounds for discontinuance of water service.

"(1) Unprotected cross-connectionsAll water services found by the Administrative
Authority to have unprotected cross-connections and whose owners fefuse to eliminate
or protect such cross-connections with an approved backflow pi@velevice within the time
specified by the Administrative Authority will be subject tovimg their water service
discontinued.

"(2) Failure to allow inspections. Every owner having a plumbing systaohydue to the
nature of activities on the premises or in the building, inditaae a hazard to the public



potable water supply may exist, shall allow his or her memito be inspected by the
Administrative Authority to determine whether cross-connectionfact, do exist. Failure on
the part of any owner to allow the Administrative Authoriyirispect his or her premises for
possible cross-connections will be grounds for discontinuance of his oatearsgrvice.

"(3) Failure to comply with notice and order. Failure, refasahability on the part of any
owner to install any backflow prevention device or devices witténtime specified by any
notice and order received from the Administrative Authorityllsbanstitute grounds for
discontinuing water service to the premises. If the seridcdiscontinued, the owner must
comply with the notice and order, call for inspection and pay rectinondees, as appropriate,
before service will be resumed.

"(4) Emergencies. When contamination of any potable water singglyoccurred, the
Administrative Authority and/or Utility Director is authorizéd disconnect immediately any
water service from which contamination is emanating.

"(e) Unauthorized water taps. Water service through any unagtiowvater tap is subject to
immediate discontinuance. When it is found that any watentgtace for fire-fighting purposes
is being used for any purpose other than fire-fighting operationslotihestic water supply to the
owner's premises will be subject to discontinuance untiliraiuthorized uses of the fire service
water tap are disconnected and reinspected by the Administrative Aythori

"Additional water meters may be required by the Administrafiughority as a condition for
continued water service whenever an unauthorized tap is discovered.

"(f) Certified backflow assembly testers.

"(1) List of licensed testers. The Administrative Authordhall have on file a list of
private contractors who are certified by the State to sshflow prevention devices and who
are licensed contractors in the City.

"(2) Cause for revocation of license. Refusal, neglectiloréaon the part of any certified
backflow assembly tester to comply with the City's licensegylations or this Code shall be
grounds for revocation of that contractor's license and City listing.

"(g) Containment of water services.

"(1) Hazardous water services and plumbing systems. Alllphgrsystems and/or water
services considered by the Administrative Authority to presdrdzard to the City's potable
water supply or premises plumbing system shall be contained tsjllintgs an approved
backflow prevention device at all service connections to the rsvpeemises and at each
cross-connection found within the premises plumbing system asedifegtthe Administrative
Authority.

"(2) Compliance notice given. The Administrative Authoritilé give notice in writing to
any owner whose plumbing system has been found to present a hazardptuadoly water
supply. The notice and order shall state that the owner muatl iastapproved backflow
prevention device at each service connection to the owner'sspent contain the water



service and/or install an approved backflow prevention devicelesices at all cross-
connections within the owner's plumbing system. The notice and oitlspecify the type
and location of each backflow prevention device required, and will give aetdén by which
the owner must comply with the order.

"(3) High hazard water services and plumbing systems. ngatgices and/or plumbing
systems presenting the most severe hazard to the publib hélabe given the shortest time
period in which to comply. Any water service and/or plumbing systensidered to present a
severe hazard to the public health and whose contamination appd@rsmminent must be
contained immediately and the hazard eliminated.

"For high hazard water services, the Administrative Authorigy rallow up to ten (10) days
from the date of the first premises inspection when the inspeveals a high hazard cross-
connection on the owner's premises.

"(4) Low hazard water services and plumbing systems. Ownexsisiing water services
and/or plumbing systems classified as presenting a low hadlirde allowed one hundred
eighty (180) days from the date of the first premises inspeittiamich to comply with orders
given by the Administrative Authority. Failure to eliminatdow cross-connection within the
time specified will be cause for termination of water service.

"At any time a low hazard classification is changed byAtministrative Authority to a high
hazard classification because of new information receivedwrcireumstances encountered,
the hazard must be eliminated within ten (10) days of being declared a hegtl.haz

"(h) Alternative to containment; low hazard water services.

"(1) Fixture isolation; low hazard. For low hazard cross-connectinrigu of containing
the owner's water service, the owner may choose to isolatesd-connections on his or her
premises with approved backflow prevention devices. If the osmawses this alternative to
containment, annual or semiannual inspection by the AdministratitleoAity and annual or
semiannual testing of each required device by a certified loaclkissembly tester will be
required at no expense to the City.

"(2) Fixture isolation; high hazard. All existing and futhigh hazard water services must
be contained by installing approved backflow prevention devicé® aervice entrance and at
all cross-connections within the plumbing system.

"(iy Compliance deadlines; final notice.

"(1) Final notices. If any owner refuses, neglects or faitsomply with a notice and order
received by the Administrative Authority within the time gfied in the order, a final notice
will be sent by certified mail to the owner and the Coloradpditenent of Health and
Environment, Water Quality Division. The final notice wilfeeence the original notice and
order, and will state that if compliance is not reached within ten (10) dalys oédeipt of such
final notice, water service to the owner's premises will be disagdin



"(2) Extenuating circumstances. If the owner informs the Atstative Authority of
extenuating circumstances as to why a deadline for compliance tcenonet, the
Administrative Authority in consultation with the Ultilities lector or his or her designee may
grant extensions of up to thirty (30) days for high hazard watgicges, and sixty (60) days for
low hazard water services. An extension of time so gramigg be revoked at any time a
water service or plumbing system becomes contaminated, atyifikedy to be contaminated,
in which case the water service will be discontinued immediately.

"(3) Utilities department notified. Whenever a notice @ntsto any owner by the
Administrative Authority stating that water service toe tlowner's property will be
discontinued, a copy of such notice will be forwarded to the Uslibgector and City Clerk.
The Utilities Director will then take the appropriatdi@a to protect the City's public potable
water supply.

"(j)) Protection of occupants in buildings or on premises.

"(1) Building/premises inspections. Buildings or premisé@si which potable water is
used to mix hazardous chemicals or any occupancy with cross-connéetibrsbuilding or
on the premises presenting a potential hazard to the pbbhéth shall be subject to
reinspection by the Administrative Authority.

"(2) List of buildings/premises. Beginning in 1993, a lisboildings and/or premises will
be developed systematically based upon criteria supplied fror@dlegado Department of
Health and Environment, Water Quality Division, and water billiegords. All buildings
and/or premises identified as potentially hazardous to public sailétye sent a notice stating
that an inspection of their premises will be required.

"(3) Compliance deadline. Any cross-connections discovered by sséction or known
to the owner shall be eliminated or protected with an apdrbaekflow prevention device in
accordance with the provisions of Section 1003 of this Code.

"(k) Owner's responsibilities.

"(1) Eliminate cross-connections. The owner shall be respeniiblthe elimination or
protection of all cross-connections on his or her premises aleités or her building. The
owner shall maintain his or her premises or building free famg unprotected cross-
connections as a condition for containing water service.

"(2) Have devices tested. The owner, after having been informedtiiigdenail from the
Administrative Authority to do so, shall install, maintain andéhgested any and all required
backflow preventers on his or her premises. Owners of newcagrvequiring cross-
connection control devices as a condition for a building permit bhatt such devices tested
by a certified cross-connection assembly tester before beingrizethto receive service from
the City or water provider, and at least annually thereaffesting and maintenance of all
required cross-connection control devices shall be a condition for cowgtavater service.



"(3) Maintain devices. The owner shall cause to be cmueany malfunction of any
required backflow prevention device which is revealed by periediang or visual observance
of any malfunction by any person.

"(4) Notify administrative authority of cross-connections. Tvener shall inform the
Administrative Authority of any proposed or modified cross-connectionsof any existing
cross-connections of which the owner is aware but have not been fotimel Agiministrative
Authority.

"(5) Protect service bypasses. The owner shall not lirsstaypass around any backflow
preventer unless there is a backflow preventer of the $gmeon the bypass. Owners who
cannot shut down operations for testing of the devices mustys@ullitional devices
necessary to allow testing to take place so that at no thimeotable water supply to the
service connection is left unprotected.

"(6) Licensed plumbers to install devices. The owner sfalke to be installed only
backflow prevention devices which are first approved by the Adtnative Authority through
the issuance of a permit. In all but owner-occupied singléyfaswellings, only licensed
plumbers will be allowed to install backflow preventers.

"(7) Identify potable water piping. The owner shall identifypaitable water piping on his
or her premises in a manner that will clearly distinguish potahter piping from nonpotable
water piping. The direction of flow must be identified on the piping.

"(8) Private wells or source of water. Any owner havingrigate well or other private
water source must have on file with the Administrative Autiiopermits for all required
backflow prevention devices, and a well permit from the Statéotorado when the well or
source is cross-connected to the City potable water supply system. Rermassoss-connect
may be denied by the Administrative Authority for operational,ewatesthetic reasons or
safety reasons even if the owner proposes to install a bacgfievention device to isolate the
private well.

"The owner may be required to install a backflow prevention deatithe service entrance if a
private water source is maintained on the premises, ewv iprivate water source is not
cross-connected to the City's potable water supply system, aotlaery potable water supply
system serving two (2) or more taps.

"(9) Owner to pay for testing fees. The owner shall payfesls for annual or more
frequently required backflow prevention device testing,etesting in case the device fails to
operate correctly."

(Ord. 1426 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1508 §1(part), 1997; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)
Sec. 15-36-45.  No license required.

Contractors holding a valid City Class "A," "B," "C," "B "P" contractor's license may install
water supply and waste drainage lines located between then@ihs and three (3) feet from the



foundation of residential buildings without a plumber's licen§€¥d.(1426 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1508
§1(part), 1997; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-36-50. Copies of code available for sale.

Copies of the International Plumbing Code, including appendices hexdbgted and the
standards hereby adopted, are available for distributiona@dacsthe public by the office of the City
Clerk at a price per copy equal to the cost to the Cityd.(0426 81(part), 1992; Ord. 1508 81(part),
1997; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-36-55. Penalties and civil remedies.

(@) It shall be unlawful for any person to violate any of thevigions of this Article, the
International Plumbing Code, including all appendices thereto hexdbgted, or the installation
standards hereby adopted, to fail to comply with any order madsutitiar, to construct in violation
of any statement or plan submitted and approved thereunder oredificate or permit issued
thereunder, or to fail to comply with such order as affirmed or fieodby the Administrative
Authority of the City. Any person violating any of said provisiongny such order shall be deemed
guilty of a misdemeanor, and each such person shall be deemgdfailseparate offense for each
and every day or portion thereof during which any violation of suokigions or of such order is
committed, continued or permitted and, upon conviction of any such violatich person shall be
punished by a fine of not more than five hundred dollars ($500.00) endrnjsonment for not more
than ninety (90) days, or by both such fine and imprisonment.

(b) In any case of a failure to comply with any requirementshef Article or of the
International Plumbing Code, including all appendices thereto hexgdbgted, or the installation
standards adopted hereby, the City or any person affected byaslurk fmay, in addition to the
penalties provided by law, initiate a civil action forungtion, mandamus, abatement or any other
appropriate relief to prevent, enjoin, abate, remove or elimmate violations. (Ord. 1426 81(part),
1992; Ord. 1508 §1(part), 1997; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 &3, 2004)

Sec. 15-36-65. Conflict with other codes.

If a dispute or conflict arises between the International Plumbode as adopted herein, and any
plumbing, mechanical, building, electrical, fire or other code adoptethe State, then the more
stringent provisions of each respective code shall prevail. (Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

ARTICLE 15-42
Energy Efficiency Code for Nonresidential Buildings
Sec. 15-42-10. Code adopted; purpose.

There is adopted by the City tk®lorado Model Energy Efficiency Construction and Renovation

Sandards for Nonresidential Buildings, Second Edition, including standards set forth in Section 7

thereof, Figures 1 through 7 inclusive, and Tables 6-1A through 6-8sime] and all 1979
amendments thereto as referred to in Energy Memo No. 5 by floe ©f Energy Conservation of



the State, promulgated in November 1977, by the Board of EnergyieBéfjic Nonresidential
Building Standards which was appointed by the State of Coloraidectér of State Planning and
Budgeting. These standards shall be referred to in this Adicthe "code." Such code is adopted
for the purpose of achieving effective utilization of eneligy new, nonresidential building
construction within the City. (Ord. 1050 81, 1980; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-42-20. Provisions effective when and copy available where.

(@) Not less than one (1) copy of the code adopted by this Antcldoeen and now is filed in
the office of the City Clerk, and from the date on which this Article shall fdetgethe provisions of
the code in this Article adopted, including the standards, figurdgables adopted in this Article,
shall be controlling within the City limits.

(b) Copies of the code adopted in this Article are avaiffabldistribution and sale to the public
by the office of the City Clerk, at a price per copy edaahe cost to the City. (Ord. 976 §1(part),
1978; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-42-30. Amendments.

The Colorado Model Energy Efficiency Construction and Renovat®tandards for
Nonresidential Buildings is amended as follows: Section 103.@leentiScope" is amended by
adding thereto the following:

"This Code furthermore sets forth minimum requirements for ts@guleand construction of
outdoor heated swimming pools in the City."

(Ord. 976 81(part), 1978; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)
Sec. 15-42-40. Appeal procedures.

In order to provide for final interpretation of the provisionstioé code and to hear appeals
therefrom, the Board of Appeals, appointed and organized pursuant t@adighe Building Code
by the City in Article 15-4 of this Chapter, is designatechasBoard of Appeals for purposes of this
code, and the administrative and appeal procedures authority guhgigdities set forth in the
Building Code shall be applicable and followed in the administratf this code. (Ord. 1050 §2,
1980; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-42-50. Penalties and civil remedies.

(@) It is unlawful for any person to erect, construct, @aamlter, repair, move, improve,
remove, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any buildstgioture in the City, or
cause the same to be done contrary to or in violation of ang girtivisions of the code. Any person
violating any of the provisions of the code shall be deemety ik violation and each such person
shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each and daseyr portion thereof during which
any violation of any of the provisions of the Code is committed,irmeet] or permitted and upon
conviction of any such violation, such person shall be punished by affinet more than five
hundred dollars ($500.00) or by imprisonment for not more than ni@8)ydays, or by both such
fine and imprisonment.



(b) In any case of a failure to comply with any requiremefitthis Article, the City or any
person affected by such failure may, in addition to the penalties provided byiteate ia civil action
for injunction, mandamus, abatement or any other appropriate meppeétent, enjoin, abate, remove
or eliminate such violation of this code. (Ord. 1050 83, 1980; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

ARTICLE 15-46

Energy Conservation Performance Code for New Construction and
Renovation of Residential Buildings

Sec. 15-46-10. Code adopted; purpose

There is hereby adopted by the City tkmlorado Recommended Energy Conservation
Performance Code for New Construction and Renovation of Residential Buildings, Second Edition,
including standards set forth in Appendix A and B of the Model Eneffigiency Construction and
Renovation Standards for Residential Buildings, and all 1979 anesmsras referred to in Energy
Efficiency Construction and Renovation Standards for ResidentialdiBgd, and all 1979
amendments as referred to in Energy Memo No. 5 by the OffiE@arfgy Conservation of the State,
adopted by the Colorado State Housing Board in November 197 7oasmeaded by the Residential
Energy Conservation Code Advisory Committee. These standzatide referred to herein as the
"code." Such code is adopted for the purpose of achieviegtige utilization of energy in new
residential building construction within the City. (Ord. 1051 81, 1980; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-46-20. Provisions effective when and copy available where.

(&) Not less than one (1) copy of the code adopted by this Antsldoeen and now is filed in
the office of the City Clerk and from the date on which thische shall take effect, the provisions of
the code adopted in this Article, including the standards, figuresabieb adopted in this Article,
shall be controlling within the corporate limits of the City.

(b) Copies of the code adopted in this Article are avaiffaldistribution and sale to the public
by the office of the City Clerk, at a price per copy edaahe cost to the City. (Ord. 977 81(part),
1978; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-46-30. Amendments.

The Energy Conservation Performance Code for New Construction awodd®ien of Residential
Buildings is hereby amended as follows:

(1) Section 103.0(b) entitled "Scope" is amended by adding thereto the following:
"This Code furthermore sets forth minimum requirements fod#sign and construction in
total or portions thereof, or additions thereto of those hotelslsnahd apartment buildings

that are over three (3) stories in height."

(2) Attachment F entitled "Insulation Standards" is hereby atl¢ige said code to read as
follows:



"Minimum insulation standards for residential buildings are as follows

"1. Insulation having a minimum R-value of eleven (11) shall kel uis all exterior
walls, and floors contiguous to any unheated areas above grade.

"2. Insulation having a minimum R-value of thirty (30) shall beduiseall exterior
ceilings contiguous to any heated areas above grade.

"3. All windows above grade shall be double glazed. This includgsbasement
windows with more than eight hundred (800) square inches of area.

"4. All exterior doors or door leading to any unheated areas lshalleather stripped.
All sliding glass doors shall be double glazed.

"5. All heat ducts penetrating unheated areas shall be wrapgeahsutation with a R-
value of a minimum of seven (7)."

(Ord. 1051 82, 1980; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)
Sec. 15-46-40. Appeal procedures.

In order to provide for final interpretation of the provisionstivé code and to hear appeals
therefrom, the Board of Appeals, appointed and organized pursuadoption of the International
Building Code by the City in Article 15-4 of this Chapter, is deated as the Board of Appeals for
purposes of this code, and the administrative and appeal procelutesity and responsibilities set
forth in the International Building Code shall be applicable arldvi@d in the administration of this
code. (Ord. 1051 83, 1980; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-46-50. Penalties and civil remedies.

(@) It is unlawful for any person to erect, construct, gaamlter, repair, move, improve,
remove, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any buildgtgioture in the City, or
cause the same to be done, contrary to or in violation of artyegbrovisions of the code hereby
adopted. Any person violating any of the provisions of the codelshdikemed guilty of a violation
and each such person shall be deemed guilty of a separate dffieaaeh and every day or portion
thereof during which any violation of any of the provisions @&f tode is committed, continued or
permitted and, upon conviction of any such violation, such personkghplinished by a fine of not
more than five hundred dollars ($500.00) or by imprisonment for not morenthety (90) days, or
by both such fine and imprisonment.

(b) In any case of a failure to comply with any requirementthis Article, the City or any
person affected by such failure may, in addition to the penalties provided by l&te iaitivil action
for injunction, mandamus, abatement or any other appropriateteefeévent, enjoin, abate, remove
or eliminate such violation of this Article. (Ord. 1051 84, 1986{.A589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83,
2004)



ARTICLE 15-50
Uniform Building Security Code

Sec. 15-50-10. Code adopted; purpose.

There is hereby adopted by the City thmiform Building Security Code, 1982 Edition,
promulgated by the International Conference of Building Officedse and except such amendments
as are hereinafter set forth in Section 15-50-30. Such Coddojstea to establish minimum
standards to make dwelling units resistant to unlawfulyantthe City. (Ord. 1202 81(part), 1986;
Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-50-20. Provisions effective when and copy available where.

(&) Not less than one (1) copy of the Uniform Building Security Code adopteechgrs15-50-
10, has been and now is filed in the office of the City Clerk, and from the date on whictitlaaos
codified in this Article takes effect, the provisions of theiform Building Security Code shall be
controlling within the limits of the City.

(b) Copies of the Uniform Building Security Code as adoptechisyArticle, are available for
distribution and sale to the public in the office of the City Clerk at a prjcel to the cost to the City.
(Ord. 1202 81(part), 1986; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 8§83, 2004)

Sec. 15-50-30. Amendments.

The Uniform Building Security Code is amended and changed in the iofjosespects, and
adopted herein as amended and changed. Section 4106 of the UnifécdmgB8ecurity Code is
amended by adding thereto the following:

"(e) Solid core exterior wood doors. All exterior wood doors shallof a solid core
construction with a minimum thickness of 1% inches or, if with Euileé panels shall not be less
than nine-sixteenths/(s) of an inch thick.

"(f) Metal flush bolts. The inactive leaf of double doors lshal equipped with metal flush
bolts having a minimum embedment of five-eighti$ ¢f an inch into the head and threshold or
top and bottom door frame.

"(g) Exterior door windows. Windows in exterior doors or withintyfa@0) inches of any
locking mechanism shall be of a fully tempered glass or other breakarggjlass."

(Ord. 1202 §1(part), 1986; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 §3, 2004)

Sec. 15-50-40. Board of Appeals.

In order to provide for final interpretation of the provisions of the code and to yesatla relative
to the implementation and enforcement of the code, the Board of Apestalslished for the
International Building Code, as adopted in Article 15-4 of this Graphall hear all appeals relative
to the Uniform Building Security Code as hereby adopted, and thaniaegion, procedures and



authority as adopted for the Board of Appeals in conjunction witinteenational Building Code are
applicable to the Uniform Building Security Code hereby adoptedd. (202 §1(part), 1986; Ord.
1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)

Sec. 15-50-50. Violation; penalty and civil remedies.

(@) It is unlawful for any person to erect, construct, gaamlter, repair, move, improve,
remove, convert or demolish, equip, use, occupy or maintain any buildirtiguctuse in the City
contrary to or in violation of any of the provisions of this Adjcthe Uniform Building Security
Code, including amendments thereto, or any order issued by the Citggktahereunder. Any
person violating any of such provisions shall be deemed guilty séparate offense for each and
every day or portion thereof during which any violation of any of quavisions is committed,
continued or permitted, and upon conviction of any such violation, such person shall be punished by a
fine of not more than five hundred dollars ($500.00) or by imprisonmemdiomore than ninety
(90) days, or by both such fine and imprisonment.

(b) In any case of a failure to comply with any requirementhisefArticle or of the Uniform
Building Security Code, including amendments thereto as herebyeaddpe City or any person
affected by such failure may, in addition to the penalties prowgedw, initiate a civil action for
injunction, mandamus, abatement or any other appropriate reliefvenprenjoin, abate, remove or
eliminate such violation. (Ord. 1202 81(part), 1986; Ord. 1589, 1999; Ord. 1814 83, 2004)



