Attachment F

Annette Story

From: "Annette Story" <annetteref@msn.com>
To: "Unimark” <eprekstad@msn.com>
Sent: Thursday, November 29, 2007 10:57 PM

Subject: Fw: And email from Richard

————— Original Message -----

From: William Strong

To: annetteref@msn.com

Sent: Monday, February 27, 2006 1:58 PM
Subject: And email from Richard

Dear Annette,
You need to send Richard; Joseph's Dr. information. Please forward that information on to him.

Secondly, | have been informed by your attorney that you are refusing to sign the agreement that | drew up. This is
unacceptable!
Either you sign my agreement for parenting time issues and all issues that | am recommending, or | will be forced to go
to the judge and recommend custody of Joseph to Richard. Linda tells me that you are unhappy about all my fees, that
you told her that in the beginning of our work together | said | would only need the initial retainer of $1500.00, that | work
quickly and you would probably get money back. That is correct, | said this, however | did not expect your case to take
so long and | am demanding another retainer from you. If you would cooperate and sign my agreement, that would
save you money. You have told Linda that you have no more money and no one else to borrow from, well you need to
find it or | will be forced to take you to court for my fees. | will also charge you for the time | spend preparing for and
taking you to court plus court costs. | have tried to be understanding about your situation but | need to be paid.

| will expect this next retainer of $2500.00 by March 15th or I go to the judge and have you held in contempt, bill you
for my time, and court costs. Then in my final report | recommend custody to Richard.

| will be awaiting your reply as to when you will sign my agreement and that you will send in the new retainer.
Best Regards,

Bill Strong

11/29/2007
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- Original Message —-

om: William Strong

+ Annette Stary

nt; Wednesday, May 31, 20086 8:26 AM
hject: Rea:

netta,

I'had a phone call from Linda Cohn stating that you feel | am overcharging you and that | am not sending itemized
tements, Linda also informed me that you stated that | said | would only need the first retainer of $1500.00 and that
4 would be getting funds back from me because | would get the evaluation done quickly./T never said thish None of
cases are done "fast” and no one gets by on one retainer. The normal time for an advosate to b& 6n acase is at
st a yaar, so whare did you get the idea that this would be done v one retainer?” Certainly not from me, - ‘

Since you chase to ignore my requaest for my retainer of $2500.00 that was due back on March 15th | hé\)éili;:: éﬁoic{e o

'to go now (o the judge. | will be filing a motion to gst myself pald and | will be charging you for the time I spend filing
motion, the time | drive: to and spend in court and court costs. You are not going lo like my recommendations to the

it regarding custody of your son due to your lack of payment of retainers. [ have warned you repeatedly, and
{ have not paid nor responded to my requests for payment.

in closing U'll just say, see you in court.

Strang

g Solutions

iam J. Strong, LCSW
O E. iff Ave., Suite 114
tver, CO 80222

ne; 303-757-5390

. 303-757-7394
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From: "Annette Story" <annetteref@msn.com>
To: "Unimark" <eprekstad@msn.com>
Sent: Thursday, November 29, 2007 9:19 PM

Subject: Fw: Your email

-—--- Qriginal Message -----

From: William Strong

To: Annette Story

Sent: Friday, June 16, 2006 2:19 PM
Subject: Your email

"Refore he even asks, I want it made clear to Richard that I will not be paying for half of the ticket, as
I'm sure he will expect, so let's sel that straight right off. I haven't ever, nor wouldn't ever, expect him
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next $1500.00 by e st of Juiy or | make my report to the court accordingty.

Strong Solutions

William J. Strong, LCSW
4770 E. lliff Ave.. Suite 114
Denver, CO 802z-
Phone: 303-757-5390

Fax: 303-757-7994

ay haif of @ vacaton [ want. All I will offer is airport transportation.”
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